Bl erew v wer

This i1s a digitally signed Gazette, to verity click here.
http://rajpatrahimachal.nic.in

o194, feATae uaer

R <Yl ST I gRT UahIfed

dRAR, 10 3, 2025 /20 o, 1947

fRaree UeY AR

fewmare uowr faum= | afarera

faqip, 28 AT, 2025

e fodo—faum—feRs / 1—113 / 2025 —RFmae y<er faum= aar @1 ufshar uq
AT Haell, 1973 & 9140 @ Sr=Fid ®3AT & da9 IR war  (fRAraa uew) wened

09—NTSTUS / 2025—10—04—2025 (623)



624 ST, fRATeeT Yo, 10 31V, 2025 /20 I5, 1947

faerT®, 2025 (2025 @7 fA8g® A&=i® 8) S MWl faid 28 #AME, 2025 B fEAMEe Uqe fdem
JAT H GRIONUT B Dbl 8, FAAEIRT Bl Fard 9= H Jiad w1 gg UNT fHar mam 2|

FXARIRT / —
(FreTarer)

f20 wo faum= v |

2025 &1 faO8T® GEais 8.
A @ 99 iR W (Reraer uxwn) Heied faer®, 2025
QUe & HH

ferag A9H |

gRT 3 BT FINA |

gRT 4 BT GiaRATI |

gRT 7 BT T |

&RT 10 BT Y |

gRT 14— AR 14— BT AT |

I o o

2025 & faerTs WP 8.
A3 @ 909 R W (Rerae wew) deneE fadas, 2025
(foems o % gReenfid w7 )

A @ 9a9 iR W (Rvrae wew) 3ifafam, 2000 (2000 &7 A F&id 11) &7 IR
HRE B B forg faer® |

TR TIRST & OgaRd a9 # s uewr foum wwr grr fo=faRea w9 & I8
srfaferafad gr—

1. <ferq AM—s iffm &1 ferd W A5 & 999 &R W (RErere e 9
arferferm, 2025 21

2. ORI 3 & GUEE—AGR & a9 iR war (fRarae wewn) «ifafam, 2000 (R s+
S LA e AMRTIH PET AT 2) DI GRT 3 H—

(@) SUIRT (1) & % R frafalad @r S, srerfd—

“(1) v A= frEfaRed <1 OR 9d9 o1 @1 8HeR BN, SfIfq—

(@) =0 71 TP o UEE BOIR ®UY HferHm;



ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 625

JrefTa— .

(@) e Tl qa‘aEGﬂ'\’WBlﬁﬂW;

(M) I 7= RMT 89R Uy ufoA s, @ik
(&) ST Hq=0 IR BOIR BUT YT | 3R
(@) STERT (1—-%) & uean FrfeRad sraxenfid fear S, sierid—

“(1—) A3 BT 9q9 IR ARAFTIH, 1961 B €RT 40 & WG & TUS

(V) & o SUERT AT ERWIT Fadbie & AR W TFF AU, 2030 A
YRS §U YD UIF Nl & UEI dQIAT SIQT | |

ORI 4 & URRAIT.—d A9 & gRT 4 & RF R F=faRad @r g,

“4, AXPR Yd.—TAH T U oI T BTN OUd AT T <X F AchN T
U B BT 8haR BET|" |

ORI 7 & HARA.—T JRATH & aRT 7 H—

(@) STIRT (1) H—

i) IR IG IR TG B WH W BE NG SIS |

(i) Jod WP d WF W FHTIREd WRd @1 ST, 3did—

‘IR SR BRI @ TS AST BT I IRAAD AHR W HT B fheg
gfa fharier IR T $9 ¥ IFIEd Tl B8 ag By &l 3ffdddd
AT & WIaR 81T | iR

(iii) fad WRae ¥ IR dRg ¥R AR & W[ R B8 oG 3R A&
\_rlTQ.ﬁ; Sﬁ?

(@) SUERT (2) § Ui BOIR” WG] & F W U9 oIR 9@ & S |

&RT 10 HT ANY—H IJMMAFRA BT gRT 10 BT A fHar e |

HRT 14—F AR 14—F BT FTRIUT—RT 14 & Tarq AfoRad sid-wenfua faar
STTQATT, 3ferid—

“14—%. Q@ &I A BT A@NR—Yd T T <U—VI I ITH FW & Ja &
JTIMN bl BhQIN BT |

14—, a1 Yf9eT 7 9o SR 9xl—-Iar ufue], S &% W 9d4, A iR ygfaemd
YTaT BR P THaR BRI Gl §9 AT & FEf IRBR & Did-ic T4 Bl 3
gl




626 IST93, fRHTeeT U<en, 10 o¥ie, 2025 /20 <3, 1947

WREHRU—T IRT b YAIoT & forg =1 ufauer” |, faegmT 997 &7 9 Sl dod93
IRBR & Ufgel § Adifeid GRS Y& diel fduell g1 &1 a1 8 SR 59 fur=ayr seger
ERT UG =T & ®©U & qr=gdl e &I T3 2, IfIud 2 |

2) g JfRfH & JA9F dfede d=0 o ARmeq Sudfa & R, [ar ufaue
fedTere yeer @1 AU |9 & e & WU A dad, W SR ggfaumell & wu H R T @

UTd B DT 8haR dAal g | |

Jeedl SR BRON BT B
fafe =g # duar 9 gfg & SR AGET & 999 IR war (RAmaa u<wn) smafem,

2000 ¥ YN HRAT AMALAH AH AT B |

Te ot Sujed See A O @ forg |

(gafdw e gag)
gy 74 |

=g sma=

e & Sugwll @ IS uffd feu SM 9 ISRy IR OTIHIT T HRIS BUT Bl
JffaRad 3Madl < Jadferd 81T, T, RTAewT Sd A T8l ST ST Fahall & |

IRA & AU & I 207 B A Iogured i FRAwTRe
(WIS 50 SI0V0SI010(6)—2 / 2025)

fRATde Ua¥ & oauTd, fedrad ucel #@ER @& Ja9 iR vl (RAraa u<en) aeme
eI, 2025 @1 ATIaR] & IR H JT (BT A & T IR & AAEE & g 207 B
3N foergd &1 faum | § R o iR 39 W fIaR & & ey axad 2




IIoTu=, fRamae US9n, 10 3, 2025 /20 o, 1947 627
H#3E @ 9a9 iR War (BHrae uewn) | fada®, 2025

A3l @ 9d9 IR Wl (fRAraa uewn) S, 2000 (2000 &7 MR A&gid 11) &1
3R e B B v faere |

(Fafd R gog)
g 74 |

AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT
Bill No. 8 of 2025.

THE SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES OF MINISTERS (HIMACHAL PRADESH)
AMENDMENT BILL, 2025

ARRANGEMENT OF CLAUSES
Clauses:

Short title.

Amendment of section 3.
Substitution of section 4.
Amendment of section 7.

Omission of section 10.

Insertion of sections 14-A and 14-B.

Sk =

Bill No. 8 of 2025.

THE SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES OF MINISTERS (HIMACHAL PRADESH)
AMENDMENT BILL, 2025

(AS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY)
A

BILL



628 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

further to amend the Salaries and Allowances of Ministers (Himachal Pradesh) Act, 2000
(Act No. 11 of 2000).

BEit enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-sixth Year of
the Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short title—This Act may be called the Salaries and Allowances of Ministers
(Himachal Pradesh) Amendment Act, 2025.

2. Amendment of section 3.—In section 3 of the Salaries and Allowances of Ministers
(Himachal Pradesh) Act, 2000 (hereinafter referred to as the “principal Act”), —

(a) for sub-section (1), the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1) Each Minister shall be entitled to receive a salary at the following rates,
namely:—

(a) Chief Minister One lakh fifteen thousand rupees
per mensem;

(b) Cabinet Minister  Ninety five thousand rupees per
mensem,;

(c) Minister of State  Ninety three thousand rupees per
mensem; and

(d) Deputy Minister  Eighty thousand rupees per
mensem.”; and

(b) for sub-section (2), the following shall be substituted, namely:—
"(2) The salary of a Minister shall be increased after every five years commencing

from 1* April, 2030 on the basis of Cost Inflation Index provided under clause (v) of
Explanation to section 40 of the Income Tax Act, 1961.".

3. Substitution of section 4.—For section 4 of the principal Act, the following shall be

substituted, namely:—

“4, Sumptuary Allowance.—Each Ministers shall be entitled to receive sumptuary
allowance at the rate of rupees one lakh fifty thousand per mensem.”.

4. Amendment of section 7.—In section 7 of the principal Act,—
(a) in sub-section (1),—

(1) for the words “four lac rupees”, the words “six lakh rupees” shall be substituted;

(i1) for the first proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely:—

“Provided that the expenses of journey by taxi shall be on actual basis but per
kilometer charges shall not exceed more than twenty five rupees and shall be
within the maximum limit of six lakh rupees:”; and



ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 629

(iii) in the second proviso, for the words “four lac rupees” the words “six lakh
rupees” shall be substituted; and

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “twenty five thousand”, the words “fifty thousand”
shall be substituted.

5. Omission of section 10.—Section 10 of the principal Act shall be omitted.

6. Insertion of sections 14-A and 14-B.—After section 14 of the principal Act, the
following shall be inserted, namely:—

"14-A. Residence to Ex-Chief Minister.—The Ex-Chief Minister shall be entitled
for an accommodation of Type-VI category or above.

14-B. Salary and allowances to Leader of Opposition.—(1) The Leader of
Opposition shall be entitled to receive salary, allowances and benefits as admissible to
a Cabinet Minister of the Government under this Act.

Explanation.—For the purpose of this section, "Leader of Opposition" means a
Member of the Legislative Assembly, who is, for the time being, the Leader of the
party in opposition to the Government having the greatest numerical strength and
recognised as such by the Speaker of the Legislative Assembly.

(2) The Leader of Opposition shall not be entitled to receive any sum by way of

salary, allowances and benefits, as a Member of the Legislative Assembly of Himachal
Pradesh except what is specifically provided to a Cabinet Minister under this Act.".

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Due to sharp increase in the cost of living, it has been considered necessary to amend the
provisions of the Salaries and Allowances of Ministers (Himachal Pradesh) Act, 2000.

This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.
(SUKHVINDER SINGH SUKHU)
Chief Minister.

SHIMLA
The March, 2025.

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

Provisions of the Bill when enacted will involve an additional recurring expenditure of
approximately two crores on the State Exchequer, however, the exact amount cannot be quantified.



630 ST, fRATeeT Yo, 10 31V, 2025 /20 I5, 1947
MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

-Nil-
RECOMMENDATIONS OF THE GOVERNOR UNDER ARTICLE 207
OF THE CONSTITUTION OF INDIA
[File No. GAD-C-D(6)-2/2025]
The Governor of Himachal Pradesh, having been informed of the subject matter of the
Salaries and Allowances of Ministers (Himachal Pradesh) Amendment Bill, 2025 recommends

under article 207 of the Constitution of India, the introduction and consideration of the Bill in the
Legislative Assembly.

THE SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES OF MINISTERS (HIMACHAL PRADESH)
AMENDMENT BILL, 2025

A
BILL
further to amend the Salaries and Allowances of Ministers (Himachal Pradesh) Act, 2000

(Act No. 11 of 2000).

(SUKHVINDER SINGH SUKHU)
Chief Minister.

(SHARAD KUMAR LAGWAL)
Pr. Secretary (Law).

SHIMLA:
The ,2025.

fewmare uowr faum= | afarera
foeid, 28 A4, 2025

e faodo—faum—faeRs / 1—113 / 2025 —fAmae U<er faum= a9r @ ufshar vd &
Farer HTaell, 1973 @ fIH—140 @ =TT feATae Uee fume 9w (Fewil @ Wil 8 Ue)



ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 631

Teee faerTd, 2025 (2025 &1 faggds Heid 9) S Mol fRATG 28 A, 2025 &7 BHrde U9
foum |1 # QR 81 gaT ©, AIHERY $ gaaed eud § gfad dR gg UiNa e
ST 2 |

FEIRT / —
(arerTe)

fRowo faem Hﬂm

2025 &1 faErIs F=i® 9
Romae wewr Ry 9 (Wil & W) SR UYHE) §9meE fIRRe, 2025
Uel BT HH

;

fere A |

&RT 3 BT TN |
&RT 4 BT FTEA |
ORI 4—F BT FiCRATIA |
gRT 5 BT FARATIA |
gRT 5—&h BT Y |
&RT 6 BT FIT |
&RT 6—h BT T |
9. URT 6—F BT FII |
10. &IRT 6= T T <Y |

© N oA WDN =~

2025 &7 fa¥as A&did 9
fRATEe gew fou |1 (Sl @ w1 QiR Ue) e fadees, 2025
(femr =1 # qReeenfia wu #)

ferarad gew a9 (WSl @ W iR M) orfdfeeE, 1971 (1971 @1 iffam
A= 8) BT 3R A B b IV faere® |

YR TORY & OsaRd a¥ § fRamd uewr foum wwr gry fa=feilRad w0 & I8
sfrfafaa -

1. A TH——s3 T o1 wfera am fRamaa uew fAue aw (el & iR
) ened fferE, 2025 R |

2. YR 3 & HAEHA——RArae uer foum 991 (el & w1 iR o) srferferam, 1971
(R 389 9 Tarq "o ARIH" HET AT &) B ORT 3 H—




632 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

(@) 'R & Nde H “Jav AR ufTHdd T’ &l & WHF R 9™ & dad”

(@) SUERT (1) H—

(i) “TgUq BOIR Yl & WIE WR TR BRI W SIG; 3R

(ii) “3iR U@ BOIR ¥UY &I & A YRTHIcAD vl el Bl oAig fhar S,
(1) SUERT (1—%) & ggarq FfeRad I@T S, Jdid—

"(2) ST BT I IMIDR JAATIH, 1961 D IRT 40 b LB & TS (V)
@ AU IUERT AN ERBIN GADID & MR TR YA 31, 2030 |
U™ gU UAeh UTE gu1 & TN GQIAT ST | |

3. ORI 4 & WUEA—d AR & gRT 4 3 SWRT (1) & @ (i) 4 TP TR
3me Al TRl & I WR Gl E9R Ui Al ¥ R/ ST |

4, URI 4—T BT YRR~ ARRE & g1 4—@ & RF R Ffeied @
ST, JAAT—

"4—g. fAareq &3 iR By T —(1) TS I B Udh o 9 89 $IY
P R ¥ fafae &= war @ dea fhar Sem |

2) TP IS BT T BOIR BUY UHN DI <X A BT 9T ded fhar
ST | |

5. YRI5 &1 UfaRUA—Hqa JfRFTH & arT 5 & 9 R AefeiRad war S,
refTa—

“5. & GlAUW—Aaw 9T &1 4o & WM R RIFeh &= R W G i &1
BhaR BN Sl URT 7 & = gl grr fafed faar sl |

6. RT 5—F BT AU——He AT & aRT 5 ST A fHar g |
7. ORI 6 P AARA— SMAFIH BT ORT 6 H—

(@) STIRT (1) H—

(i) "TR g IR AR B WE W "B A IR R IG S |

e
[l

(i) g e & e R frafoRad @ s, srerfa—

"IRG S §RT I BT FI ARAS AR W BN g Ui fhatiex
TR U] ®™UT 9 Hfh 9o B8 oG BUU &l Iifhdd WAl & YR
BT, 3R



ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 633

@) SWER 2) ¥ IA6 95’ B U IMPERe R @ SR
g TG fhT U &R "“U=dig 8oIR” ¥ea] & F IR I
BOIR' 96 X IV |

8. HRI 6—% BT HIM.——Hal AT B aRT 6— H—

(@) "< G IR TG & WM W A IRg IY Ieq G ST |
(@) Yo s & I W FEfRad AT SIe, Jefia—

"IRg <ol ERT AT B FI ARG MIR W BT fobeg Ui fheimiiey uWR
T UV W JARE 9o diF oI ®9U & Iffhdd WHEr & ¥ia) s8R |7 3R

M e Rge 4 "< dRg SR TG & WF R AT dRF IR e W
TG |

9. ORI 6~ BT WYA——q A9 @7 arT 6—7 H—

(@) SUIRT (1) H %0 36,000" Tl AR (B & WM W "IN 89R ST I W
ST |
(@) SUERT (1) & ggarq efaRad idwenfua fhar Se, srerfa—

"(1—%) AR BT Id9 IMMISR ARTIH, 1961 DI ORI 40 b WG & TUS

(V) & 319 IUEfd aNTd JERWI adid & YR TR Yo e, 2030 |
YRS §U YD UIF Nl & UEI IQIAT SITQT | |

10. ©RT 6— T BT AY—RT 6~ T BT o1 fhaT ST |

Tl R BRI BT BUT

fae =g & doa 9 3G & IR ZAed yew AU 991 (@Rl @ W IR UeE)
AFTIH, 1971 § TN HRAT JMAAS THST TAT B |

g fodgs Sugad Seedl @ gfid @ fog 2|

(gafdw e gag)
g 74 |



634 ST, fRATeeT Yo, 10 31V, 2025 /20 I5, 1947
ENIRESICE

faerae & Syl &7 JAIHT fhy T9 I I ISRy UR IMfARET ofacd g o T
I PRIS A I99 BRIg Aqdferd B8R AAMY S ATA &l ST Sl Fhell 2 |

ygrforg fam g s
_QFH_

IRA & AU & I 207 B A Iogurel i FRwTRe
(WIS 510 SHOTOSI0.......... 4l0g0—10—S10 2025)

ffAae U @ ruuTd, fRAmed uew, fRArae uew faum 9 (Wl @ W @R UeE)
Hemed faerIe, 2025 @1 favgasg & 9N # GfId fh 9 & T Rd & 6o &
207 @ A [9ed 3 g™ 991 § R -4 IR 89 W AR &9 & eI w-d
g |

fRATae uew fou a1 (Sl & w1 iR Ue) e fadee, 2025

fearae Uyl fous | (el & W< 3iR Uem) otfife, 1971 (1971 &1 SfRIfEH
AR 8) BT SR FIMEF BT & fory e |

(gafdw e gag)
g 74 |

AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT
Bill No. 9 of 2025.

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (ALLOWANCES AND
PENSION OF MEMBERS) AMENDMENT BILL, 2025

ARRANGEMENT OF CLAUSES



ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 635

Clauses:

1. Short title.

2. Amendment of section 3.

3. Amendment of section 4.

4. Substitution of section 4-B.
5. Substitution of section 5.

6. Omission of section 5-A.

7. Amendment of section 6.

8.  Amendment of section 6-A.
9. Amendment of section 6-B.
10. Omission of section 6-CC.

Bill No. 9 of 2025.

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (ALLOWANCES AND
PENSION OF MEMBERS) AMENDMENT BILL, 2025

(AS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY)
A
BILL

further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of
Members) Act, 1971 (Act No. 8 of 1971).

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-sixth Year
of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short title.—This Act may be called The Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly
(Allowances and Pension of Members) Amendment Act, 2025.

2. Amendment of section 3.—In section 3 of the Himachal Pradesh Legislative
Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members) Act, 1971 (hereinafter referred to as the

“principal Act”),—

(a) in marginal heading for the words "Salary and compensatory allowance", the
words "Salary to a Member" shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (1),—

(i) for the words “fifty five thousand”, the words “eighty five thousand”
shall be substituted; and

(i1) the words "and compensatory allowance at the rate of five thousand rupees"
shall be omitted;

(c) after sub-section (1-A), the following shall be inserted, namely:—



636 ST, fRATeeT Yo, 10 31V, 2025 /20 I5, 1947

“(2) The salary of a member shall be increased after every five years commencing

from 1St April, 2030 on the basis of Cost Inflation Index provided under clause
(v) of Explanation to section 40 of the Income Tax Act, 1961.”.

3. Amendment of section 4.—In section 4 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), in
clause (ii), for the words “one thousand eight hundred”, the words “two thousand five hundred”
shall be substituted.

4. Substitution of section 4-B.— For section 4-B of the principal Act, the following shall
be substituted, namely:—

“4-B. Constituency and Office Allowance.-(1) There shall be paid to each member a
constituency allowance at the rate of one lakh twenty thousand rupees per mensem.

(2) There shall be paid to each member an office allowance at the rate of ninety
thousand rupees per mensem. ”.

5. Substitution of section 5.—For section 5 of the principal Act, the following shall be
substituted, namely:—

"5. Amenities.- A member shall be entitled to such residential accommodation on
concessional rates at the place of sitting of the Assembly as may be prescribed by rules
under section 7. ".

6. Omission of section 5-A.—Section 5-A of the principal Act shall be omitted.

7. Amendment of section 6.—In section 6 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1),—

(i) for the words “four lac rupees”, the words “six lakh rupees” shall be
substituted;

(i) for the second proviso, the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“Provided that the expenses of journey by taxi shall be on actual basis but
per kilometer charges shall not exceed more than twenty five rupees and
within the maximum limit of six lakh rupees:”; and

(b) in sub-section (2), after the words “Each member”, the words “during official
tour” shall be inserted and for the words “twenty five thousand”, the words
“fifty thousand” shall be substituted.

8. Amendment of section 6-A.—In section 6-A of the principal Act,—

(a) for the words “two lac rupees”, the words “three lakh rupees” shall be
substituted;

(b) for the first proviso, the following shall be substituted, namely:—



ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 637

(c)

“Provided that the expenses of journey by taxi shall be on actual basis but per
kilometer charges shall not exceed more than twenty five rupees and within the
maximum limit of three lakh rupees:”; and

in the second proviso, for the words “two lac rupees” the words “three lakh
rupees” shall be substituted.

9. Amendment of section 6-B.—In section 6-B of the principal Act,—

(a)

(b)

in sub-section (1), for the words and figures “Rs. 36,000”, the words “fifty
thousand rupees” shall be substituted; and

after sub-section (1), the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“(1-A) The pension of a member for the first term shall be increased after every
five years commencing from
It April, 2030 on the basis of Cost Inflation Index provided under clause (v) of
Explanation to section 40 of the Income Tax Act, 1961.”.

10. Omission of section 6-CC.— Section 6-CC shall be omitted.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Due to sharp increase in the cost of living, it has been considered necessary to amend the

provisions of the
Act, 1971.

Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members)

This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.

SHIMLA :

(SUKHVINDER SINGH SUKHU)
Chief Minister.

March, 2025.

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

Provisions of the Bill when enacted will involve an additional recurring expenditure of
approximately 20 crores to 22 crores on the State Exchequer, however, the same cannot be exactly

quantified.

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

-Nil-



638 ST, fRATeeT Yo, 10 31V, 2025 /20 I5, 1947

RECOMMENDATIONS OF THE GOVERNOR UNDER ARTICLE 207 OF THE
CONSTITUTION OF INDIA
[File No. GAD-C-D (——2025]

The Governor of Himachal Pradesh, having been informed of the subject matter of the
Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members) Amendment Bill,
2025, recommends under article 207 of the Constitution of India, the introduction and consideration
of the Bill in the Legislative Assembly.

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (ALLOWANCES AND
PENSION OF MEMBERS) AMENDMENT BILL, 2025
A
BILL

further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of
Members) Act, 1971 (Act No. 8 of 1971).

(SUKHVINDER SINGH SUKHU)
Chief Minister.

(SHARAD KUMAR LAGWAL)
Pr. Secretary (Law).

SHIMLA:

feeid, 28 A4, 2025

e faodo—faum—feRs / 1—113 / 2025 —fRAmae y<er faum= |91 @7 ufshar vd &
Hared FRETEet, 1973 @ FRW—140 & oTIa fRATae Yol faum | Jtede SR SuTede dad
(o) faRrId, 2025 (2025 &1 feRIe @id 10) S oMWl o 28 TG, 2025 &I fadArae
goel fdue |9r § qRINUT 8 géT §, AR Bl gaared 9 H giad $R gg uivd
fopar SITar 2 |

FXARIRT / —
(arerdTe)

2o qoﬁm:rwi



IIoTu=, fRamae US9n, 10 3, 2025 /20 o, 1947 639
2025 BT fAOIPH HE=HiD 10

feoTerer uaw QU T Sremer oiR Sureme I9a+ (W) fav®, 2025

WSl B HH
RCRUSH
1. gferg 99 |
2. ORI 3 BT G |
3. YN 4 BT G |
4. YRT 8 BT oY |
5.  YRT 10—& BT G |

2025 &1 f¥gs A=T1H 10.
fRATTre uewr e |1 orewer SiR SuTme da+ (Huer) fae, 2025
(e w1 % gReenfig wu )

fearae uowr faue 9WT eegel iR Sur™e dad Sffdfed, 1971 (1971 &1 SrfSfEw
T 4) BT 3R FIEH B b v fadT |

YR TORSY & OsaRd a¥ § fRome uew faum awr grr f=faRea ®9 d I8
s er—

1. e M—sa affm o1 G T fRuree ueer fur |y sreet IR SuTeger
I (Femer) srfaferH, 2025 |

2. HRT 3 BT AL — R U Ao |9r sregel 3R Suredel Ia+ IfSf=ad, 1971
(R4 59 39 gearq “Hel STAfH’ &8l T ) &l 9T 3 H—

(@) SUERT (1) H, "3 IR T&] & WM W "M BlR eq I SIGA |

(@) SUURT (1—a) & o< W FrefoRad <war S, sierfq—

"(1—) UL BT I, JMMABR IMATIH, 1961 B GTRT 40 B WLIHU & Gvs (5)
% e SUEId AN ERWIT Gadid & MR WX U 31, 2030 I UR™ Bl
§Y TS rE guf & TR qETT SQAT |7 $i”

(1) SWRI (1—1) #§ "JgFd g9R” &) & WM W “TH oRg T goR e W
ST |

3. HRT 4 B WA —q JRTH & aRT 4 H—

(@) SUIRT (1) H——""Tg8cR 89X’ Y&l & M R "gHd R Ieq I SIS |



640 IST93, fRHTeeT U<en, 10 o¥ie, 2025 /20 <3, 1947
(@) SUERT (1-) & WU W ffeiRad wr ST, serfq—

“(1—%) IUTA BT I, MAGY IMAFTIH, 1961 B URT 40 & WEIHIT B TS (5)
D SN IUEET ST ERBIT Fadhid B MUR TR UM A, 2030 A YR Bl
gU YD UlE qul @ U 9311 S |7 3R

() SWRT (1—W) H, “T9Hd g9R’ ¥&l & ©F W "Ud g g goR’ I W

ST |
4. ORI 8 BT A~ AT BT gRT 8 BT Y fhar Srg |
5. HRT 10—F & HeEH.—T JRTH @ aRT 10-F H——

(@) SUERT (1) H,—

() IR G I RI b RIF R B A U ek G A |
(i) SUIRT (1) & YoM WP & AN W F=eIRad a1 SIQT, fefia—
"R CRIl GRT BT TS AT BT I ARdD MR TR Hed BN febeg

gfd fhaiier IR U= B9 | SFd JUT B: IR Bud Bl IMfhdH
[T B AR BT | 3R

(iil) & Wge § IR I IR TR T WM W "B G 10" AR
ST |

(@) SHIRT (2) # U= 89X ¥eal & qM R “UAr 8ok 9§ I SIUA |

Il iR BRI HT B
frate = % dFar 9 gfg & BReT [GU [ sed SR Surde dad AfAfE, 1971 H

I BRAT SMATIH FTHST AT 2 |

Iz fatgs Sudad SRt & i & forw 2

(gafdx Rz gag)
q 47 |

IEGIEESIRE]

e @ Syl &l FRFEfRT Fr 99 9 Ioey )R T 9 drg ifaRed
AT g fqdferd BT, TAMY SHBI Slb ITFATT ol IR ST bl & |




IIoTu=, fRamae US9n, 10 3, 2025 /20 o, 1947 641
yrAfoTg s greel S

IRA & A & AT 207 B I Ioqurel I w1

(Br3e o ShoToSI0—d10—3S10(6)—3 / 2025)

faed UQ¥ @& IuuTd, fRAmee uewr faue 9w erue SfR Sutde dad (WRITEE)
faerre, 2025 @1 f[Avgaw] & IR ¥ GG BT T & 9ear] 9Rd & GAUE & Jee 207 b
3N fergs &1 faum | § RN o iR 39 W fIaR & & ey axad 2

feATrore wowr e T eremer ofiR Sumrwe da+ (W) faere, 2025

fearae uowr foure 99T eruel 3fR Surge dad IfSfEm, 1971 (1971 &1 i
TTB 4) BT 3R FIEH B B v {9 |

(gafder Rz gag)
gy 7 |

ger Afaa (fafe) |
e -
TRRG & s 2025

UTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT

Bill No. 10 of 2025

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY SPEAKER’S AND DEPUTY
SPEAKER’S SALARIES (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025

ARRANGEMENT OF CLAUSES
Clauses:

Short title.

Amendment of section 3.
Amendment of section 4.
Omission of section 8.
Amendment of section 10-A.

P



642 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

Bill No. 10 of 2025.

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY SPEAKER’S AND DEPUTY
SPEAKER’S SALARIES (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025

(AS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY)
A
BILL

further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly Speaker’s and Deputy
Speaker’s Salaries Act, 1971 (Act No. 4 of 1971).

BEit enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-sixth Year of
the Republic of India as follow:—

1. Short title—This Act may be called the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly
Speaker’s and Deputy Speaker’s Salaries (Amendment) Act, 2025.

2. Amendment of section 3.—In section 3 of the Himachal Pradesh Legislative
Assembly Speaker’s and Deputy Speaker’s Salaries Act, 1971 (hereinafter referred to as the
“principal Act”),—

(a) in sub—section (1), for the words “eighty thousand”, the words “ninety five thousand”
shall be substituted;

(b) for sub-section (1-A), the following shall be substituted, namely:—
"(1-A) The salary of the Speaker shall be increased after every five years commencing
from 1% April, 2030 on the basis of Cost Inflation Index provided under clause (v) of

Explanation to section 40 of the Income Tax Act, 1961."; and

(c) in sub-section (1-B), for the words “ninety five thousand”, the words “one lakh
fifty thousand” shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of section 4.—In section 4 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words, “seventy five thousand”, the words “ninety
two thousand” shall be substituted;

(b) for sub-section (1-A), the following shall be substituted, namely:—
"(1-A) The salary of the Deputy Speaker shall be increased after every five years
commencing from Ist April, 2030 on the basis of cost inflation index provided under

clause (v) of Explanation to section 40 of the Income Tax Act, 1961."; and

(c) in sub-section (1-B), for the words “ninety five thousand”, the words “one lakh
fifty thousand” shall be substituted.

4. Omission of section 8.—Section § of the principal Act shall be omitted.



RToT0, fEAMe U9, 10 3, 2025 /20 I3, 1947 643
5.  Amendment of section 10-A.— In section 10-A of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1),—

[3

(i) for the words “four lac rupees”, the words “six lakh rupees” shall be
substituted;

(i1)  for the first proviso, the following shall be substituted, namely:—
“Provided that the expenses of journey by taxi shall be on actual basis but per
kilometer charges shall not exceed more than twenty five rupees and within the

maximum limit of six lakh rupees:”; and

(iii) in the second proviso, for the words “four lac rupees” the words “six lakh
rupees” shall be substituted; and

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “twenty five thousand”, the words “fifty thousand”
shall be substituted.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS
Due to sharp increase in the cost of living, it has been considered necessary to amend the
provisions of the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly Speaker’s and Deputy Speaker’s
Salaries Act, 1971.
This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.

(SUKHVINDER SINGH SUKHU)
Chief Minister.

SHIMLA

The March, 2025.

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

Provisions of the Bill when enacted will involve an additional recurring expenditure of
approximately 35 lakhs on the State Exchequer, however, the same cannot be exactly quantified.

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

-Nil-



644 ST, fRATeeT Yo, 10 31V, 2025 /20 I5, 1947

RECOMMENDATIONS OF THE GOVERNOR UNDER ARTICLE 207 OF THE
CONSTITUTION OF INDIA

[File No. GAD-C-D(6)-3/2025]

The Governor of Himachal Pradesh, having been informed of the subject matter of the
Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly Speaker’s and Deputy Speaker’s Salaries (Amendment)
Bill, 2025 recommends under article 207 of the Constitution of India, the introduction and
consideration of the Bill in the Legislative Assembly.

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY SPEAKER’S AND
DEPUTY SPEAKER’S SALARIES (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025

A
BILL

further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly Speaker’s and Deputy
Speaker’s Salaries Act, 1971 (Act No. 4 of 1971).

(SUKHVINDER SINGH SUKHU)
Chief Minister.

(SHARAD KUMAR LAGWAL)
Pr. Secretary (Law).

SHIMLA:

The ,2025.

In the Court of Sub-Divisional Magistrate, Chamba, District Chamba (H. P.)

Deepak Kumar s/o Sh. Amar Singh, resident of P.O. Karian, Tehsil & District Chamba
(H. P.).
and

Roshni d/o Sh. Om Parkash, resident of House No. 3/40, Sangalpura Road, Ward No. 5,
Post Office Gurdaspur, Tehsil & Distt. Gurdaspur, Punjab.

Versus

General Public



IIoTu=, fRamae US9n, 10 3, 2025 /20 o, 1947 645

Subject.— Registration of Marriage under Section 8(4) of the H.P. Registration of Marriages Act,
1996 (Act No. 210f 1997).

Whereas, the above named applicants have made an application before me under section
8(4) of H.P. Registration of Marriages Act, 1996 alongwith relevant records and affidavits stating
therein that they have solemnized their marriage on 05-05-2010 at their place of residence with
prevailing rites and customs but due to some un-avoidable circumstances it could not be entered in
the records of Gram Panchayat Karian, Development Block Mehla well in time.

And whereas, they have also stated that they were not aware of the laws for the registration
of marriage with the registrar of marriages and now, therefore, necessary orders for the registration
of their marriage be passed, so that their marriage could be registered by the concerned authority.

Now, therefore, objections are invited from the general public that if, anyone has any
objection regarding the registration of marriage of above named applicants, they should appear
before the undersigned in my court on or before 03-05-2025 at 2.00 P.M. either personally or
through their authorised agent/pleader.

In the event of their failure to do so, orders shall be passed ex-parte for the registration of
marriage without affording any further opportunity of being heard.

Issued under my hand and seal of the Court on this 02nd day of April, 2025.

Seal. Sd/-
Sub-Divisional Magistrate,
Chamba, District Chamba (H.P.).

In the Court of Sh. Rakesh Sharma HPAS Sub-Divisional Magistrate, Exercising the Powers of
Marriage Office Nadaun, District Hamirpur (H.P.)
In the matter of:

1. Lovely Kumar s/o Dharam Chand, r/o Village Choa Chukrala, Post Office Choru,
Tehsil Nadaun, District Hamirpur (H.P.).

2. Bharti Kumari d/o Vinod Saini, r/o Village Shergarh Man, District Ludhiana, Punjab.
Versus
General Public
Subject.— Notice for Registration of Marriage Under Special Marriage Act, 1954.

The above applicants have filed an application u/s 16 of Special Marriage Act, 1954
alongwith affidavits and supporting documents in the court of undersigned in which they have
stated that they have solemnized their marriage on 27-07-2024 at Bagla Mukhi Sankat Mochan
Temple and they are living as husband and wife since then, hence their marriage may be registered.

Therefore, the general public is hereby informed through this notice that if any person who
have only objection regarding this marriage can file the objections personally or in writing before
this office on or before 17-05-2025 at 11.00 A.M. The objection(s) after 17-05-2025 at 11.00 A.M.



646 ST, fRATeeT Yo, 10 31V, 2025 /20 I5, 1947

will not be entertained by this office and then the marriage will be registered accordingly as per the
law prescribed.

Issued today on this 01-04-2025 under my hand and seal of this office.

Seal. RAKESH SHARMA (HPAS),
Sub Divisional Magistrate-com-Marriage Officer,
Nadaun, Distt. Hamirpur (H.P.).

In the Court of Sh. Rakesh Sharma HPAS Sub-Divisional Magistrate, Exercising the Powers of
Marriage Office Nadaun, District Hamirpur (H.P.)

In the matter of:

1. Tulsi Dass s/o Rama Ram, r/o Village Sareri, Post Office Bahal, Tehsil Nadaun,
District Hamirpur (H.P.).

2. Pawana Kumari d/o Sondhi Ram, r/o Village Amman, Tehsil Bamsan, District
Hamirpur (H.P.).

Versus
General Public
Subject.— Notice for Registration of Marriage Under Special Marriage Act, 1954.

The above applicants have filed an application u/s 16 of Special Marriage Act, 1954
alongwith affidavits and supporting documents in the court of undersigned in which they have
stated that they have solemnized their marriage on 13-03-2025 at Bagla Mukhi Sankat Mochan
Temple and they are living as husband and wife since then, hence their marriage may be registered.

Therefore, the general public is hereby informed through this notice that if any person who
have onlyobjection regarding this marriage can file the objections personally or in writing before
this office on or before 28-04-2025 at 11.00 A.M. The objection(s) after 28-04-2025 at 11.00 A.M.
will not be entertained by this office and then the marriage will be registered accordingly as per the
law prescribed.

Issued today on this 22-03-2025 under my hand and seal of this office.

Seal. RAKESH SHARMA (HPAS),
Sub Divisional Magistrate-cam-Marriage Officer,
Nadaun, Distt. Hamirpur (H.P.).

In the Court of Sh. Rakesh Sharma HPAS Sub-Divisional Magistrate, Exercising the Powers of
Marriage Office Nadaun, District Hamirpur (H.P.)

In the matter of:



IIoTu=, fRamae US9n, 10 3, 2025 /20 o, 1947 647

1. Akshay Kumar s/o Raj Kumar, r/o Village Palasi, Post Office Pahal, Tehsil Galore,
District Hamirpur (H.P.).

2. Harshita Rawat d/o Fateh Singh Rawat, r/o House No. 313/2 Dayanand Colony
Ramnagar, Tehsil & District Ajmer Rajasthan.

Versus
General Public
Subject.— Notice for Registration of Marriage Under Special Marriage Act, 1954.

The above applicants have filed an application u/s 16 of Special Marriage Act, 1954
alongwith affidavits and supporting documents in the court of undersigned in which they have
stated that they have solemnized their marriage on 06-03-2025 at Jai Mata Bagla Mukhi Sankat
Mochan Mandir Budhana Kangoo and they are living as husband and wife since then, hence their
marriage may be registered.

Therefore, the general public is hereby informed through this notice that if any person who
have only objection regarding this marriage can file the objections personally or in writing before
this office on or before 03-05-2025 at 11.00 A.M. The objection(s) after 03-05-2025 at 11.00 A.M.
will not be entertained by this office and then the marriage will be registered accordingly as per the
law prescribed.

Issued today on this 01-04-2025 under my hand and seal of this office.
Seal. RAKESH SHARMA (HPAS),

Sub Divisional Magistrate-cam-Marriage Officer,
Nadaun, Distt. Hamirpur (H.P.).

In the Court of Sh. Rakesh Sharma HPAS Sub-Divisional Magistrate, Exercising the Powers of
Marriage Office Nadaun, District Hamirpur (H.P.)

In the matter of:

1. Abnish s/o Kuldeep Kumar, r/o Village Chilbahal, Post Office Dangri, Tehsil Nadaun,
District Hamirpur (H.P.).

2. Neha Devi d/o Pradeep Kumar, r/o Village Dhaneti Bhurian Raja Ka Talab, Panchayat
Dhaneti Garla, Tehsil Nurpur, District Kangra (H.P.).

Versus
General Public

Subject.— Proclamation for the registration of Marriage under section 5 of special marriage Act,
1976.



648 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

Abnish and Neha Devi have filed an application U/S 5 of Special Marriage Act, 1954
alongwith affidavits and supporting documents in the court of undersigned in which they have
stated that they intend to solemnize their marriage within next three calendar months.

Therefore, the general public is hereby informed through this notice that if any person
having any objection regarding this marriage may file his/her objections personally or in writing
before this court on or before 16-06-2025. In case no objection is received by16-06-2025, it will be
presumed that there is no objection to the registration of the above said marriage and the same will
be registered accordingly.

Issued under my hand and seal of the court on 01-03-2025.

Seal. RAKESH SHARMA (HPAS),
Sub Divisional Magistrate-com-Marriage Officer,
Nadaun, Distt. Hamirpur (H.P.).

In the Court of Sh. Rakesh Sharma HPAS Sub-Divisional Magistrate, Exercising the Powers of
Marriage Office Nadaun, District Hamirpur (H.P.)

In the matter of:

1. Pankaj Kumar s/o Surender Kumar, r/o Village Sarai, Post Office Dhaneta, Tehsil
Nadaun, District Hamirpur (H.P.).

2. Dilpreet Kaur d/o Charan Singh, r/o Village Nathoke, Post Office & Tehsil
Bhaghapurana, District Moga (P.B.).

Versus
General Public

Subject.— Proclamation for the registration of Marriage under section 5 of special marriage Act,
1976.

Pankaj Kumar and Dilpreet Kaur have filed an application U/S 5 of Special Marriage Act,
1954 alongwith affidavits and supporting documents in the court of undersigned in which they have
stated that they intend to solemnize their marriage within next three calendar months.

Therefore, the general public is hereby informed through this notice that if any person
having any objection regarding this marriage may file his/her objections personally or in writing
before this court on or before 16-06-2025. In case no objection is received by16-06-2025, it will be
presumed that there is no objection to the registration of the above said marriage and the same will
be registered accordingly.

Issued under my hand and seal of the court on 01-03-2025.

Seal. RAKESH SHARMA (HPAS),
Sub Divisional Magistrate-com-Marriage Officer,
Nadaun, Distt. Hamirpur (H.P.).



IMST93, fRHTet U9, 10 S1¥ie, 2025 /20 o, 1947 649
9 ITQTeld HEId FHEdr fgedig Sof, goegR, forer g9RgR (fRowo)

e TR [EZ Gl SISGCECIDN GLGERCNII

11 /NT /2025 SV fafer goftaxor 08—01—2025 25—04—2025

G PEAr <dl gE wfdd g, 9rRA AT S, dediid goragy, el sHRYR

(fRo o) - oarfean |
CEIE|

SIERCE| BCIREIC

S Al uofieror gsi dae <dl gl wfdd gs, 9T A SN, dediel golgR,
forerr s9RYR (f2o Wo) |

RT3 dRR ST Yool Gl HoT <dl YA wfda dws, 9l ATl ofoT, dgdrd
FoIgR, fSTelr 89RYR (f20 W0) =1 £ 3faTerd H SRR a1 § b S¥aT o fadld 12—02—1974
DI YTH AR GHRITON H §3T o AT Fedd ToAdl I I AR gHRION § &5l el 8 grl
2| foreTor 39 U™ darad gaRaon § g dvd & forw amewr uiRd fhu WY |

31 UfaTdl 3| SieT JT FHid ReeRT ® 9 $¥deR gRT giad f&har i © o
Ife fei B SWRad 9 fAfT Iofiexor IR i SoR 9 TR 8 df 98 fodie ush
25—04—2025 DI FI& 10.00 IoI 9 IRTA H AT AT GhTeAd= U YaRTSl TR &
THeT SURIT BIHR U X Ahdl & AT SWRIGT o fafdr &I g5 &7 @& 3Mey < &

ST | D SURIT Blg YaRTol el AT ST |

31TST &I 17—03—2025 DI WX BXIER g HIBR JaTeld gIRI NI §aTT |

AER | FRIRT / —

9 JTQTeld HerId FrEdr fgdg sof, goegR, forer gRgR (fRovo)

e =R fhes gepear ARG &RR GISGER]

13 /NT /2025 SV fafer goftasor 24—03—2025 25—04—2025

s g ¥ g3 feRar @, IR Al eReflell, dgdid goigR, fofer gHRYR

(fRo wo) el |
CEIE|

3 STaT RIGCIE

S fafdr gofiexor s gara R g3 f—ur v, arfl |@eie wRAiel, dedid goAT,
1T gIRYR (B0 Wo) |



650 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

IR0 RIS UolieRor A1 g g gF feRur M, aril Aisld wReilell, dEd
GoIgR, 7 8RR (fRo U0) 71 39 feTard H IR fbar & b a1 o faid 04—03—1975
BN UM YA I H I o AT HeGH el | UM YEId I H ol Aol 8 Uil ¢ |
BT 39 UM Uad 991 H ol $R @ fofy 3feel Uik fby S1g |

31d: gfaraTel 3 Si=iaT i Faied RedaRi &I 39 $TeR gRT grod fbar o © &
gfe fefl &1 SWRed o9 Iy TSR aR PBls SoR d TRl 8l df 98 fedie ush
25—04—2025 DI FIT 10.00 Il 9 IR H AT AT T AT YaRTSl TR &
THeT SURLT BIAY U R Fhdl © I=WAT SWIad o fafy & g5 dxd & ey ©
ST | S SURT Iy QRS ol GAT ST |

31TST &I 24—03—2025 BT WX BRIER g HIBR JaTeld GIRT SIRI §aTT |
HER | BRATEIR / —
oIy, 7l gARYR (%oqo)i

¥ ITQTeld HeI® TEdr faedig #1of, gogR, forar s9RgR (fRovo)

e =R fbes gepear ARG &SRR GISGER]

12 /NT /2025 ST fafer goitaxor 12—03—2025 25—04—2025

£ Proid e g o ¥, aR Aield Formel, dedid goimgR, el gARYR

(fRo wo) el |
CRIC]

3 STt REIGCIE

S ffor gofieror o gRofia e g3 fawdl (@, Il Aield Jolel, dedia GolR,
Sterm gHRYR (fBo o) |

RA—UF R S USieRor uredi sl JRoila 6 gF O kW, 9 A@igtd A,
qexilel gorrTgR, frelm g4RgR (o vo) ﬁrsvaqmqﬁmwﬁm%%mmﬁﬂm
30—06—1970 Pl UM UARIT Sildl o= ﬁ 3T AT T WEd el H UM U=ad Sl o’ H

ol T8l B IR 2 | foreTon s U™ e Siiel Rl ool B @ oIy Smeyr uiRd fhy WY |

31 gfaaTe] 3 Si=iaT i Faiad RedaRi &I 39 $TeR gRT grod fbar S © &
gfe fefl &1 SWied o9 Iy TSR gR PBis SoR d TR 8 df 98 fedie ush
25—04—2025 DI FI& 10.00 T 9 IRTA H AT AT Feblefd= U YaRTol JENSHIER] &
JHET SURYT BIAY U R Ahdl © IIAT SWRIad o fafy & g5 1 & ey ¢
ST | S IR Iy QRIS ol GAT ST |

3ITST f&=ieh 17—03—2025 &I WX BXIER G HIER JAQTeld §RT SINT 3T |

AER | FATEIRT / —
TERId aHTRdr fadra sioft,

gogR, f51er g9RYR (fRovo) |



IMST93, fRHTet U9, 10 S1¥ie, 2025 /20 o, 1947 651
9 ITQTeld HEId FHEdr fgedig Sof, goegR, forer g9RgR (fRowo)

e TR [EZ Gl SISGCECIDN GLGERCNII

05/NT /2025 Y fafdr uoirevor 24—02—2025 25—04—2025

N PAY I YF SR R, gl diwd died, dedid gorgR, [en sRyR

(fRo wo) CICU
CEIE|

3 STaT RCIGCIE

g Al gofiesxor sl wifeet 9o gu @, ardl diglel digd, dedld goyy, o7l
FARYR (20 Wo) |

mﬁm—wma—g%@qﬁﬁwmﬁ%ﬁﬁwaﬁf?aﬁﬁmﬁg il AET
digdl, dedld gorgR, forer s9RYR (fBo U0) 1 S99 3f&Tad d SRR fdar g fb 39 dc si
AR g3 gAY a= &1 Jg Qi 15—04—2001 BT I U=rad & H g8 o oI Aead Teidl o
TSl T8l B URl 7 | foeTer 39 U™ a1 A &S ) @ folg ey uikd fHy W |

31 UfaTdl 3| SiIeT J FHid ReeRl ®I 9 $¥deR gRT giad f&har S § o
afs fedl @1 SWad gg ffY doiaxer IR PSSOk 9 UdRI 8 A 98 faie ued
25—04—2025 DI FIE 10.00 Il 39 IRATA H AT AT bl U YaRTSl TR &

HHeT JURLIT BIHR UL R Feball © IAT IWIdd Jog oIl &I &6 PR & 3fMey <
ST | D SURIT Dlg YaRTol el AT ST |

31TST &I 18—03—2025 DI WX BLIER g HIBR JaTeld gIRI NI §aTT |

AER | FRIRT / —
TR AR faa S,

IoTgR, e g4RYR (fBowo) |

¥ QT WEd wAEdr yo Aofl, geEgR, fer s9RgR (RRovo)

e =R fhes gepear ARG aRR GISGERE]
23 /T /2025 SV fafer gofiasor 17—03—2025 22—04—2025

L AN o [aN o [aN
1 Holld PHR YA HXd N4, qrel AET [cexl, dedlel XJullHYR, Tulcll 2HIRYX

(fRo wo) BCICU

M ST *gfrard |

o fafr goiiexor #i1 Hoild HAR g3 A% M, dRI Aelel [Savl, devild oy, ot

FARYR (B0 o) |



652 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

W93 R S Uoliaxel $f Holld §aR §F A W, arl Aele feEw, dgdrd
JoIR, e sIRYR (B0 ¥o) 7 39 3feTed H SRR fhar € & I|a1 o f3d 05—06—1971
DI IH AT a1 # g a7 JT AEed Tt | o fafdy g1 T8 81 o 2| fomn g9 W
gard feaRT H T5 R @ fofy afesr Uik fby g |

31 gfaraTel M Si=iaT i e RedaRi &I 39 STER &R grod fhar S & &
gfe fefl &7 SWRied o9 Iy ToilRor aR PBls SoR d TRl 8 df 98 fedie ush
22—04—2025 Pl Fd8 10.00 IoI $H AT H JATSATT IT JDTela 3TUAT TaRTSl JETEIER] D
HHET JURIT BIBR UL BR HDhal & AT SURIFK of Al &I 9™ v=arad Eexr H &6 B
% ST T AU G | IS SR PIg oISl ol GAT ST |

31TST &I 27—03—2025 BT WX BXIER g HIBR JaTeld GIRT SIRI §aTT |

AR | FEATERT / —
oIy, Tl gHRYR (%oqo)i

T QT Wed waredl yord siofl, gorgR, forem sWRyR (RRovo)

e TR e gepedn SINTEECIDN GLGERCNII

03 /T /2025 ST fafer gofrawor 18—02—2025 22—04—2025

Al AT qdl gAl Siies, XM, a9l HIsld $res, dedid goryR, e g9RYR

(fRo o) - arfen |
CEIE|

IR EIE - gfary |

S O goiieRor siell Ml <dl gl Siigs, ¥, IR AT $res, dediel golg,
Ster gHRYR (B0 o) |

URI—U3 SRI S USlRYT Sl TRET <dl g3 Siieg M, Il Aisld Bles, dedild
FoFgR, STl 89RYR (fB0 W0) «1 $9 3fTad H SRR fhar § 1 I/ o7 f3A1d 10—01—1951
DI UM AT S (TATEY) | AT o TN WA Teiell | &l el 8 grl & | forgmn s 3
TARId el (Farrel) ® &9 e & forg ameer uiRkd fy S |

31 gfaTel 3 Si=aT i Wi RedaR! @1 §9 SR gRT gred fbar S § 16
e frdl & SWaed o= fafr goexoT IR Bls SoR g TRl 8 o g8 fedie ush
22—04—2025 Pl g8 10.00 IoI $H AT H JATATT IT IDTeIa 3TUAT YaRTSl JETBEIER] D
e SURT BIPR U PR Fhal © AT IWiad o Ay @ T &1 & ey § fo

ST | S SURIT BIg YaRTol el AT ST |

31TST &I 22—-03—2025 DI WX FRIER g HIBR JaTeld GIRT SIRI §aTT |

HIEN | BXTIEIRT / —
HETID ATl G A,
GoTAgR, e g4RYR (fBovo) |




IMST93, fRHTet U9, 10 S1¥ie, 2025 /20 o, 1947 653
9 ITQTeld HEId FHEdr fgedig Sof, goegR, forer g9RgR (fRowo)

e TR [EZ Gl SISGCECIDN GLGERCNII

23 /NT/2025 T GO 28—01—2025 25—04—2025

£ GRS 0T gF WTell XM, IR AT TRIg, [HeTerdl, dedla goryR, forer sdRyR

(fRo wo) | CICU
CRIK

SICACERI| EIREISE

gfAT—us A oWl Uil sl GReid om gF eMell I, IR Jeld IRIg, Herel, Jedid
FoigR, forerm g4RYR (20 Wo) |

RIS A ol Uil s {gReia Om A el M, 9 A IR, e,
dediel gogR, RTer 84RYR (20 ¥0) 1 59 3f&Terd H UA—ua SRR fhar & & Sqar 9m
RISRE Ao H GO F ATl UM &l 8, Sfdid Idl Fel A1 JRoid 10T Y= Alell I
2| foTBTo 9 GO oRa HiBTd IRIg, MEerdl & IS Aol # ol 0T Y3 Alell TH
foar ST |

31 gfraTel M Si=aT i e RedaRi &I 39 SR gRT grod fbar o © &
fpdl B IWIFT AW ORI IR DIg IR d YRSl 81 Al d8 & UL 25—-04—2025 Pl Jag
10.00 997 S ST ¥ MATIdd AT IhTerd ST TaRTST ISR & qHeT SURd Iax
UTl PR HHAT © AT IUWIFT M GORI B D MY 7 3 SIRAT | IHD ST By YaRTo

= GAT ST |

3ITST f&=ieh 27—03—2025 &I WX BXIER d HIER IAQTeld §RT SINT gaTT |

AER | IR / —
TERIS aHTRdr fadra sioft,

ogR, f51er g4RYR (fRovo) |

9 I7<Ted FeId FaTEdt Yo ofl, gogR, forar sHRyR (Rovo)

e =R fhe gepear ARG aRR GIGEREN
24 /T /2025 S fafer gofiaRor 22—03—2025 22—04—2025

AT qur <dl gl IR M@, aRN AIEle WRe, dedld gouHyR, e sHRyR
(fRo wo) - grfea |

M ST ~gferardy |

ST fafer goiiepvor gl Juem qdl g1 TR M, aRil AT WRG, dedidl gorryr, foretr
FARYR (f20 o) |



654 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

RT3 R S USIIhRU G |UAT <dl gAT TRE M, aRA AlEld WRg, dedrd
JogR, RTar SRGR (R0 Uo) 7 39 S1&Teld H SRR &A1 & b SHaT o fa1d 05—04—1975
DI YTH GARIT ARFITON § g3 o TAT Fad ToAdl 0 o4 I g1 781 81 urg 7| forgran s
UM UAId AT # SOl B @ fog emewr uikd fhe 1Y |

31 gfraTel 3 Si=iaT i Faied RedaR! &1 39 $¥eR gRT grod fbar S © &
gfe fefl &1 SWRed 99 Iy TSR aR PBis SoR d TRl 8 df 98 fedie ush
22—04—2025 Pl FI8 10.00 IoI $H AT H SJATATT IT IDTeIa TUAT YaRTSl JETSEIER] D
AHET JURIT BIBR UL PR ADAl & JUAT SWIGd OH [ DI I dargd A@amon H gl
P B AR 7 QT MG | IHS SR DIg YaxTol &l AT ST |

31TST &I 22—-03—2025 DI WX FRIER g HIBR JaTeld GIRT SIRI §aTT |

AR | FXeIRT / —

¥ QT WEe gerEdl yor Aoft, geEgR, fSer s9RgR (RRovo)

e =R fhes gepear ARG &RR GISGERE]
25/ T/2025 T GORI 22—03—2025 22—04—2025

s {95 =7s 3 AT, Il dieTdl o¥, dediel goragR, fSar s9RgR (fBo Wo) |
grel |

JMH ST “gfaara) |

RIS A gowil el 2 fIw T g wrelum, 9l Aigre ¥, Jedd goragR, forer
FARYR (20 W0) |

UrRiA—ua M ol uedl o1 fIsp I gF Wiy, aril AeTd o, e gogR,
f37em SRR (Bo Uo) 7 39 3f|Ted § WHI-UF SRR &A1 © {6 SHaT 9M IoRa 1o
faspw RiE 9= Wl &1 &, Sidie I9d Ael 7 9pd aw< g3 el © | fosre 39 g9k axa
s o= g3 wrell o oy |

31 gfeaTel M Si=iaT i e RedaRl &I §9 SR &R grod fbar smar © &
fpdl B! IWIFT AW GORN IR DIg IR d YRSl 81 Al g8 i URN 22—04—2025 Pl JaE
10.00 991 39 AT # ST AT IHIAAd 3G TaRTol SRR & THeT IuRYT BIaR
Ul PR FHAT © AT IR AF GO IR B AR T & SIRAT | IHD SR DIg YT

= GAT ST |

31TST & 22—03—2025 DI AR BEIER T HIBY 3faTeld R SIRI 83T |

AER | FEIRT / —
TE G AHTEAT TUH vy,

goHgR, f51er g4RYR (fRovo) |



RS04, fEATae Uaen, 10 MU, 2025 /20 o, 1947 655
9 IcTeld Herd wHEdl v gofl, gorygr, frer iRy (fRovo)

e TR fbes gepeAT SINGCECIDN GLGERCNII
26/ T/2025 qH ORI 22—03—2025 22—04—2025

s 99 = g3 Wi, ari AlsTa &, Tedid GoryR, 57 s9R9R (fRo o) |
T |

M ST - gferardy |

RT3 A GOl Uil Al WACu™ g3 &, aril Jerel a%), dediel GoryR, e g4RYR
(fRo wo) |

RIS AW gowl Uil s I T gF emelu™, Il Aileld ¥, dedid goHw,
fSrar BIRYR (B0 Uo) 7 9 3ferard ¥ WfA-ua SRR fHAr © fb S¥a fUar wreliim g3 €
HT A oG Aol areR AT o H el Y3 8% g9l 3, Sidid I9dT Aal A9 AT
TF €% & | foTeTol 9 dIgTd 9% & JIOid Affeid H go%d PR ATl % ATIE Y B
[ERIRI

31: gferaTel M Si=iaT i Faiad RedaRi &I 39 SR &R grod fbar o © &
fpdl B! IWIFT AW GORN IR DIg IR d YaRISl 81 Al g8 &= U 22—04—2025 Pl JaE
10.00 997 S AT ¥ ATIAT AT IhTeTd ITI-T TaRTSl ISR & dHeT SUuRed gIax
UTl PR HHAT © AT IUWIFT M GORI B b MY 7 3 SIRAT | IHD SR By YaRT
T AT ST |

31TST & 22—03—2025 DI AR BEIER T HIBY 3faTeAd R SIRI 83T |

AR | FXATEIRT / —
TEIG AHTEAT TUH 0y,

ogR, f51er g4RYR (fRovo) |

g STGTela Werd wrsdl M oofl, gomgR, frer sWRgR (fRovo)

e TR fbest gepeAT ARG TR arrg Ul

25 /T /2025 ST fafer gofrawor 21—03—2025 22—04—2025

S AT T= YgF MUl &M, IR AIEld SN oR, dedlel goMyR, e sURYR

(fRo o) CgraT |
CEIE|

JH ST - gfaara) |

T foifey gofiepxor &1 gefly =< Yo MUl a1, aril HIgTel SV €, dedilel Jolg,

1ot gARYR (B0 o) |



656 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

TIA—UF aRRI 71 USIIaRUl 31 Telld o< g3 TTdl <199, aril AT 3107 ¥R, Jgdrd
GoIgR, 7 8RR (fRo U0) 7 39 feTard H IR fbar & b a1 S fa1d 06—09—1968
P UM YaId STag W B3N AT AT WEGH ek ¥ o ffY g5 81 8 Ul € | o e
I UARIT S, H &6l B @ (oY Qe uIikd by Sy |

31: gferaTe] 3 Si=iaT i Faiad RedaR! &I 39 SR gRT grod fbar o © &
gfe fefl &1 SWRed o9 Iy ToilRor aR PBls SoR d TRl 8l df 98 fedie ush
22—04—2025 Pl g8 10.00 IoI $H AT H JATATT IT IDTeIa TUAT YaRTSl JETSEIER] D
HHET IURT BIPR UL PR bl © AAT SR oI I DI UM Uaad STag H ol PR
% ST T Y TG | IS SR PIg QaRTSl ol GAT ST |

31TST &I 21—03—2025 BT WX FXIER g HIBR AJaTeld GIRT SIRI §aTT |

AR | FXATEIRT / —
TEIG AHTEAT TH 0y,

oIy, foretm g4RYR (f20v0) |

T QT Werd wHredl yord Siofl, gogR, forem sWRyR (RRovo)

e TR e gepedn SINTCECIDN GLGERCNII

26 /T /2025 ST fafer gofrawor 21—03—2025 22—04—2025

(fRo wo) CICU
CEIE|

IR EIE - gfary |

S ffYy uofiesxor #ff He HAR YA dell WM, aril A e diormn, dJesiid golg,
fSterm gARYR (B0 o) |

T3 RIS USlRul S 991 HAR GF Joll M, aRi Aleld aforaron, desid
FoIgR, ST 89RYR (720 W0) +1 $9 3Tl H IR 1ha1 § 1 ST o7 f3Id 08—06—1965
DI UM YA Il H gIN AT TJAT FgdT TeAdl 9 o0 [ g5l 7281 81 urg = | forren g9 u
AT 1 H GOl PR B oY 3Mee UIRT fhy 1Y |

31 UfaTel 3 Si=aT i Wi RedaR! &1 9 SR gRT1 grod fbar S & &
gfe frdl & SWed o= fafdr goeroT IR Bl SoR g TRl 8 o g8 fedie osh
22—04—2025 Pl g8 10.00 IoI $H AITAI H JATATT IT JDTela 3TUAT YoRTSl JEBEIER] D
el SURT BIPR U HR Fohdl & FUAT SURIGT SfH foIfdr I UM U d1e] H ol R
% IMMQY <y TG | SHd SR Py YAl el GAT ST |

31TST &I 27—03—2025 BT WX FXIER g HIBR JaTeAd GIRT SIRI §aTT |

HIEw | BXTIEIRT / —
HETID AT G Ao,
GoTgR, el g4RYR (fBovo) |




IMST93, fRHTet U9, 10 S1¥ie, 2025 /20 o, 1947 657
9 I[STeld Fed FHTEdt Yo Sof, gorgR, forar s9RyR (fZovo)

e TR e gepedn SINGCECIDN GLGERCNII
22 /T /2025 S+ fafer gofiasor 07—03—2025 22—04—2025

JA AReAT <1 g wRaq e, 9l Aerd Rags (Sure), dedie goryR, e s9RgR
(fRo wo) o grfea |

M ST - gferardy |

S fafr doiiexrer sl kel <dl gEl Wxad R, 9l diwe Rags (Srs), dsdd
FoigR, forerm g4RYR (20 Wo) |

RT3 IR S UolaRoT gl ARal <dl gA WRaq RE, ari @ Rags (|rs),
dgdidl goiFgR, el 9RYR (fBo ¥0) = S 3@rald W R fhar 2 b I9ar ¥ faid
20—12—1974 B ITH YA UAIE H GO o7 TAT WedT Tordl & o+ fIfdy gl & & uig ¥ |
fRIETST 39 U™ UarId U+Ig H &of &+ & fov omeer uiiRd fby g |

31 UfaTdl 3| SieT J FHid RedeRl ® 9 $¥deR gRT giad f&har i © o
Ife fofl Bl SWiad o0 fafy Tofieror IR i SoR 9 TaRIS 8 df 98 fodie ush
22—04—2025 DI FIE 10.00 I 9 IRATA H AT AT hTeAd= U YaRTSl TR &
THeT SURLIT BIHR U R AHAT & TIAT SWRIad o fafd I U9 d9mad g § & &_d &
3Mee < A TG | S SR DIg YRSl el GAT ST |

31TST &I 27—03—2025 DI WX BXIER g HIBR AJaTeld gR1 NI §aTT |

AER | FXRIRT / —

In the Court of Sub-Divisional Magistrate Barsar, District Hamirpur (H.P.) Exercising the
Powers of Marriage Officer under Special Marriage Act, 1954

In the matter of :

1. Mr. Abhishek age 22 years s/o Sh. Prittam Kumar, r/o Village & P.O. Samtana, Tehsil
Dhatwal at Bijhari, District Hamirpur (H.P.).

2. Ms. Kanchan Devi age 20 years d/o Sh. Sunka Ram, r/o Village Jajri, P.O. Raili jajri,
Tehsil Dhatwal at Bijhari, District Hamirpur (H.P.) .. Appellants.

Versus

General Public



658 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947
Subject.— Notice of Marriage

Mr. Abhishek & Ms. Kanchan Devi have filed an application under section 05 of the
Special Marriage Act, 1954 alongwith supporting documents in the court of undersigned in which
they have stated that they intend to get married within three calendar months.

Therefore, the general public is hereby informed through this notice that if any person
having any objection regarding their intention, may file his/her objections personally or in writing
before this court on or before 05-05-2025. In case no objection is received by 05-05-2025, it will be
presumed that there is no objection to the intention of the above said marriage and the same will be
allowed accordingly.

Issued under my hand and seal of the court on 01-04-2025.
Seal. Sd/-

Marriage Officer-cam-SDM,
Sub-Division Barsar (H.P.).

9 3T A9 dedIeiaR Ud SRIGN SUSIIDRI, d8die YTy,
e ST (R0 o)

geheH F0 : 35 /NT/2025 IRIRG U : 25—04—2025

Y HAR F A I, Fardl g€ TR 4, M AT TR, SIRER AR, IR,
Tl UM qR, RTar &iTsT, 20 Wo |

CRlk]
3H STl
TIfAT—U AR &RT 13(3) T Ud Jg UoiiRoT A=A, 1969.
Y |AR gF A T, AR 96 TRR 4, WA GR™GN TN, SPER BAeE], TR,
dedlel gTeMQR, fTell SiTsT, f20 o o 39 wraferd H UreA—ud uer fhar & & ureff & =men

qG A AT TR, 96 TR 4, deAId UHYR H QP 07-01—2009 BT §g B, ol
JHEIfRIT U9 Yarad IRt @ f¥eRg ¥ g9 7 2|

31 379 $YAER §RT AIGRIRY ®I Frord fhar orar 2 fo 59 IR {6l fdd &1 a8
RTS8 1 98 f3AId 25—-04—2025 PI JeEN] Bl A&Ted H gde 11.00 dol BIOR B
U 3MYRT &S HRaAl Fhall & | & Jolk AATE By |l SoR AT oISl Plidel FHRIT 9 BT
T ureff & =er GRTR AR I ATH AT DI GG GoldRT & MY I U AR Bl
qiRd B e 9 |

e fadAT® 25—03—2025 BT BAR EXER d AR Afed SIRI fdhar T |

AER | FXARIRT / —
IId dedleleR Ud HRIGRT SUSIUDNI,

dedlel UTe™qR, f7err wivrer (fBo o) |




ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 659

9 3ITeld A9 dedieiaR Ud SRIGN JUSIIdHRI, dedial UieMyy,
fStetm ®iRTsT (fR0 Wo)

qHEHAT 0 ¢ 34 /NT/2025 AN el : 24—04—2025

qTegR, fSTer ®iTeT, 20 o |

ERIE
JATH ST-d

UIfAT—uF SMfAFRA GRT 13(3) ST Ud Hg USdbRoT M+, 1960.

T <dl g Fell M BT Ul AT g, ardl drevell, STheR RgyR WReN, dedid
UTAYR, Tl ®ATST, 20 o 9 59 Sierd H URiF—ua uer fHar & f6 withr &1 <=1 i

B, SIPER NGYR ARBRI, Tedl UTHYR H faih 28—06—1964 DI AT © olfchd Tl
I T RIER IRARI & 3Aeld 3§ of 7 2 |

31 Jd 3IATR §RT AR I Jfad fhar S g & 39 IR foshl aafad &1 o1 A0
RIS &1 ol a8 &l 24—04—2025 P SJEBHIEN] Bl aleld H Ja8 11.00 ol BIOR BB
3O+t STURT TS FRAT |WhdT B | 918 o g w18 fl IOR A7 ToRTS HIfde FHARIG | BN
T Urfeir & ST USTIRYT & 37Teel U9 Uard RIgYR SRGRT &l IIikd &R & SITgT |

e faA® 01-04—2025 BT BAR EXER d AR Afed IR fdHar 7|

AER | FRATRIRT / —
I TEdTIeR Ud BIIPBR] GUSTEhNI,
dedied ureyR, foter &ireTt (f2o Wo) |

¥ 3T A9 d8UIeaR U4 SRIGN JUSIEDRI, dedle TR,
e st (R0 o)

gebeAT 0 : 31 /NT/2025 ARG Ul 1 25—-04—2025

T s YA 930 offe, Fardl e 98, Srher ufSaREs, dedid UretdyR, STl HitrsT,
f2o "o |

SATH ST1dT

OrfAT—uF AR gRT 13(3) ST Ud & USITRYT A4, 1969.

20 o 7 39 ded H URIM—um U &A1 & b Uil @1 9 Mg a8, SIHER UiSARTs,




660 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

dedle UreMR H f3Id 20—01—1980 &I BT & olfdbs FRMEd UM Uadd USIRES &
SIECICICICE G I

31 3d 3YATR §RT AR Bl Jfad fHar Sam © 6 39 IR el Afdd &1 g W01
TaRTST 8 df 98 fQFid 25—-04—2025 BT SNSRI ®I 3M&Tdd H UI: 11.00 g9 BIOR BIdHR
3O+t SRy TS FRAT |WhdT B | 918 o g B8 fl IOR A7 TaRTS HIfde FHARIG | BN
TAT YTfT B ST USRI & IS UTH G UfSIRES BT UIRd HR & SITe |

e faAT® 29-03—2025 BT TAR EXER d AR Afed IR fdhar 7|

AER | EIETRT / —
g dgdicieR Ud HIIBRT SUSIIbNI,

Tl e qR, forer st (2o vo) |

9 ITGTed Y TSUIeGR U9 BRIGN SUSIEGRI, Tedied TR,
fStetr ®iRTsT (fR0 W0)

HbEAT 70 : 32 /NT/2025 TRIg UefY : 25—04—2025

2o Wo |

ERIEI
STH STl

UrfAT—uF JMfAFRA gRT 13(3) ST Ud & USITRYT A1, 1969.

ISl <dl g7 9 o, FaRil T 98, SR ufSIREs, dedld UTaHyR, Tl S,
%ouoﬁwmmﬁmﬁm—wﬁﬂﬁm%ﬁsm@mwwww STHER UfSARTE,
dedicl UlemyqR H f3Al 14—09—1978 &I B3N & olfdbd |HIFUd UM U UfSARES &

Ffrerg # T 7 2|

31d: 319 STABR §RT WAARIRYT HI Jfaa fhar onar & & 9 R ol aafdq & a8 A0
TORTST 8l 98 faAid 25—04—2025 BT SNSRI &I METAd § UIa: 11.00 g9 BIOR BIHR
3O JATURT ol HRAT Fhal © | 918 ok A1 BIg A1 ISR AT ToRTS Plfdel AT A BT
TAT IR & ST+ USHRRUT & IS TTH Garad IrSIRWS Bl UIiRd ) &I U |

el fadAT® 25—03—2025 BT BAR EXER d AR Afed SIRI fdhar T |

AR | FXARIRT / —
I TEAIeR Ud BrIBRT USRI,

dedle UreMQR, f7er wirsT (o 9o) |




ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 661

9 3[<Ted A9 dedielaR Ud BRIGN SUSIEHRI, dedle e,
St ®iRTsT (fR0 W0)

HheHT F0 : 33 /NT/2025 TRIRG U : 25—04—2025

UgET <dl g Gel SAre, faRT M o8, SIhER UfSIREs, dediel U yR, e BiTeT,
f20 "o |

ERIE
JATH ST-d

OrfAT—uF MR gRT 13(3) ST Ud 4 USITRYT A1, 1969.

ga <dl g1 a9l AT, Al Mg ofg, SrhER uiSIREs, el TR, fSTer ST,
20 W0 7 9 PRy H URMAT-UH U &A1 7 6 wiiir &1 91 a8, SIHER UiSARTS,
dedicl UlemyqR H f3Al 04—03—1976 &I B3N © olfbd |HIUd UM U UfSARES &

ANfYeRg H ool 7 7|

31 Jd 3IATR §RT AR I Jfad fhar S g & 39 IR foshl aafad &1 o1 A0
TaRTST 8 98 fQAid 25—04—2025 BT SEINEWERN I 3M&Tdd H UIa: 11.00 g9 8IOR BIdHR
3O+t STURT TS FRAT WhdT B | 918 o g B8 fl IOR A7 TaRTS HIfde FHARIG | BN
AT ISR & S ISRl & IS UTH Jarad UrSIRWs Bl uIiRd & & ST |

e faAT® 25—03—2025 P BAR EXER d AR Afed IR fdhar 7|

AR | FXARIRT / —
I TEAIeR Ud BrRIBRT USRI,

dediel UTeqR, f7err wirst (8o o) |

§ 3T A9 d8UIeiaR U4 BRIGN SUSIEDNRI, dedle ey,
e st (R0 o)

Hehed F0 : 38 /NT/2025 TRIRG U : 26—04—2025

fFEen <41 gE Sfern M g Uil #4l ’M, Fardl T geer (AREm), SIeER. ad,
dgdel ureyR, foter direT, 20 o |

ERIR
SMH oId

UrfAT—uF AfARIH R 13(3) ST Ud & USiTRYT A1, 1969.

ﬁﬁwé‘cﬁtﬁf%‘mwmﬁmﬁw Frarfl g gEer (WRATE), STheR G,
dgdilel UTeryR, RSTar ®ireT, 20 Yo 7 39 wraterd # uRiA-—ua uel fhar g & wifehar &1 o=




662 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

M gAY (FREMEN), STHER GIdl, Tedidl UTeYR H fQ71H 01—01—1964 BT AT B ifch AR
I A G & Ao # &of 7 2|

31 3d 3YATR §RT AR Bl Jfad fHar Sam © 6 39 IR el Afdd &1 g W01
UORTST 8 df 98 fQFid 26—04—2025 BT SENEWIERN I 3M&Tdd H UG 11.00 g9 BIOR BIdHR
3o+t SRy TS FRAT WhdT B | 918 o g B8 fl IOR AT TaRTS HIfde FHARIG | BN
T Uil & ST USIRYT & 3TTeel U9 Ui Gl i UTiRd $R A e |

e faAT® 29—03—2025 P TAR EXER AR Afed IR fdhar 7|

AR | FXARIRT / —
I TEAIeR Ud BrIBRI USRI,

dedle ureMqR, frerr wirsT (o o) |

9 IfTerd WEd FHTedt fgdi Siof, dediel givsai, forem sireT (fRo Jo)
3 F0 : 25 /C /NT /2025 arRrE uell : 24—04—2025

(fRo wo) |

SATH ST1dT

AT JHEAT——TH GO |

ot Aifes Rig g3 e o, faril e 4RA, sreer e, asdia gfivsw, e
FiTel (20 "o) 7 I IURYT 8IhR WHI—U3 M §o&il Ugd fhar 8 b uedr ga feu &
IO AgTel ke, dedlal giear & ifferg # el 9 I9aT am At Rig <o & 7 2

SIald I9d R Bl d U BIs g Whel THU-U3 H HAlfg=s 8 Tol &, Slifd IFHT Ael M
2| T TeNT—3TTT T8 81 o4 & HROT Uil &1 fedpdl b1 A1 BT Us Vel 2 | 3rd: ureff &1
e & & SWRITT afdid #eTa & oid IifAeRg § SHaT 99 Hifgs Rig Suam afe= Rig gof
fopar o |

31 FAATEIRYT $I GAdTs ©g doiRY STIBR d J JA6l gRT JfHd fhar San § &
39 AW ORI & Y H Bl UPR @1 SOR/UAR B d a8 fAid 24—04-—2025 B
IATATT I ThloAdd U BIBY JOAT TARIST ool HRA] Fhdl ©| SHd SR dls 49T
IOR / QRIS SR AT A BT ToH Urefl &7 1 YedR 9d feu, AgTe WRA & ok sffweld

e Rig @ oy Aiftws Rig St 7t Rig T o9 & oMy uiRd &R fed S |

3ITST T 24—03—2025 BT A BTEAER g AIER QT A SIRI 83T |

AER | FATEIRT / —
Fergd |ATEdl, fgdia siof,
dedier gfvsai, ftem swiret (fRo o) |



IIoTu=, fRamae US9n, 10 3, 2025 /20 o, 1947 663
g ITQTAd HeId FHTEdl fgdi Siof, deiia gftsdi, fSam wiTer (fRo o)

3 70 : 26 /C /NT /2025 arre ueft : 24—04—2025

TSI (20 Wo) |

SATH ST1dT

IAAT GHEH——TH GO |

urefl 4T HAR g3 Heel ¥, AR #eTdl feu IuRel, SihER RN, dedild givsdT,
e ®imer (fRo Wo) o Wi SURT BIR URMI—UF M oWl WA fhar § f& uear g9
feu & o /' U IwRel, dediiel Gl & SffWekd H Tefdl | S9&T A4 faer g fuar
HT AW A8 9 Heldl AR & <ToRd Aferd H IAGT W fawm gof &1 a1 § oafs S9a
IMER HTS, U HTS T Wl YAUT-UF, URAR IR el H IABI A4 9B FAR T U1 &7
AW HEel I qof ®, WiIfd TG 9 IHS AT BT AE A 2| QT STe-3eT AW B WM B
HROT weft BT feadmal &1 AT BRAT IS JET & | 3ra: Ul @1 omuE ' o "'t fou SwRien
RO el § DT A [dhrd HAR IUAM b g fOdT &1 A1\ Age] M U Hge] d2l
TS 3TER H IFHT 74 fAbr HAR UM e &< fhar s |

31T AR B GAdIs o Il $¥A8R G JHI GG g1 Gfad fHar smar & &
39 AW ORI & Y A Bl UPR & SoR/UAR 8 d a8 fAid 24—04—2025 B
SRATATT & geprefc U BIPR AUl TaRISl &6l dxal Fhdl & Iqb SR Bls Al
IR /RIS SR FARIT 5 8T dA1 Wefl &1 A Ucar gd feu & IoiRa Agldl U IuRell &
RIS W H BT A4 96T HAR UM fdbrT g fUar o1 A1 Hgel M U Hsel ai
BTl ATUR H IAD] A [ddh HAR IUAH [JBRT &6 B & 3 IR B Q. SR |

3151 feHip 20—03—2025 BT AR BXIER T HIER 3faTeld o SINI g3l |

AIER | TAERT / —
qERe AarEdi, fgdig s,
dedie givsar, Rt swireT (fRo Yo) |

g STQTAd HeId oIl fgaid o7, desd gftsai, fSear wiTer (fBo o)
& w0 : 27 /C /NT /2025 TR Ul : 24—04—2025

e oM gF famd e, Fear T U ggd, SiheR GRIA dedid giedl, e
FITeT (f20 o) |

SIMH oTd

AT JHEAT——TH GO |



664 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

urefl Y Jom g e e, Ml @'l feu gedlr, SieER gRM, dedid givsal,
et ®imer (fRo Wo) o Wi SURT BIR URMAI—UF M oWl WA fhar & b uear o<
feu & <Iora wETd feu ggen, dedid Ggivsdl & 3ifielkg H ol ¥ SHdT 9 JMWIRT HHR
ol B AT ® afh 9D SR FTS, U9 F1S 9 Wl YAN-UF H IfiNe 07 S5 ®, Siife
IHHT FE! M T | QT T3NS A 8 S & HROT Ui Bl faadl &1 AMAT BRAT IS <&
2| o urefl &1 e 2 fF SWiad aftfd At & Tod SifieRd § SH@T A AfiNE I1om
JUATH WG HAR ol (HAT S |

31 AR Bl GAdlS B IO $¥ABR G JA GG g1 Gfad bar mar & o
3 M e & G H el UER BT IOR/UARS B O 98 fQAie 24-04—2025 @
IATATH I ThIAdT U BIBY JUAT TARIST Gl HRA] Fhdl ©| SHd SR dls T
IR / UARTST SR A 1 81 7ol 9refl &7 79 9earR g feu & #erel U ggell & RIoid
AR H ARG HAR & IO 3AMAYD M0 IUATH AT HAR Gol B & ATQe IR B
fe S |

31Tl faie 20—03—2025 BT WX EXIER T HIER AaTeld A SIRI §aAT |

AER | FATEIRT / —
Fergd |ATEdl, fgdia siof,
dedier gfvsai, ftem swiret (fRo bo) |

g IIQTAd eI Tl fgdi Sl desiia gftsdi, fSar wiTer (fRo o)
& 0 : 28 /C /NT /2025 R Ul : 24—04—2025

(fRo wo) |

S oTd

IAAT GHEAT——TH GO |

urefl arofld e 9ot ¥, Al 98Tdl WRA ORI, STheR [97d, dedial gioear, el

BTl (fB0 W0) 71 WA SR BIR URIAT—Ua M %l URJd (AT & 6 Jear 9 &rd &
quﬁﬁ Tedd gear & sifierg # ol & SHGT 9M Ioild AR qof &1 14T 8
T D R BTe, U BTe T Whel YAV-UF 7 3rofid Rig g1 8, Siifeh a1 98l 14 ¢ |
QI AT A B S & HROT Urfl BT fIabdl BT AT BT TS 8T o | 3 urefl &7
AT T b SR afid #8Td & RISRd Al H IHHT T4 3folid e SUAM ASid HAR
Tl fhar S |

31d: FAATIRYT B FAdIs o IR $¥ABR G JH GG g1 Gfad Har mar & &
9 AWM ORIl & W H [BAl UPR BT SOR/UGRS B Al 98 fQAd 24—04—2025 B
INATATT I ThloAdd U BIBY JOAT ARG ool HRA] Fhdl ©| SHd SR dls 9T
IR /YRSl O F919d BRI T Uil &7 9 Ucar 9o ford & #etd ol & Iord




ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 665

AT H 375 AR & IO 3ol (G SUAM 37Sld HAR Tl BRI b MM UIiRd w2
SR |

31TS1 famiies 20—03—2025 BT AR BXIER T HIER 3faTeld H SN 83l |

AER | FAEIRT / —
TG qHTEdT, fedia o,
dedier gfvsai, Rt swiret (fRo o) |

g ITQTAd HeId Tl fgdi Siof, deiia gftsdi, fSam wiTer (fRo o)
P 70 : 29 /C /NT /2025 ARG UM : 24—04—2025

M <4 P R IW, AR a 9RE SIR1, STEER 19d, dErd givean, R it
(fRo wo) |

STH ST dAT

IAAT GHEH——TH GO |

orfefar AMT <A gE uRe XM, Fardl Mg WRE SR, STHER e, dedie
FiTel (20 90) 7 W IuRerd Biax UfAI—ua A §OKil Ud fhar © & uear ga o
GG HETd ITell, dediel gitsdr & ifielg # el ¥ S9dT 9| | <dl &l 8 Tam
Safh D MR FrS, U9 HIS 9 Thet THO—ud H A < g9t 7, Siifds SaT W&l AW
Tl TT—3Tel T A1 BT SIH & BRI UIRT BT fIddhd] &7 ATHAT BT U Y&l = | 37 ufeiar
amIE & fo SWRIgq aftfd werta & Wora iferd # IAST A W <dl STAE AW <@ g
o S |

g

S Yoy o)

31d: AR B FAdIs o IR $¥A8R G JH GG g1 Gfad Har mar & &
39 AW ORI & Y H Bl UPR @ SOR/UAR 8 d a8 fAid 24—04—2025 B
IATATH I ThIAdT U BIBY AOAT TARIST ol dRA] Fhdl ©| SHd SR dls T
IR/ TaRTST O FHR—IT 9 BT a7 YT &l 9| YcdR g el & Helel ol & RIokg
ffelg # AMT <l & SOl WHT <dl U AT <41 Tl B & M UIRT 3R 3T SR |

31TST &I 20—03—2025 DI WX IR g HIBR aTeld A ST §aTT |

AlE | FERT / —
qERe qarsdi, fgdg s,
dedle givsal, Rt swireT (fRo Uo) |

9 IfTed WEd FTedt fgdi Siof, dedier gfvsai, forem siret (fRo Jo)
@ 70 : 30/C /NT /2025 arRrE uell : 24—04—2025



666 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

(fRo wo) |

SATH ST1dT

AT JHEAT——TH GO |

orfefT g=aT1 <Al A WR ¥, Fardl JETe Y9 SART, STHhER e, dedire gived, e
BTl (fB0 W0) 1 WA SR BIR URIAT—Ua M %l URId (AT & 6 Jear 9 &rd &
RISIE HETd oTdl, Tediel gvsdl & Aok H Terl | IADI 9M §75 <dl gol 8 T § SIdidh
TP AR Prs, U7 Pdre g URIR IOReX § saT <d gof 8, Giifd SHHI Tl 7™ 2| o
JTT—3TeT M B S & HROT TR &l faaapdl &1 AT &A1 IS &l & | I1a: UTeir &
amrE 2 f& Swiad aftfa #era & Iora Ao § SEdET M ST <dl S g5, <4l Gof
fopar S |

31 FAATIRYT $I GAdTs vg dolRY STABR d JL J6 gRT Jd fhar san § &
39 AW ORI & Gy H Bl UPR @1 SOR/UaR B d a8 fAid 24—04-—2025 B
INITATH T ThTAd- U BIBY OAT UGRIST o dRal Ahdl 8| SO SUR g
IOR /UARTSl SR FAIA 1 BRI Tl YR &1 9 Uear 9d &/d & da8lal o1l & o

aiftrer ¥ g I B TOM TeT A SUAH TG AN o BY B A WRA B 2 AT |

3151 feip 20—03—2025 BT AR BXIER T HIER 3faTeld o SINI g3l |

AER | AR / —
Fergd |ATedl, fgdia siof,
dedier gfvsai, Rt swirer (fRo bo) |

9 IfTerd WEd FTedt fgd Siof, dediel givsdi, forem sireT (fRo Jo)
@ 70 : 31 /C/NT /2025 arRrE uell : 24—04—2025

(fRo wo) |

STH STHdAT

IAATT JHEAT——TH GOl |

ureff greia Rig g3 94 Rig, sl w8rd wREsl, SaeR o, dedia gitsa, e
BTl (fB0 W0) 1 T SURIT BIR URAT—UF M oK URId (AT & 6 Jear 9 &1 &
YO WEIA TREel 4 aeEs, dedld giedl @ sifierd ¥ Tad § Swd R B AW ARk
TSl B AT & Said 9B AER Ble, U BIe g gRaR IR § 949 RiE 91 8, Slif 0T
HE A 8| QT SIS A 8 O & &R Ui & fegdmdl &1 A &1 g IET ¢ |




ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 667

3. ureft &7 SMUE 7 fb SWRigddid #8ld & IJoikd If¥eig d§ SAd fUdr &1 99 o+ g
SUAM AFIRYT g1 fhar SR |

31d: AR B GAdIs B IR $¥A8R G J GG g1 Gfad fHar mar & &
39 AW ORI & Y H Bl UPR & SOR/UAR 8 d a8 fAid 24—04—2025 B
SRATSATT & geplefc U BIPR AUl TaRISl &6 dRal Fhdl & Iqb SR Bls 4l
IR/ YaRTS SR FAGd A 8 don urefl & fUar &1 9 ucdr g O/ & Held Begsl d
FCES & RO Al H WRIRY & IO A 48 IUAH 9RIRYT &6 B & ATQe UIRT PR
o IR |

31TST &I 20—03—2025 DI WX IR g HIBR IaTeld A ST §aTT |

AER | SATEIRT / —
TERIh aHTEdT, fgdr Sroft,
dediel givsar, frem swireT (fRo Yo) |

9 JTeT Hed wAedl fgdra Ao, e gfvsdi, foren sivret (fRo o)
& 0 : 32 /C /NT /2025 ARG U : 24—04—2025

AT AR Y gl S% a1, Fardl W fofg, SThER 'RAn dgdiel givsal, el
wireT (f20 Yo) |
ERIG|

JATH ST-d

IAAT GHEH——TH GO |

il el AR Y geT S a1, Fari Ta g, Sreer )1, dedial givsdl, el
Pl (B0 "o) 7 @ SURR BIhR URF—UF ¥ §ORIT UKId fba1 & b year 9a foaT &
NG JETd o, I8+ 9 Siolgs, dedid giedl & 3Afiekd H TTefdl ¥ SHEI A 31f+a
FHAR TSl B AT 2 & IS MR FIe, U9 HTe I Wt T3 § Hld FAR Tof 7, Silfd
IHBT WEl M9 B | &I ASTT—3IT M B G & BRI Urefl &bl fQaepdl &I AHAT BRAT TS BT
g1 o Uil #1 o § f SWiaq aftia #werd & Joa Sfier H SHeT AW A §AR
JUAH 3T AR ol fhAT S |

3Id: FAAIRYT Bl GAdls B IR $¥ABR G Y GG g1 Gfad fHar omar & o
3 M gERN @ R H Rl ISR B IOR/UARIS B O 98 Qe 24-04-—2025 @
IITIAT 9 ThladdT UY BIBY JOAT UaRISl o dRdl Adhdl 2| SId SWR dis ol
IR/ UARIST SR AT A BAT Tl Urefl &7 M UcdR 9d el & #eTdl fofgrd, asw @
SelEs & oG AT H A AR & IO Ald FAR IUAMH AMTA Tl B & Qe
aIRe R el SR |

31Tl faieh 20—03—2025 BT WX EXIER T HIBR AaTeld A SR §aAT |

AER | FATEIRT / —
Fergd |ATEdl, fgdia siof,
dedier gfvsai, ftem swiret (fRo o) |



668 ST, fRATeeT Yo, 10 31V, 2025 /20 I5, 1947

9 ISTod AEd FHEd! fgag vl Ud RieN qUSItan, dedld SR,
e sl (fRowo)

HebeAT w0 : /NT/25

Sh. Kewal Kumar s/o Shri Jit Singh, r/o Vill. & P.O. Chetru, Tehsil Dharamshala, District
Kangra (H.P.).

ERIE

SMH SId

T — oA T—u3 SR aRT 13(3) fRATEe ucer usiiawor rferfras, 1969.

AfeH g9 *MH ST |

Sh. Kewal Kumar s/o Shri Jit Singh, r/o Vill. & P.O. Chetru, Tehsil Dharamshala, District
Kangra(HP)ﬁwwﬁmﬁm—wﬁ%ﬁwwﬁm%ﬁaﬁﬂwm
01—01—1965 I B3I & UR=] THO 0 EHATAT /U Y=rdd /TR 9 H S Usiipd 71 © | 31
S Uoilgd B O @ ey Y ORI | 39 AR & §RT AW SFdl Bl 9T AR
TR B e far Srem & 6 e {6 B Kewal Kumar s/o Shri Jit Singh usiiad 6
S R Pl YARIST 81 Al 98 AU ToRTSl §9RI JAaTerd # fald 30—04—2025 Pl S TTa AT
JPTATT BIOR BIBR AU TARTST UL BR AHAT & AIAT D AULF—TF TH 01—01—1965
fafer doilepd fhd S R fTew Uik R a8 S |

3T fadTd 26—03—2025 BT TR EXIMER T HIE 3faTeld gIRT SRy o 77 |
AeX | BRI / —

PRIPBNT TUSTIETHNI,
qexret eerTe, Rrerr siTsT (fRowo) |

9 ISTod FEd FHEd! fga vl Ud RGN qUSItaN, dedld SR,
e sl (fRowo)

HehedT 0 : /NT/25

Sh. Gurukyap Tsering s/o Dawa, r/o House No. 198, Thardoe Ling Road near Norbu house,
Mcleoadgang Chakwan, Tehsil Dharamshala, District Kangra (H.P.).

ERIR|

SATH ST1dT

AT — o T—u5 SR GRT 13(3) fRATEe Ucer usiiaxor e, 1969.

e 9919 *MH ST |



ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 669

Sh. Gurukyap Tsering s/o Dawa, r/o House No. 198, Thardoe Ling Road near Norbu house,
Mcleoadgang Chakwan, Tehsil Dharamshala, District Kangra (H.P.) ¥ S 37aTerd # EITQj:lT—tB[
afed geed TR fhar € f6 W1 S feAie 15—-09—1989 B AT © R THO IO
HEITSAT / I Uad /R | # o1 dolipd 9 €1 eTe: gﬁ%ﬂ?@ﬁ?&@ﬁfﬁsﬁwﬁﬁ
SR | 39 A & §RT AR ST $I dqT FRIa \HHl & gred fear sar § 6 af
fHl @I Gurukyap Tsering s/o Dawa Gsiigd fhd S R $IS YRSl &1 Al 98 37UAT YavIof
TARI MTeAd H faAd 30—04—2025 BT IATAAH AT IHIAd- BIOR BIBR UAT Yool U &R
AHAT & FAAT YTl AYI—TF ST 15—09—1989 [ USiiepd by S dR JATQer IR R
& SR |

Mo fedi 27—03—2025 BT BN BEIER T HIBY 31STd gRT SINI b 13m |

AR | FXRIRT / —
PRIBRT TUSIEIBNI,
qesrel eHere, e siTer (fRowo) |

9 ISTod FEd FHEd! fgag vl Ud RieRN qUSItan, dedld SR,
e i (fRowo)

HehedT H0 : /NT/25

Sh. Santosh Kumar s/o Rasalu alias Bhala Ram, r/o Vill. Bandi, P.O. Naganpatt, Tehsil
Dharamshala, District Kangra (H.P.).

ERIE

SATH ST1dT

T —umeiaT—u= SR gRT 37(2) fEAMEe USw M ORI AR IR7 |

AfeH 999 *MH ST |

Sh. Santosh Kumar s/o Rasalu alias Bhala Ram, r/o Vill. Bandi, P.O. Naganpatt, Tehsil
Dharamshala, District Kangra (H.P.) = S 3TqTeld # wef=—ua |fzd HDEHAT QTAR fpar g fv W
T ST @1 97 15—-01—1986 BT s ©, U= UH0 HI0 EFRITAT /I ad # Hg uolidd o © |
31 3 USHipd b O & ey Q¥ SR | 39 AIeH & gRT W9 O+dl &l i Fwiad
TRl BT Gfad fbar S & fb afe {6 $I Rasalu alias Bhala Ram s/o Makaura Ram @1
4G Pl Uolipd fbd S R By UARIST 8 A 98 AU TaRTol AR 3f&lerd H faid
30—04—2025 P JAATIIT IT FbITdd BIOR BIDHR AYAT YaRTS U BR Hbell & AIAT GATdD

AU Hg el 15—01—1986 PI Usiipd By S R ATer UIRE &R e SR |

Mo fedi 27—03—2025 BT BN BEER T HIBY 31STod gRT SINT o r3m |

AR | FXARIRT / —
PRIBN] TUSTIEHT,

dedrel gFee, el s (fRovo) |




670 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

9 I7aTed Yol f¥er (fRoWov0) Herie Haredl woM it Ud dedicaR, SiTs],
dedd 9 e siTeT (fRovo)

et o TR SRINT IRRG Uy
40 /25 / TEH 22—03—2025 22—04—2025
41 /25 / TEH

urefl W RiE gF eE e, FEaRi 78 JfagediyR, SIdhER Algsl, dedld d el
®iTeT, 2o vo |

ERIEI

SATH ST-d

TIfAI—UF TR HRT 37(2) YT M, 1954 & F<Id A4 GO HRAM dR |

SR yrefl 9 Siiiewder] & 99l 9 ORIl 7g URM—UF Uwdd fhar | urefl gwr
e far 1 € f S fUar &1 A #eld U8, UedR g7 SfagealyR, dediidl d fTell HivTs,
80 w0 & RIoE Rears H 9@ Y3 Wsd, g Heldl AR YR g Tl H wUd, &ol o, Sllid
TAd & Safd 3 Srrerd ® ureft & fdr & 9 W o g3 wed, 43 g ° 7 9ife
|E 2| 31 YorRa Rpre § el M I g ®0Id, Bl IOY [O[H, SUAH Ad] IUAH UL
T 93 gsd g3 R &5 fbar 9y |

31d: FEATRRYT DI 9 AR gRI Gfad fbar orar & 6 g9 7 gowil ar f&dl @
DI TARTST B AT ANLTERIENT & FHET (a1 22—04—2025 BT BIOR 3MTHR AT YaRTS UK DR
Ahd © | FEiRT @l T6 TRt ure 7 8 R FREGER SRiaE] o|d § |8 SIe |

T feAip 01—04—2025 BT TN TR T AN 3STold gRT WM fhar a7 |

e | BRI / —
TEIG AHTEAT TqH 0y,
Uq dedldaR HiTs],

aeder @ Rt sireT (fRovo) |

9 37eTerd Yol A (fRovotio) Werasd waredl werd #iofl, deviial sivTs,

e sl (fRowo)
f’ger o THAH IRIG i
108 /2024 / T80 24—04—2025
i T CRIk RRgar Su=mm fSt<x amfe |

TfA—Ua THUM SR gRT fBov0 Y—IIoid Sg¥, qr9a 97 @rar 50 09, WA 0
18, WURT TTHIR 102, 103, 106, 107, 111, 111 /1, 112, 113, 137, 160, 188, 206 ,260 [l 7, Vehal
0—70—30 BFcAR, R HETT BIWR ol8s, G qHIYR, USAR g dHIYR, ST AT 201920,

SERIGECRS GRS




ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 671

$YABR /G HATa] |

SURIFT THAH YR $H If&TAd H O FAG o |yl RRaar Iuam i<y g3
BHY YA a1, Rrafser Rig, fawne R g3 @ gan) [Jfddr g= dRdR aw< J3 BHY G
Farfl 7eTd PR dMEs, AN THIYR, Tedid d Tl BITSl Bl $9 AaTald gRI F99 SN by
Y olfh I wfcraral BIfOR SfaTeld 9 o X2 8 | [y 39 37aTeld &l qui favard &1 gar ©
5 SIRIFd Ufardl &1 SIS AER T¥d | 9 8 Fdhdl o, A 39 SeIeR /AW ARl §RI

[aN

C o
NEIRECACIFRSINI

31d: JURIGT BRI BT 39 §IAeR §NT qfod fhar Srar € 6 a8 srrelas a1 adrerdq
fedip 24—04—2025 BT 91 TIUBY 2.00 IO INTBSEIRTNT BT ISTold § BIOR IMHY UAT TRTol
9 THUH IR U FR AHA © | BIOR T M &l FRa § FIAgaR uRi—ud R S1IarE! s/
T TS STU |

o1 fedi 22—03—2025 BT BN BEER T HIBY 31STad gRT SINI o r3am |

AR | FXATEIRT / —
TEIG AHTEAT TqH vy,
aedd BiTeT, far sirer (fRowo) |

9 37gTerd Yol ATy (fRovowo) Herasd waredi werd Aiofl, deilal BivTsl,

fStem wirsT (fRovo)
et o THIH SISECRCRIl
03 /2023 /T80 24—04—2025
04 /2023 /T80
Arfgex I Rk et <17 emfe |

A3 THHH SR GRT f20d0 Y—Ioid JfR=gH, qrad fH @rar [0 197, ™as o
274—275, GART TFR 169—170, fhdT 2, YPaT 0—03—84 BICIX I WIAT H0 196, AT -0 270
qm0 273, TET TR 167, 172, 173, 168, 171 &<l 4, IBa1 0—14—71 20 Rerd AgTal ReTaywy,
HIGTT Joi, UCaR g SINIYR, SHTEwal ATl 2020—21, dedlel d el BirsT |

SIAER /g3 F7a] |

SURTGRT THUH BRI $H AT H O T & | yearedi s Ira1 g3 TRy g3 o,
HexX I8 G SRAT GF goll, sN9c QU1 <d1 Ol 3eid BAR g ¥iae, Sl geeer <d g
AT g3 Goll, fd=_R HAR Y3 WA ¥ Y3 gRA1, A M g3 Goll Through Lr,s 9T 9w,
Yae AR, dofawl R4 JF 9 |d S Wi, |aRwsT, 9, vl <dl gERn e g3 gol
A AT F8Tdl BIIR dTEs, ANl daigR, dedid 9 Rar TS & $9 3f&Tad gk o
SR fy U Af Iad ufardy g1foR sreTad 9 o @ & | ROt S99 3reTad & gut favard &
o © & SWad Ifaard) &1 Stelle AR d&d § 7 8 Wddl ©, I 39 AR/ JE
AT §RT ARl &HRarg Sl & |




672 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

31d: IURIGT BRI BT 39 3IA8R §NT Grod fbar Srar € 6 a8 s/reras a1 aarerd
faFid 24—04—2025 BT 91€ QIUER 2.00 oI JENEAERT BT I[ETaAd H BIOR AMHR UAT TaRTST
9 dHUM IR U TR Fhd & | BN 7 3 & GRa H AR IefH-u3 R Sridare! Md
H oS S |

M1 fedi 22—03—2025 BT BN BEER T HIBY 3ISTad gRT STNI b r3m |

AR | FXARIRT / —
TEIG AHTEAT TH 0y,
aedd BiTeT, e sirer (fRowo) |

9 IfTed HerId FarEdr Yo ol JEvldeR, SRRETR,
St sl (fRowo)

HeheHT F0 : 23 /T8 /2025 g Ul : 05—05—2025

1. IIER R 93 wWo &0 a9 offel, Td 9 STHER Hdldd, dedid SRy, foref
BT, f2ovo |

2. Gagan Deep Kour d/o Prem Singh, House No. 278, Main Road Sohan Avenue, Court
Khals Amritsar (PB)-143002 - grefiToT |

* gfaTeToT |

1. 3 ST HETel HHlel, de¥ilel SIafigyR, forer wivs, f2ovo |

2. g g™ YHEd e, e SR, STl siver, 2090 |

AT — T T—U5 SR GRT 8(4) MY USHHRT ARAFTIH, 1996 & = USHHRIT B N |

LA GATCT M 3MH ST |

areiiRTor JerdR RiE g wWo N A9 dlel, Md 9 STHER Held, dedid SraieyR, el
FHiTeT, oo d W <9 BR AT YA 48, House No. 278, Main Road Sohan Avenue, Court
Khals Amritsar (PB)-143002. &d Uil IR Rig g3 @0 &7 I09 ol g 9 STHER |,
Tedlel SIARIEYR, ST SRTeT, f2ov0 -1 URiFi—ua &9 &fowar g o ¥l Afed g9 e
A ORI & b 9RI el f&Hid 29—02—2024 &1 A T S[HER HHll, Tedld SAREYR, T
FiTel, f2ovo ¥ f2=g Ay Rarsl & AR 7= g oY | «ifdhd =IW=ar & BRI §9 QT BT
GSIThRUT UTH Gardd Heldl § qol 8] BRal Fab & (ord Ui 3d Uil HRamT ared & |

3T T YA YAGI §RT M SFal ol giod fhar oren © b afe & aafdd &
o # I B TONBRYT IR BIs SoRk 9 TARTSl 8 o 98 S IfeTeld W SriTadT T
JHTATT BIOR BIHR T IolR IT TARIST (&1 05—05—2025 hlI T IfETeld § U B Adhdl




ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 673

21 ERR T 8F & §Xd 4 918 & fbdl A1 {5 &7 Pl SoR g TaRISl 81 G SIRATT @
USIIpRT & el Uike R e g |

3ITST &I 02—04—2025 DI WX FXIER g HIBR JaTeld GIRT SIRI §aTT |

AN | gTeTRe / —
HTRIBR] TUSIEHNI,
STARTEYR, fTelm SwiTeT (f2ovo) |

9 STQTeld Y dedlaaR U9 Heidd |amedl fgard Sioft, SiegR,
St wirsT (fRovo)
TRRG UM : 10—04—2025

A Tl U @0 30 Horg el FEaRT d SIS, STHER AR Ud Iu—dgdidd AT,
STetm wivTsT (f2ovo)

ERIR

3T ST T $USY, STHeR HWT Ud Iu—dedil ATeAYR, foterm sirst (fRovo) |

AT FAT! A ST aRA M USRI, SIHER AW T Iu—dqeddl ATTHYR, el HiTs
(fRowo) |

SWIFd fava & wed d uifdiar A el g w@o # dorg e, ARl g s7oew,
STHER AT Ud IU—dsdiel My, RTar wivTer ([Fovo) =1 ureis—u= Uer axa UriAEr & 2 f&
I ufd B g Q1P 08—05—2008 Pl I VS, SIHER MR, IU—dsdlel ATHYR H 83 o,
Afbe g8 ST & BRUT SIBT swalol UM GArId Idhig § gol Fal ®xdl 9 & | o
g rd S5t FHRaT arEd ¢ |

31 HIHATERYT Bl 39 JL GGl & Aegq 9 Ja (bar Srdr & b afe &A1 afad a1
uifelar & ufd Aoy I gF A g ol e @l gy faeih 08—05—2008 HT UTH UHTIT HeblE
H USRI B H PIg SMMURT IT QRIS 81 Al 983U Ul I B 39 JPHedAl &I Rl 2g
fFeafRa ffer o=l fA1® 10—04—2025 P UW: 11.00 I91 $H AT H JFATAT AT TabTerd
BINR ST URAT PR FHhdT @ IIAT BIOR 9 3 &I G H FRHIAMIR BRIAE! W\ H g
SITGHT |

3ITST f&=idh 15—03—2025 BT A BLIER d HIER AQTAd §RT SR 3T |
HIEw | BIERT / —

RIE dEdIlaR Ud Ae™d Jarsdi fgarg s,
YR, fSTer wiRTsT (fBovo) |

¥ I7QTAd S dedIasR U9 9@ wared fgara Siofl, ey,
St @ivreT (f2ovo)

IRRG U : 05—05—2025

g g g2 0 gl g 7o, FErdl a9 SThER WRT Ud SU—dgdiiel TR, foTet]
FiTer (f2ovo) |



674 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947
CEI

3T ST TG g TR aRSM Ud Su—dgdidl ATAYR, fSrer sirrer (f2ovo) |

L GG AT ST I T SIheR avSH Ud SU—dsdidl AR, STl HivreT
(fRowo) |

SWIFd v & ded d uriir yA Rig g1 i goi === <1om, il T g SreER AT
Uq IU—dgdd AR, RTar SRreT (f2o¥o) = UrefA—u= Ul ke Uil &1 & b SHaT o
&l 07—04—1984 BT T T TIHER AW, IU—TBUIA ATTHYR H §AT &, <ifb g8 IS B
BRI SHADT S4TI9 TTH GAIId Tas H Tol el dal 96 o | T Uiy 3@ g9 HraEr =msd
2 |

31T FAATEIRYT Bl 39 AT JATal & Add ¥ Giod fbar S © b afe faf) aafdd a1
grfelar us Rig g &1 qul e R0 & S [QAId 07—04—1984 DI UTH UARIT e H USR]
TR H PIS AMRT AT TARTS & AT 98 YT UeT @ B 9 GHedT &1 Ixd1 7g FwiRa fafr
ULl QT 05—05—2025 T UTKE: 11.00 g9 6 AT H AT AT Iblela BIOR DY URd!
PR FHAT © AT EOR 7 A Bl IR H FRAGIR SRIAE! 3/ H og S |

3ITST f&=ieh 01—04—2025 BT A BXAER G HIER JAQTeld §RT SINT 3T |

AR | FXATEIRT / —
A9 dedicieR Ud A8 adredi fgdig of),
ATerHYR, fSTerr wirsT (f2ovo) |

9 3T ARE dedieiaR U4 Wegd FHTedl fgarg Siofl, SieMyg,
St wirsT (fRovo)

TIRRG U : 05—05—2025

AT <l g1 i g@ M, Faril 79 9 S[heR ReM Ud Iu—dgdlel IMedqR, forefl
BrreT (fBovo) |

ERIR

3T ST TG g TThER IR Ud Iu—dedicl TeryR, fSrerm sirsT (f2ovo) |

S FAGT A ST 9T TG g SIHeR GRS Ud Iu—dgdldl AR, STl BidTel
(fZomo) |

SR f[qwg & e’ § withar e <dl g2l 30 g Im, Faril 79 9 Srher aReM
Uq IU—dgdd AR, RTar SHRreT (fRodo) = UeA—ua Ul ke Uil &1 & b SHaT o
Qe T® 18—02—1971 &I T 9 STHER dRSM, IU—dgdlel ATAAYR H T3 &, olfdhT I8 r=fsran
P BRU IABT STaI9 9 UAd SRS H Tol Jal HRdl 9@ © | O wifhr er@ g dwar
=TE |




ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 675

3T FAATEIRYT Bl 39 AT JAral & Aedd ¥ giud fbar S © {6 afe fah afad a1
oIfefT FAr <4 g 2N g M b S QD 18—02—1971 BT YT UARIT aREM H USHHROT
BRI H DIy AR T YGRS & A 98 AU UeT @ oG 39 Gbedl &l Rl vq FeiRa fafy
Uefl AT 05—05—2025 P UTE: 11.00 dof 3H ARSI H AT AT GhTela BTOR 3MMHR U=l
PR FHAT © IIAT BOR 7 3 B G H FIATAR HRIaE! e H A8 S |

31TST &1 01—04—2025 DI #X BLXIER g HIBR JaTeld GIRI NI §aTT |

AER | BETR / —
a9 dedldleR Ud A8dd AHEdT fgarg Sof,
YR, FSTer wiRTST (fBovo) |

9 3T A9 dediciaR U4 Weid dHrsdl fgara Siofl, SiTeMyg,
St sl (fRowo)

IRRG U : 05—05—2025

IR HAR A 09 I< G WHEI, Rl 19 drS, STEER MeHQR, ANl 9 Iu—dgdiel
AR, fS7etm BireT (fBovo) |

ERIR

3 ST IS, SU—dgdld JAMeHYR, Al Ud Su—dedid AR, rar st (fBovo) |

oAl FATGl 39 SiFal gl Held drs, Al Ud Su—dsdle JATeEYR, fTelr BTt
(fRowo) |

SWIFd f[awg & e’ H el 9w AR YF a4 av< 93 ), Fardl 7d dre, STaEr
MTHAYR, AT T Iu—dedidl AR, e TSl (fRowo) =1 IoRa aif¥del@ # 3fo< aM @l
ORI BRAM B YR U PR URAT Bl 2 b IHHT Fe! T/ dNw FAR 8, UR=] J8Tdl
drs, HIol Ud Su—dsdidl AR & Mora Rare # Uil &1 M Ad= AR eifdhd &, Sifd
TAd gof 2 | Uil w'Te die @ Iora RefS #§ o M &1 GORI drar @redl & |

31 HIHATEIRYT Bl 39 J A & Aegq 9 Jua fhar Srar & 6 afe e afed a1
areff T ¥ Rfd= HAR IUAM IR HAR Tol I H PIg SMART AT GoRTSl 81 Al 98 7T e
G B 98 JbeAT &l RAl g MR fafdy ol 396 05—05—2025 T WId: 11.00 a1 §9
RIRATI H I AT IhlaAd BoR URAl &R el © JAT BMOR 9 M &l JRA H

AR $RIAET 3Fd H a8 SITg |

31TST &A1 01—04—2025 DI WX FRIER g HIBR AJaTeAd GIRT SIRI §aTT |

I8} | FXTETIRT / —
A9 dedicieR Ud dgided adredi fgdig of),
3memyR, fretm wirer (fRovo) |




676 o0, fRHTaet USw, 10 31, 2025 /20 A3, 1947
9 31Terd Yol JAS (Rovow0) PRGN TSGR, dedia BT,

fSterm wirsT (fRovo)
et =0 TR SRINT IRRg Ul
14 / 2025 19—03—2025 22—04—2025

orfefar sl WRIST AR g WIEgd M 8T Uil Udd BAR, Faril Mg 9o, SThER
ANTE BITST, dedrdd a T &wireT, 20 o |

I
31T ST
TIfAT—UF SR RT 13(3) ST Td & USIaRl dR |

AN HITS], el g fS7ell BiTsl, 180 9o o Uri—ud 9ed S ARG USHeRoT U (6
T 7 UIRR g1 omuE fhar w6 S\ o fAId 20-08—1973 BT T T | oA Sad
ST IR U™ TR faaRT & Reére d ol 7 81 Fal | I I dRIG Bl &6l DR b 3Masl

SIRI by ST |

31d: HIATERYT BT $9 STAER &R o fHar Smar € & Sad T dRIG USiiRoT Hee
IR BT BT BIg TARIST &1 O QAP 22—04—2025 B TIUSR THI 2.00 Fo1 JENSHIERNI & THeT
BIOR SATPR (UAT YaRTST UG HR Aehal & | YRSl I 1 B @l qRa § UrRMA-IF W
MIATAR BRIATE! b1 ST |

3T fRHId 02—04—2025 BT AR &R T HIER 3METerd gIRT SIRT fdoam |

AER | FARIRT / —
gl ARHRT (fRouowo),
PTRIPBN] TUSTIETHNI

SESIGE USRS GIRCIRS (ﬁs’ouo)]

In the Court of Sh. Vikas Shukla HAS, Marriage Officer-cum-Sub-Divisional
Magistrate, Kullu, District Kullu (H.P.)

1. Mrs. Sushmita Roka Magar d/o Shri Dhanpuran Roka, r/o Gram Panchayat Bhume,
District Rukam East, Nepal presently residing at Village Huran, P.O. and Sub-Tehsil Jari, District
Kullu , Himachal Pradesh.

2. Ravinder Kumar s/o Sh. Puran, r/o Village Huran, P.O. and Sub-Tehsil Jari, District
Kullu, Himachal Pradesh ..Applicants.

Versus

General Public



ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 677

Subject.—Proclamation for the registration of marriage under section 15 of Special Marriage
Act, 1954.

Mrs. Sushmita Roka Magar and Ravinder Kumar have filed an application alongwith
affidavits in the court of undersigned under section 15 of Special Marriage Act, 1954 that they have
solemnized their marriage on 13-03-2024 and they are living as husband and wife since then, hence
their marriage may be registered under Act ibid.

Therefore, the general public is hereby informed through this notice that any person who
has any objection regarding this marriage can file the objection personally or writing before this
court on or before 03-05-2025. The objection received after 03-05-2025 will not be entertained and
marriage will be registered accordingly.

Issued today on 03-04-2025 under my hand and seal of the court.

Seal. VIKAS SHUKLA, HAS,
Marriage Officer-cam-Sub-Divisional Magistrate,
Kullu, District Kullu (H.P.).

In the Court of Sh. Vikas Shukla HAS, Marriage Officer-cum-Sub-Divisional
Magistrate, Kullu, District Kullu (H.P.)

1. Shiloni aged 27 years d/o Shri Ram Dyal, r/o Village Karchhari, P.O. Sharontha,
Tehsil Rohru, Distt. Shimla, H.P. at present residing ¢c/o Mohan Lal Shashni, Shashni Niwas, Green
Piece Colony Dhalpur, Tehsil and District Kullu, H.P.

2. Akash Mehta aged 33 years s/o Sh. Jayesh Kumar, r/o Block No. 9/A, Kadiyavad,
Timba Fali, Jamnagar, Dhrol Jamnagar, Gujarat at present residing c/o Mohan Lal Shashni, Shashni
Niwas, Green Piece Colony Dhalpur, Tehsil and District Kullu, H.P. ..Applicants.

Versus
General Public

Subject.—Proclamation for the registration of marriage under section 15 of Special Marriage
Act, 1954.

Shiloni and Akash Mehta have filed an application alongwith affidavits in the court of
undersigned under section 15 of Special Marriage Act, 1954 that they have solemnized their
marriage on 01-04-2025 and they are living as husband and wife since then, hence their marriage
may be registred under Act ibid.

Therefore, the general public is hereby informed through this notice that any person who
has any objection regarding this marriage can file the objection personally or writing before this
court on or before 03-05-2025. The objection received after 03-05-2025 will not be entertained and
marriage will be registered accordingly.



678 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947
Issued today on 03-04-2025 under my hand and seal of the court.

Seal. VIKAS SHUKLA, HAS,
Marriage Officer-cam-Sub-Divisional Magistrate,
Kullu, District Kullu (H.P.).

T TENIIGR Ta¥ WEd |ATEdr yeH Siofl, dsvsid,

fSTer {ust (fRomo)
e HeR 20 /2025 TRIG HRG3M : 02—04—2025 TR UefY : 22—04—2025
A Xoivs Rig e[ g3 1 Sad Rig dieM, Marl #8d ugl, SIeER s, dedid
FeqsTd, forerm AvST f2o Ho et |
CRik|
3 ST - BRI |

EEECIKSECICENEGIE] g‘b{‘\'lr\ll

£ ot g e[ g 2 Saq Rig diem, Maril 98 ugl, SieeR garg, dgdiel
Tevele, e AvEl 2o W0 7 £ 3ered H faid 02—04—2025 BT URAT-UF UKT R Y
U UrRIAT-ux H e fhar g & uredl &1 arafds am o g dieE § 9 el & fuar
P ARAAD T IaH [{iE deH B, g el 1 AW 6 el JETe ugl § Mol (g
eff & far &1 A ToRa Afed HETa ST H Id9 Gl @l @l §, Siifd Told qof g3l |
greft | e URfA-ua & \HE H QAT UF AddHl, Adhd IOl X9, WEIVT U, U9 aTs,
U3 SRS, URIAIC 9 MR dTs A1 Hold R I 8 | 31d ureft 7 o/ 9 3= fudr & A
P GORIT B AT UIRT PR 8 AT AT & |

3 T TIWER & ARYH Y HIQERY M SHar b Grod fhar Siar 2 & afe e
fHT DI IO Mg FgTA geT § Uil &1 9M o= Rig & @I R o= [Kg di'E g3
s Ia9 Rig dieM, Faril 981 Ugl, SheR g, dedid develd, foien #uel, f2odo @ ureff
& fOdT &1 9 I & WF R Iad9 g die g3 o1 o, Fardl #gte ugl, SthER o,
dedld devsrd, fferm 7vsl fRo¥o & M SO &R 9R H HIS SR /TARIS & d I8
IATATT AT IhTAd TRIG U 22—04—2025 BT 10.00 g9 UTd: H AETld § BIOR BIBR YT
IR/ QRIS U PR Fhdl © | TGRA RSN UhaRbl HRIare! Al H s Sgdll 3R A/
ORI IR DAY TR B Y 10T |

YT IATR AT &I 02—04—2025 I WY TWIER g AR Ald MQTed H ST Tl |

AER | FARIRT / —
TERIS ST Herd Sroft,
Tesvsrd, fterr Al (fRowo) |



oS, fRATad gew, 10 e, 2025 /20 TF, 1947 679
WA TENIIQR Uaq WER® |ATEdr yod 2iofl, aesvsid,

fSTer {ust (fRovo)
e JaR 21 /2025 TRIG HRG3M : 02—04—2025 AR U : 22—04—2025
Sl fqmar e gl 80 ‘roive RiE @, Farl 98a gl SieeR g, dedid
Teveld, forer 7usl, f2o vo B IRRI
CRIC|
31T ST  HHEITH |

EEECIEKSECICNEGIE] g‘b{‘d{\ll

e fagen =i g A1 ois (g @ier, Farl 98 ugn, SeeR gars, dedie]
Tewele, e Av€l f2o U0 7 £ aered H faid 02—04—2025 BT URMA-UF UKId R Y
Ut UrRiA—ud H e fhar € & uifdian &1 arafds M f[d9ar die &, uR=g wiiehar &1 =M
RIS Afelg HeTel Jore ¥ fader <dl <5 8 gl &, Siifd Told a5 gl & | WIiefan =1 3o
Y- @& G # IMATgd U daidI, Tdd ORI k9, eI UH, U9 s 9 MR &S
AT o™ H) W T | 37 WA 1 U A @7 O B M IR BT 7 MIE fHar 7 |

3 T TTER & ARYH Y FIQERY M SHar b Groad fbar Sirar 2 & afe e
AR BT TORG AMeRg AT Jalle H U &1 94 a9l <dl & IF R 9 diee oo
3 ol RYE =M, Mari J987d Ugl, SIheR o, dedid dedsid, [STel 7l 20 "o & 9™
ORI B IN BIg SOk /TORIS &1 Al I8 ATl I JabTelds aeRg ULl 22—04—2025 BT 10.
00 do1 UId: 9 QTed ¥ BIRVR BIHR AUAT ok /TARTS U9 HR AHhdT & | TRd IR

ThRWT HRIATET A H Tg SITEHT 3R A GOl IR & MM YIRT HR 37 ST |

UE IABR TSl &I 02—04—2025 BT WX TKIER d HIE A AaTeld ¥ ST g3l |

AR | FEIRT / —
TERIS ST Herd Sroft,
Tesvsrd, fterr Aver (fRowo) |

I T TeUIER Ud BrABRI SUSINERI, deviia foan, e Reer (Rovo)

ST dRAT 9T W@o 271 s, Mardl wmesr, SrheRr gdrar, dediel AT, e Rmer
(fRomo) - grfeaT |

ERIk

JMH S9dT UG UTH Yad SaNgre ST, fAerg @ve fSanrT ~ gfara |

fava —s1 / gg Yy gfdfte IR |



680 IST93, fRHTeeT U<en, 10 o¥ie, 2025 /20 <3, 1947

WWﬁWWWWWﬂW,WW?EW
TS AT 575, fah 24012024 & HIH § UK S¥draSl A (1) R dofiawor (o
Ud 4g) g fafboar sfgerl us E&a1 Thaouhoveio /S Td 9o / G010 / 2025—01—575,
fai®  24—01—2025, (2) ¥UI—UF IMMEfRH, (3) YUT—Ud AR <8, 4) Jg RUrE,
(5) ST YHTIT-UZ, (6) MR TS d AUY—UF SN AT <dl Uil g M, famsdr +iq,
SIPER T, Jedial o, forem Rmer 2o vo @ wruer—uey i dwrg M YF (g, Hari
HId, SIHER WRIel, dediel f3anT, e Ran, fRovo e amafded st kA g3 w@o 2Ry
g, Faril e, STeeR gare), dedia f3anT, frar Rmar (fRovo) o+l Ay @& Jog fafer
=gl SR ¥ Y=RId AfWelkg H Tol BT | 8 g © | YR Ya—d & S / Jg Uil
RFSReR ¥ amafeat sic kA g w@o 21 Rie, farfl e, SR gar<d), qgdia feam,
orer Rat, f2araer ucer & Aar o 9og [ 61 9 88 © ol FRMgaR e 2| 59 fawy
DI gite Tu—ux g SR S RUS S 919 /g JASRT REST 7 U+ A9 H&T Sl (i
24—01—2025 HI NI BT & H & T |

31d: HAATHRY B §9 AllCH & Argd I Jrad fBar Siar © b sl der g2 w@o
fe=1 Rie, Frardl omew, Sreer garey), dedia feam, Rrar Rmer (Bovo) &1 Ay &1 9 fafy
10—02—1993 S Ud Fg USIIBRYT SAFTIH 1969 &I €RT 13(3) & WAL & I<(Id Gardd &
[T oG 3feET [Tl R Uoiiarvl (G Td J1))) & 31fWeld # ol B & Qe
qiRa fd oM g1 oPR & &1 39 g%y H @l MUy 8 df 98 o9 3elad § Hifed
(STTER) & O 89 & Udh A8 & HIaR 379+ 3MURT g1 dHral Ahar 7 | ferilRa srafr # smufy
A B YRA H Smafadt s kAT gE w@o 3R e, MR wman, sieER |, dediel
oA, fSem Rrrenm (fRowo) @1 Amar @ Jog i wwfd iferg § g1 &9 & o7Teel I
UgTId g qavrere ®f UiRd &) Qg S |

31ST &I 05—03—2025 DI WX BXIER g HIBR 37aTeld Afed ST §aTT |

AER | FRIRT / —
TEATER Ud BRIBRT USRI,
aexre feamT, Rrer e (Rowo) |

g IMETAT TEHIER Td BEIBRI ITSIRHERY, qedid foamT, Rrer Rmen (fRovo)

s ARM AT gF W0 M, 9T UM A, S[GER WIS, dgsie fanr, e Rmer
(f2omo)

ERIE

JMH SI9dT UG U YT BHiE, dedid [SanT faer Tvs feanT - gfara |
fava——sr / 3g fofYy gfafte qry |

gﬂwﬁsﬁﬁ&aftﬂm TSR Mﬂwﬂﬁw,mﬁw$m
Ui AT 576, [GAIh 24—01—2025 & ARIH H UIK SXAASl B (1) [T USHHROT (ST
Ud 7g) g o AfeRl U3 H&al TEoUhoudo /S Ud Heg / TH0EI0 / 2025—1—576,
fafid  24—01—2025 (2) TOI—UF oMAH, (3) TUY-UF qR=IE <8 (4) g RO,
(5) SMHTAT YATI-U, (6) 3MIR HIe d IJUA—UA siFcl AT <! el o M, Farfy +iq,




ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 681

SIPER WRTeT, el f3am, frer R 2o Yo 9 wvo—ua s ®ed X9 Y (g, Hard
I, SThER URTel, dediel AT, 7 Re, fZovo foR ardesd s jIvM otel g3 @0 <7,
JrAT I FHA, SHER WIS, dediad f3amT, fSen Rear (Bovwo) oo @8 w@o &4l & 99
ﬁrf@{ﬁﬁprmwunﬁudludaﬁéﬁﬁaﬁwﬁﬁﬁﬂé%lqﬁmﬂﬂW?JHE%GFH/W
USlIpRoT ISR H 3facd N e ol g3 W0 IM, aRil UM G, S[HER WRIel], dedie]
farT, Rrem Rmer (Rowo) @ <y @ Hg R oof 7 g & o FEEER st ¥ 3w
v @1 gic wrug—ux 9 SIRT 9 RUIE Sl 99 /50 JAEeRT REar = 310 Qe J&al i
ot 24—01—2025 BT INT g3 & ¥ @l 2|

aﬁzﬂﬁﬂwwﬁsﬂﬁﬁﬁvzﬁwﬁq%ﬁmwﬁ% EIINE
M, 9l U9 G, STHER WRIT, dedidt f3anT, [ Rmern (fRovo) & U+l drg
fafr 02—04—1988 =1 UG HY USHHRUT AR 1969 B &RT 13(3) & WEeHl & st
TR & I Ao drerar Rrar Reer toiiaxer (G vd 4g) @ e § Tl B B
ameer uiRa oy o €| oFR ol &7 59 v § BIS 3MURT &1 a1 98 39 S1eTald H AIfew
(STTER) & SN B89 & U A8 & HIaR MU= 3MURT o a1 Aahar & | FeilRa srafer # smufy
T A B GRI H 3MMAGH 3N A AT YF W0 I, I UM G, SHER WIS, g ST,
ot Rar (fBovo) &1 drg o BT & g [ 02—04—1988 &I o /HY ol wwafara
AIfferg # TS B B QY UTH UaTId Afd o b aTRd B & SIE |

E46

323
A 8

31151 faTip 10—03—2025 BT A BKIER g HIEX JHaTeld Afed SINI 83Tl |

e | TR / —
dedTeleR Ud BIRIBRI SUSTIEBNI,
aedrer foan, Rrem Rerer (Rowo) |

9 AT TedIIER Ud HrIGRI SUSIPGRI, devdia foanT, e e (Rovo)

s AE AT GF WO IM, IR UM P, SIHER WA, dedid AR, fen R
(fRowo)
Ty |

H

M AT T U YarId ®HiE, dedla fSanT faerT @vs feunT - gfardy |
fava —a= /9g fafer ufafke qr|
wwﬁmﬁaﬁﬁwmww%w,ﬁWWFﬁm

qSSihe AT 575, [QId 24—01—2025 & AEgH I YT SAASl pAer: (1) RTar usiiaser (G
Uq 7)) g fAfecdr AfeRl U3 H&al TEouhoudo /S Ud HeY / TH0EI0 / 2025—1—575,
fafi®d  24—01—2025, (2) TOUY—UF oEEH, (3) TUA—UF AIR=IA <8, (4) g R,
(5) SMUTRIAT YHTIT-UZ, (6) MR TS d UY—UF ST AT <dl Uil g <M, famsdr +iq,
SIHER WRIEN, dediel f3anT, fSrar RMar 20 o a wru—ver i &erg I YF g, Fari |,
SIHER URTAT, dedlel AT, forar Ruver, fZovo RS aidesd sl RM & g3 @0 ¥, il
I A, SHER WRIE], dediad AR, [Sen Reern (Bovo) o+l AT 30 gaur &l Jeg fafey
10051990%W@Wﬁ?@ﬁ3ﬁ3ﬂﬁ@?€%‘%| IRV deRd &
ST /g USlIpRUT RGTRER # 311 R el §& W0 M, aril T &, S[heR WRIel, dedild




682 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

e, e Rrgenm (RBovwo) &1 #1am @1 9 ffy g1 7 g8 © o FAER siferd €1 59
fawa @1 gftc wru—uz g IR 9 RUE S 99 /5 SeR REar 9 U+ ey | §f
el 24—01—2025 BT SR 3T & H BT 2 |

37 AIATIRYT T 39 Afed & Ad ¥ gfad fBar Siar & & s em ofre g3 o
M, IR U P, STHER WIS, dedia 3anT, frar Rmer (Bovo) & u+l /e goar &1 9
fafer 10—05—1990 S Td HI USHHRYT AMAFRH 1969 HI ORT 13(3) & UE@El & I
AR & eI e drerar Rrear Reer toliexr (G Td 4g) @ e § ol B B
eyl yIRd Py o9 2| 3R fhefl & 59 9 § PIs 31Uy 8 d 98 o9 3erad d Ifed
(STTER) @ WY 89 & U AIE & AR U= 3MURT &of Hxar Ahar & | FeilRa smafey # smufy
T 3 B GRA W 3Adad A e AT Y @0 M, ARl UM A, SIHER WRIS], dedlel [SAMT,
fSrerr Rfetr (fRowo) @1 AT @0 FAuT &1 7Y At 10—05—1990 &I 59 /FY Al Awfd
JAfeRg H TS B & AT UM YR A(d o BT UTRa B & SIE |

31TST &I 10—03—2025 DI WX BXWIER g HIBR 37aTeld Afed ST §aTT |

AER | FRIRT / —
TEUIIER Ud BRIGR! SUSTIEGNI,
aexre feamT, Rrer e (Rowo) |

9 AT TedIIER Ud BRIGRI SUSINGRI, dewdie foanT, e e (fRovo)

S ANRIST GF W0 ST M, IRAT 41, STHER WRTelT, dgdid feamT, frar Rmar (fRovo)
©are] |

ERIEI

I 44T U UTH T=Id oid, dedld fSarT faera @ve faanT - yfoarar |

fava —a= /9g fafer ufafke qr|

9 JErdd W SffaRad Rfar IWRgR o1 a3y Rmern, Rrar Rmenr & e
JSidhe AT 576, fAIdH 24—01—2025 & ARgH ¥ U ISl Haen: (1) RFar gsiiaser (S
Ud 7)) g o SRl U3 H&al TEouhoudo /S Ud Heg / TH0EI0 / 2025—1—576,
fafid  24—01—2025 (2) TOI—UF aMdcdH, (3) TUA-UF AR=IA <8, (4) Jg R,
(5) SMHTHAT YATII-UH, (6) IMUR HIe d IJUA—UA sfFcl AraT <! ol org M, Farfy +iq,
SIFHER WIS, dedia fan, fem Rer fRo Wo  wruer—uer sit o3 9 g3 o, Fard w14,
SIHER URTSAT, dediel f3anT, fen Ran, fRodo foReH smaed ol IRl g3 w0 1 519 IM,
AT HId, STHER WRTell, dgdra f3anT, foren Rar (fBovo) o a1l &1 gg ffer fh=gl drRon
A AT AfeRg H &9l B W B g o | URUHG: UEd & O /HQ USITeRUT IeR |
s AN IS gF Wo S S M, IR A, STHER WRIel, dedid fean, frer Rmen (fRovo)
T @ g fafdr <o 9 g8 @ o FemreR et 21 59 vy 9 gfie w3 9 o o=
R S 97 /9g BRI REar =1 10 Qe 61 ST fadie 24—01—2025 &1 SR 83l & +
BT




ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 683

31d: AIATIRYT DI 39 AlfcH & Aegd ¥ Gfad fhar smar g 6 s anr 1 g3 w@o 3h
ST M, I 4, STHER W, dedrd foan, e Reren (Bovwo) @1 I @1 wg ey
20—12—1997 T U4 HSJ USIhHRUT ARTIH 1969 B &RT 13(3) & @€l & A=<vid Uardd &
TR srferE sierar Rt R dofiaxer (T T 9) & el # GO &xd & ey
oRT 5 o €1 R -l &1 39 AR # P IMURT B ol 98 39 oiEred H Aifed
(STTER) & OINY B89 & U AIE & AR MU= 3MURT &of HxaT Ahar & | FeilRa srafey # smufy
T A DI GRA H 3MMAed S ANRIGT GF W0 1 S M, IR A, SIhER URIell, dediel ST,
fSrer Rrgetr (fRovwo) &1 <1<T @0 @RIl & Jg Ay 20—12—1997 &I o1=1 /7g Tl wwafaa
AT H &1 B D IS I Uad Afad o d1 IR &R & e |

31TST &I 10—03—2025 DI ¥R BXIER g HIBR 37aTeld Afed ST §aTT |

AER | FRIRT / —
TR Ud BRIGR] SUSTIEGNI,
dedre fean, e Rrrer (Rovo) |

g IIETed deYIeeR U9 BRIGRI SUSIRGR, dewdie f3anT, fer Rrrem (Rovo)
(fZomo)
I

ERIEI

MM ST UG UTH YaId doli, dedldl oA, faer wue fean - yfoarar |
fava ——s1 / 3g ffYy gfdfte 9|

9 IElad H SffaRad el IVRER o\ vd gy e, e Rmen & wraie™
Ui AT 998, QT 18—02—2025 & AEIH H UIK &Gl HALl: (1) T USHdHR0 (ST
Ud 7g) g fAfec Aferl U3 H&aT TEoUhoudo /S Ud Heg / TH0EI0 / 2025—1—998,
faTT® 18—02—2025, (2) WYI—UH 3MIEH, (3) TYUT—UF IR <8, (4) G RUIE, (5) FUT=IAT
AU, (6) 3MUR HIS d AU 31 I Rig YF Fell M, IM A<, UaId Ioll, SIHER
fearett, dedier farT, fSrem Reer f2o wo g 30 Sdl M g3 101, Farfl dr<dll, STHeR g,
dedier farT, fen Ran, fRodo, s wRIqH gF i U=iT o U+ fUdT %o uf+im ™ &l 9y
ffYy fF=l dRUT | daRa iferd # &9 & 9 I8 S & | URUHS: dEad @ o /99
GSIThRUT IO ¥ 81 RiIad gF &1 u=iin @, fHardl Jreel, SideR fearel, dsdia foam,
e Rmar (fRovo) o firar @t 7y fafyr <f 7 g8 @ &1 Fomger aiffard | g9 faw @t
gfe wu—ud g ORIl O /qg RUIE Sl O /9g AR Refell = 3o+ 3feel &l Sl
famTd 18—02—2025 BT TINY oM & | &Y T |

31 IR Bl 349 Afed & Arad § gfad far Srar € & s _Riaw g3 o oo
M, =D AT, SeER fearen, dedia f3arT, e Rmren (Rodo) @ sraw fdar u=iam M @l
A Al 04—11—1995 ST Ud HG USHARYT AR 1969 BT €RT 13(3) & U@l & A=<id
UATId & AU AerRd JAal T RIETe UsiiaRel (S Ud ) & Afeld H &6l $R &
ameer uiRd oy o €| 3R el &1 59 Fwae § BIg 3MuRy & a1 98 39 IreTad § Aifew
(STTER) @ O B89 & U AIE & HIaR 31U+ 3MURT &of AT Ahar & | FeilRa srafer # smufy




684 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

TS B GRA H D 1 TRidH YF A uEr M, Fardl Jredn, steeR fearddl, dedier
foamT, fSem Rrven (fRowo) @1 9g [y 04—11—1995 &I ST Al TR s # To &-A
% I YT U A g7 DI giRd HR & S |

37T {1 10-03—2025 BT WX BKIER T HIBR AaTeid Al ST g3l |

AER | FRATRIRT / —
dedTeleR Ud BIRIBNI SUSTIEBNI,
aedre fearT, R Rrrer (Rowo) |

g IISTAT TEHIIGR Ud HRIBRI IUSIRHER), dedia foanmT, Rrar Rmer (RRovo)

ST TRl YT 31eH M, A Riars, dgdia feam, frer Refer (f2ovo)
ot |

ERIE

MM ST Ud UTH Yad die R¥rams, far, faera wvs feamT - yforarar |
fava ——s1 / 3g fofYy gfdfte 9|

9 3Elad H SffaRad el IVRER o\ vd gy e, e Rmen & wraie™
Ui AT 1822, falih 21—03—2025 & HAEH H YT SXATdSl A (1) FTel usiieror (S
Ud qg) g ffecdr sfgarl ol §&dl Thouhouelo /S Ud qg / TH0SI0 / 2025—-03—1822,
fais  21—03—2025, (2) TUI—UF AP, (3) TUI-—UF dANR=IH <B, (@) g R,
(5) SMUTRIAT UHIU—UF, (6) 3MUR dle d WU il HHA Y31 ATeH M, Fari R,
dediat o, e Rrferr (fRodo) @ wu—uer s = XM F ST ¥H, Faril 9oR1, SR
Rretes, dedla feam, fSen Refer, fBodo @ s < (M gF 8w, UM AR, SIHER (R,
Jedier farT, fen Rman, fRodo, 5= fafYr f= dRON ¥ d=maa 3ok # qoi &’ ¥ B
g 2| IRV Gargd & O/ Jg USTRYT ISTeR ¥ Jfrafadl Sl wHerer g1 Jed I,
fraredt Rrems, Tedier f3arT, fSen Rmar (fRovo) &1 o o fafYy <1 9 g8 © S FRIAgaR
a1 59 fawg &1 gfte eue—ux 9 SR o9 RUIE S &9 /g 31Nl REer = a0
3T A& S e 21—03—2025 BT SIRY B3 & H &l 2|

37T TAARIRYT BT 9 AIfCH & Ard | qfad fFar Srar 8 6 sfiwcht s 4= smeH
M, FardT Rreirs, dedia farT, Rrar Regem (Bovo) &1 S fafr 07—12—1985 &+ Td 7Y
GoliRoT AR 1969 &1 ORT 13(3) & WG & 3 Udrdd & af=id Iferg aferdr
e M doflaxyr (G Ud 9g) & el § o 3" & 3ey WIRT fhd oM €1 oFKR
¥l B $F A H BIs AMURT B O 98 39 If&Tad H AICH (SIABR) & SR & & U A8
% IR 3O ATURT &S HRAT AHaT & | MEIRT @ # MUY T 3 & JRA H MMl
S HHerel GAT red M, Faril Riars, Sieer Riems & o1 fafdy awfd sfde 3§ go
B DAY IH UArga Afad Riamrs o aikd & & S |

31TST &I 05—03—2025 PI WX BXIER g HIBR 37aTeld Afed SINI §aTT |

ATER | FXeIRd / —
TEATER Ud BRIBRT USRI,
dexre feamT, Rrer e (Rowo) |



ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 685

9 I7STeld AEd FaTEd! g Sofl, dediel QR gRIeR,
fSte Ran, Bamea uew

qre AT ¢ 02 /25 TRRG TRIR : 05—03—2025

1. Sl HARAT <dl gl wolid AR, FarRl Ta g S0 T_YR MYR, dedld 31,
ISGIBSEIR(ERED) gt |

SIEECERI BRCINCIC
v ——urel—v3 919d TR uRYg AR JJ TONHRT IR |

I8 R AT FARAT <dl Tl Holld AR, ﬁaﬂﬁwaaomwamﬁa
o, 1 ST (R0 o) ¥ 39 Prafers § e ae AR G g2 o AT R YuUT bl g
WWWWﬁﬁwwaﬁﬂwawmﬁm%lm@m#mﬂ
fpar 8 6 <9 7 819 & PR g8 AU g8 DI gog Al B Goiiepror TR gRug EQR A Tof
T B G | wIieRr 31 989 @ gg fafy fre1 g —

Y =T qIffAT P 8 BT M ARRY Y

1. AR Gar GAT 30 57 9T o 05—06—2001

3 39 FIACR ERT HIAMRY Bl Jrd fhar Sren & & TR aRvg IMQR # wriehr &
& B gg Al oofiar & an fdr ff afdd @1 {6l ff geR &1 ISR 9 o @ dr
I8 faAidh 29—-04—2025 BT UTT: 11.00 o1 IATATT AT THTATT BIOR AETAT B TAT SoR T
TARTST U R AhdT & | AT UhdRbT Bridie] H H oTs SIda |

TSl f&ieh 29—03—2024 BT WX BRITER T HIBR AQTeAd Aigd SR gafT |

AR | BAEIRT / —
(e AR )

FErIS aHedl fadra sroft,

qedle IR JRIeR, e RmEern (Bo vo) |

T e gAEdr fgd ooft, Su—dedia diewe, Rt Reer (Ro wo)
qre G - 1,/ M/2024 TRIG SRIRT : 20—07—2024 fhe a1g : A% S GEI

1. Sl 8y W Al W@ S wM ofte, 20 Al AT Al wWo s M,
fIRITOT U9 geTe), STHER dersl, SU—asdld dblete, e Rrer, fovo . ATEHToT |

ERIR




686 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

1. 50 ]IS B Sl AR YF W0 #Al WM A, Mariier 9™ 9ersl, SIHER 9ers,
SY—Ted dlete, e B, fRovo |

2 3 A4l X A 9 ©rd BRIGCICIHEE

URIFI—UF qIad §—RIoRG AIH, 1954 & ALATT 847 & A IR—BIOR—IR—bIdG
(Treatment of Right Absent) & 3IfIHR EXAGRT HR IR |

B AWM d W B iud B S € b s 89 gMr g /T Hegu g w@o s
WM dd, MaRiRoT UM 9eel, SIPER derel, SU—dsdld dleie, e R, f2owo gRT
fRow0 Y—TorE AfIFRIA, 1954 & AT 847 & Tsd Sd AIg A 5] IB M9 FAR & TAYET
Y TR S9P IR BIPR—AR HIfTS & TP R SWART BT & T H 39 HRAed H
RT3 7 Fdhel SHe<], Yot 3T & o &S omer RS, 2ug—ud, uRaR T6d 3
BRI, SRS IRA YA W0 &1 WM o (1) &1 uioRi UKd &xab e fbar
f TrefToT T I Wi 9¥ 2004 W AGAT § I I g1 9 Yo AN & §RT HTHT GiordA G
qedre a)- & A |l Id I 918 BT DI UdT el o U7 X&T ¢ | SAfTY UriiTor 31 37+
IFT [AYST g BT JdAD A © TAT U IH AT HIS BT SAPIA IR AT ISU—HETeA
9TIS], UCaR I SRId, IU—T8UId DICITG & IS Wl H Gol HRal a18d o |

3 9 SIASR & HIEH W B I 9 W DI gfaa fbar oiren g & afe fedr aafaq
DI IH A IS B IS FAR JF Wo A WM A Bl R BT b Sl A8l
IU—HETA dTTe], YR gl ORI, SU—8dIel PG B [RG BITOINT H &6l Rl aR bl
Pl DI ACRT I TS § al a8 QAP 26-04—2025 dF I SHA U4 AGEwEN] &
BT /=TT | U R FobaT 8 | Ife Sad FeiRa orafr ao IS varrs U3 =&l 8l & ol
Tg HHS SR fb bl i eafdd o1 S [HYRT Afdd P R g<iblel qol BRI IR By
TARTS 78l 2 3R MR §aTd aRRA qof &) & 3Tael UIkd v Ay SI7gT |

3ITST Tl 26—03—2025 BT A BEIER  HIER AiRd aTeld ¥ SRl gV |

HIeR | FETERT / —
HE—dh AR fgaid o7,
SY—adedId Biete, e RBeer (o vo) |

¥ T I8d ARl fgdi 9o, deod, Su—dswild dod,

fSrerr Rmer (RRovo)
<0 geheAT : 02,/ 13B /2025 ARG TR : 13—01—2025
ST AT <41 g1 1 Jolr IM, FariT Ta IRAT, SThER BR del, SU—dsdld bel,
SY—dedel ddberd, Starr Rmer (fRovo) e |
ERIG]
319 ST - gfeard] |

REIT (AT GO |



ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 687
e 919 MH ST |

Ug SRR Al | <4l gl s ger M, Maril W IRA, SIPER BB,
IU—Tedd aderd, Rrar REer (fRovo) 7 9 MR & AR UK &l © & afear & Jaras
MR TS, Yga™ U¥, darad Rafs # #Wdl Arfas <@ g= o1 gar Y9 of & ol 981 g
gwﬂ%\’qvgm?qu\mdwmzﬁwwﬁaﬁmiﬁrﬂmﬂ@ﬁﬁmw%‘ﬁﬁ
HE E € | gIfQAT HETdl BRI & BETSIG d1ed § U1 14 TEI <dl & o IR AW A=
< G 4N AT I K G qof HRAMT Arsdl B |

31 39 FYABR ERT WARIRY & Jfad fear oirar € & afe oy aafed &1 Swiad
qifear o1 A9 AT BT H SR Tol BT IR PIg IMURT B dr faAlb 03—05—2025 BT AT
SAY Ud I7GTAd ol H BINR 3MHR 37U SURT Gol HRal FHdT ¢ | 918 Yok e dg 1
SOR /YRS Bifdel FARIT 9 B8R a1 FOAMER afedr & 9 §o%d &x- @ I7ee UIRd

g ST |
I feAidh 03—05—2025 BT B BWIRR g HIEY 3MeTad I SN fhar 1 |
AER | FEIRT / —

9 ISTod Wed FHEdl fgdig 2of), dded, SU—dgdid ddbeold,

St Rrrar (RRovo)
<0 HehEHT : 08/ 13B /2025 TR SRR : 14—02—2025
3N PWT Tl g3 Wi o Raell g3 @i o &, Fami T4 ure, SheR ddbad, et
e (fRovo) I
EEIL]
31T ST - gfearel |

REAR (M go¥) |
AfeH M 3MH ST |

doera, e Rear (Bowo) 71 9 e & 1Y YA @ © &b ) & HAndd IER &S,
UEAM UF, Tarad Rafts # 1 o g3 W@ 30 Raefll 891 2 S 98 9 g9 8 UReg A
BETSITT Tdb BRI & DN ATd | aral BT A A1 | ST 797 2 S Fal -8l ¢ |
HETA BRI & HETSIT AT H AT M 1S ITH & ©IF W F a1 g3 @I &
GO T Tof BRI ArEdl B |

11

3T 39 FYABR ERT WARIRY & Jfad fear oiar € f& afe ot aafed &1 Swiad
I BT A AT BTG H GO qof B IR Dls IMURT & ar faid 03—05—2025 &1 a1
SHA Yd QT ol ¥ BIOR ATHR AU SURT &S HRAT Fhal ¢ | I8 ok a8 Big A1




688 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

IR/ TERTS BIfdel TR 1 BHT T FRAAR ardl &1 74 g9 &) & 371ee IR b
ST |

ST fedid 03—05—2025 BT BN &R T AN 3STald & N fhar T |

AER | AR / —
TErId aHedl fadra sioft,
IU—dedlal dderd, Ster Rmer (fRowo) |

In the Court of Sh. Vijay Wardhan, 1As, Sub-Divisional Magistrate, Rohru,
District Shimla (H.P.)
In the matter of :

Smt. Khushi Rugta w/o Sh. Rupesh Kumar, r/o Village & P.O. Ranol, Sub-Tehsil Jangla,
District Shimla (H.P.) .. Applicant.

Versus

General Public .. Respondent.

Subject.—Application under section 13 (3) of the Birth and Death Registration Act, 1969.

Whereas, Smt. Khushi Rugta w/o Sh. Rupesh Kumar, r/o Village & P.O. Ranol, Sub-Tehsil
Jangla, District Shimla (H.P.) has filed an application alongwith the affidavit in the court of the
undersigned under section 13(3) of the Birth & Death Registration Act, 1969, to enter the date of
birth of her son (Elvish) (18-11-2020) in the record of Birth Register of Gram Panchayat Ranol,
Block Chhohara.

Now, therefore, objections are invited from the general public that if anyone has any
objection regarding to enter the date of birth of (Elvish 18-11-2020) they should appear before the
court of undersigned within 30 days from the publication of this notice, either personally or through
their authorized agent.

In the event of their failure to do so, it would be deemed that there is no objection and order
shall be passed ex-parte without affording any further opportunity of being heard.

Issued under my hand and seal of the court on this 3rd April, 2025.

Seal. Sd/-
(VIJAY WARDHAN, 1as),

Sub-Divisional Magistrate,

Rohru, District Shimla (H.P.).

In the Court of Sh. Vijay Wardhan, 1As, Sub-Divisional Magistrate, Rohru,
District Shimla (H.P.)

In the matter of :

Sh. Vipan Lal s/o Sudu Ram, r/o Village Diudi, P.O. Pekha, Tehsil Chirgaon, District
Shimla (H.P.) .. Applicant.



ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 689

Versus

General Public .. Respondent.

Subject.—Application under section 13 (3) of the Birth and Death Registration Act, 1969.

Whereas, Sh. Vipan Lal s/o Sudu Ram, r/o Village Diudi, P.O. Pekha, Tehsil Chirgaon,
District Shimla (H.P.) has filed an application alongwith the affidavit in the court of the
undersigned under section 13(3) of the Birth & Death Registration Act, 1969, to enter the date of
birth of his daughter (Aditi) (08-06-2007) in the record of Birth Register of Gram Panchayat Diudi
Maila, Block Chhohara.

Now, therefore, objections are invited from the general public that if anyone has any
objection regarding to enter the date of birth of (Aditi 08-06-2007) they should appear before the
court of undersigned within 30 days from the publication of this notice, either personally or through
their authorized agent.

In the event of their failure to do so, it would be deemed that there is no objection and order
shall be passed ex-parte without affording any further opportunity of being heard.

Issued under my hand and seal of the court on this 4th April, 2025.

Seal. Sd/-
(VIJAY WARDHAN, 1as),

Sub-Divisional Magistrate,

Rohru, District Shimla (H.P.).

In the Court of Sh. Bhanu Gupta (H.P.A.S.), Sub-Divisional Magistrate, Shimla (Urban),
District Shimla, Himachal Pradesh

Sh. Dharam Singh s/o Sh. Ramsa Ram, r/o Deuri (167), Haripurdhar, District Sirmaur,
Himachal Pradesh 173023 .. Applicant.

Versus

General Public .. Respondent.

Application under Section 13(3) of Birth and Death Registration Act, 1969.

Sh. Dharam Singh s/o Sh. Ramsa Ram, r/o Deuri (167), Haripurdhar, District Sirmaur,
Himachal Pradesh 173023 has preferred an application to the undersigned for registration of date of
death of his brother namely VED PRAKASH (DOB-24-10-2008) at Padam Dev Complex, The
Mall Shimla in the record of Municipal Corporation, Shimla.

Therefore, through this proclamation, the general public is hereby informed that any person
having any objection for entry of date of death mentioned above, may submit his objection in
writing in this court within 30 (Thirty) days from the date of publication of this notice in official



690 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

Gazette. No objection will be entertained after prescribed period and application will be decided
accordingly.

Given under my hand and seal of the Court on this 13th March, 2025.

Seal. Sd/-
Sub-Divisional Magistrate,
Shimla (Urban), District Shimla (H.P.).

In the Court of Dr. Poonam, HPAS, Marriage Officer-cum-Sub Divisional Magistrate,
Solan, Tehsil & District Solan (H.P.)

NOTICE UNDER SECTION 16 OF SPECIAL MARRIAGE ACT

Whereas, Mr. Rohit Kumar son of Mr. Sanjay Kumar, resident of Sharma Building Near
Diesel Pump, Chambaghat, P.O. Chambaghat, Tehsil and District Solan, (H.P.) and Mrs. Mamta
Devi wife of Mr. Rohit Kumar and daughter of Mr. Ratti Lal, resident of Village Rasehd, Near
Diesel Pump, Chambaghat, P.O. Chambaghat, Tehsil and District Solan (H.P.) have filed an
application for the registration of their marriage which was solemnized on 27-03-2024 and they
have been living as husband and wife ever since then.

And whereas, both applicants have submitted in their application and in their affidavits that
Mr. Rohit Kumar and Mrs. Mamta Devi were unmarried at the time of solemnization of their
marriage and were major in age and having no prohibited relations to each other, debarring them to
marry each other. Both the applicants have requested for registration of their marriage.

Notices have been served to all concerned and General Public to this effect that if anybody
has got any objection regarding the registration of marriage duly solemnized between the above
parties i.e. Mr. Rohit Kumar and Mrs. Mamta Devi they may file their written objections and
appear personally or through their authorized agents before me within a period of thirty days from
the date of issuance of this notice. After expiry of the said period, the marriage certificate would be
issued to the applicants by this court, post which no objection will be heard or accepted.

Issued under my hand and seal of the court on this 29th day of March, 2025.

Seal. Dr. POONAM, HPAS,
Marriage Officer-cum-

Sub-Divisional Magistrate,
Solan, District Solan (H. P.).

In the Court of Shri Multan Singh Banyal, Executive Magistrate-cum-Tehsildar, Solan,
District Solan (H.P.)

In the matter of :

Smt. Nirmla Devi d/o Late Shri Balak Ram wife of Late Shri Shish Ram, permanent r/o
Village Bassi, Post Office Damkari, Tehsil & District Solan (H.P.) ..Applicant.



ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 691

Versus

General Public . .Respondent.

Subject.—Regarding delayed Registration of Birth and Death under section 13(3) of Birth and
Death Act, 1969 and Section 9(3) of H.P. Birth & Death Registration Rules, 2003.

Whereas, the applicant Smt. Nirmla Devi d/o Late Shri Balak Ram wife of Late Shri Shish
Ram, permanent r/o Village Bassi, Post Office Damkari, Tehsil & District Solan (H.P.) has moved
an application before the undersigned under section 13(3) of Birth & Death Registration Act, 1969
and Section 9(3) of H.P. Birth & Death Registration Rules, 2003 alongwith affidavits and other
relevant documents for entering her date of birth i.e. 09-10-1971 and place of birth at r/o Village
Oily, Post Office Kotla, Tehsil & District Solan (H.P.), but her date of birth could not be entered in
the record of Gram Panchayat Mashiwar, Tehsil & District Solan.

Now, therefore, by this proclamation, the general public is hereby informed that any person
having any objection(s) for the registration of delayed date of birth of Smt. Nirmla Devi d/o Late
Shri Balak Ram wife of Late Shri Shish Ram may submit their objection in writing or appear in
person in this court on or before 01-05-2025 at 10.00 AMm, failing which no objection will be
entertained after expiry of date.

Given under my hand and seal of the court on this 1st day of April, 2025.

Seal. Sd/-
(MULTAN SINGH BANYAL),

Executive Magistrate-cum-Tehsildar,

Solan, District Solan (H.P.).

In the Court of Shri Multan Singh Banyal, Executive Magistrate-cum-Tehsildar, Solan,
District Solan (H.P.)

In the matter of :

Smt. Sandhya Devi d/o Shri Kanshi Ram, r/o Village & Post Office Kabakalan, Tehsil &
District Solan (H.P.) . .Applicant.

Versus
General Public . .Respondent.

Subject—Regarding delayed Registration of Birth and Death under section 13(3) of Birth and
Death Act, 1969 and Section 9(3) of H.P. Birth & Death Registration Rules, 2003.

Whereas, the applicant Smt. Sandhya Devi d/o Shri Kanshi Ram, r/o Village & Post Office
Kabakalan, Tehsil & District Solan (H.P.) has moved an application before the undersigned under
section 13(3) of Birth & Death Registration Act, 1969 and Section 9(3) of H.P. Birth & Death
Registration Rules, 2003 alongwith affidavits and other relevant documents for entering her date of
birth i.e. 01-02-1954 and place of birth at r/o Village & Post Office Kabakalan, Tehsil & District
Solan (H.P.), but her date of birth could not be entered in the record of Gram Panchayat Kabakalan,
Tehsil & District Solan.



692 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

Now, therefore, by this proclamation, the general public is hereby informed that any person
having any objection(s) for the registration of delayed date of birth of Smt. Sandhya Devi d/o Shri
Kanshi Ram may submit their objection in writing or appear in person in this court on or before
01-05-2025 at 10.00 A.Mm., failing which no objection will be entertained after expiry of date.

Given under my hand and seal of the court on this 1st day of April, 2025.

Seal. Sd/-
(MULTAN SINGH BANYAL),

Executive Magistrate-cum-Tehsildar,

Solan, District Solan (H.P.).

Before Shri Jagpal Singh, Executive Magistrate-cum-(Tehsildar), Kasauli,
District Solan, Himachal Pradesh

Case No. Date of Institution Date of Decision
09/2025 19-03-2025 19-4-2025

Smt. Jaimala Toppo w/o Sh. Vimal Toppo, r/o Mauja Main Road Patel Para, Dipadi Khurd,
Surguja Chhatisgarh-497118, presently residing at Mauja up-Mahal Larah, Tehsil Kasauli, District
Solan H.P. . .Applicant.

Versus
General Public . .Respondents.

Application under section 13(3) of Birth and Death Registration Act, 1969.

Smt. Jaimala Toppo w/o Sh. Vimal Toppo, r/o Mauja Main Road Patel Para, Dipadi Khurd,
Surguja Chhatisgarh-497118, presently residing at Mauja up-Mahal Larah, Tehsil Kasauli, District
Solan H.P. has moved an application before the undersigned under section 13(3) of Birth & Death
Registration Act, 1969 alongwith affidavits and other documents stating therein that her son "Ritik
Toppo s/o Vimal Toppo & Smt. Jaimala Toppo" was born on 08-05-2012 at r/o Mauja Up-Mahal
Larah, Tehsil Kasauli, Distt. Solan as per affidavit given by the applicant, but his date of birth
could not registered in the record of Gram Panchayat Kasauli-Garkhal, Tehsil Kasauli, Distt. Solan
within stipulated period.

Hence she prayed for passing necessary orders to the Secretary-cum-Registrar Births &
Deaths Registration, of Gram Panchayat Kasauli-Garkhal, for entering the same in the births and
deaths records.

Therefore, by this proclamation, the general public is hereby informed that any person
having any objection for the registration of delayed date of birth of Ritik Tappo s/o Vimal Toppo
& Smt. Jaimala Toppo may submit their objections in writing in this court on or before 19-04-2025
at 10.00 A.M., failing which no objection will be entertained after expiry of date.



RIS, fedrere yael, 10 3didl, 2025 /20 <F, 1947 693
Given under my hand and seal of the court on this 19th day of March, 2025.

Seal. Sd/-
(JAGPAL SINGH)

Executive Magistrate (Tehsildar),

Kasauli, District Solan (H. P.).

In the Court of Dr. Poonam, HPAS, Marriage Officer-cum-Sub Divisional Magistrate,
Solan, Tehsil & District Solan (H.P.)

NOTICE UNDER SECTION 16 OF SPECIAL MARRIAGE ACT

Whereas, Mr. Aman Sharma son of Mr. Rajender Mohan, resident of Om Sai
communication, Basal Patti Kather (48), P.O. Chambaghat, Tehsil and District Solan, (H.P.) and
Mrs. Ankita wife of Mr. Aman Sharma and daughter of Mr. Ramesh Kumar, resident of Village Ser
Jagas (58), P.O. and Tehsil Rajgarh, District Sirmaur, H.P. have filed an application for the
registration of their marriage which was solemnized on 21-02-2025 and they have been living as
husband and wife ever since then.

And whereas, both applicants have submitted in their application and in their affidavits that
Mr. Aman Sharma and Mrs. Ankita were unmarried at the time of solemnization of their marriage
and were major in age and having no prohibited relations to each other, debarring them to marry
each other. Both the applicants have requested for registration of their marriage.

Notices have been served to all concerned and General Public to this effect that if anybody
has got any objection regarding the registration of marriage duly solemnized between the above
parties i.e. Mr. Aman Sharma and Mrs. Ankita they may file their written objections and appear
personally or through their authorized agents before me within a period of thirty days from the date
of issuance of this notice. After expiry of the said period, the marriage certificate would be issued
to the applicants by this court post which no objection will be heard or accepted.

Issued under my hand and seal of the court on this 3rd day of April, 2025.
Seal. Dr. POONAM, HPAS,
Marriage Officer-cum-

Sub-Divisional Magistrate,
Solan, District Solan (H. P.).

9 QT PRGN SUSIEBNI 1, Tgdial g forar &1 (fBo o)

&9 0 : b geper: SISGERCIRR GIGERCNE
05/Marriage/T/U/2025 [EEISENICa] 26—03—2025 01—05—2025

1. #l IR @ed Y9 golau dq, I gre [0 02, JUR AT, dediid 9 forar S,
f2omo |



694 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947

2. &N QAT edl 8rer gl Gk Tigd Yo |edT UhTe M, ARl gedell, dsdic]
3, foreTr &1, 8o o |

ERIE

SATH ST1dT

"geABR ISIUF AR Uawr /g2l gAral d ol |

v ——ureA—uz emdl uofieRer ureff s gdR @9 g3 @ d@g, aRil 98 [0 02, WX
g, dEdrdl 9 57l 1, fBovo aad Ay SH STeel USiiaRvl o7 9 J&leld H U
fAT—uF SRR fhar 2 6 39! wral o=, A & R fa7i® 07—03—2000 ®I STl
AT oMl BTl uell GuR dad YA G UBIRT TMI, ardl Gedell, dgdrd or, forelr
T, 80 W0 9 B T, W=y IE WA HedT TAdl d DR UM UARIA R qAIS b
VTR H Tol 9 BRATg TS 7, Sl 9 WATEl BT TM UARd H &S B & [y TR
fpar 21 urif 9 o el @ gfte # omuR Fre, AU UH, Whel UHIU-UF AT A
TERITAST UfA—U= & |1 SRR $R@ 3Mde fhar 2 |

3d: $¥ABR oA fRArEd Uqw /gedl gl 9 IRl & WegH | M Al d
Frd Redar! & gfad fear Siar € & e {6l &1 faarg dofiaxr IR $18 SoR 9 Yav
B Al g8 i arRig Uil 01—05—2025 P g8 10.00 g6 50 IRITAT ¥ AT AT deblerc
JTAT TARTST STENEWIERN] & IR H IR BIAR U PR AHAT © I YHaRwl HRATe!
A H TS SITTHT | 3T SURIGT fdarg GofidRoT HR+ & 3N < AU S | S SR hlg
SR/ TARTST BIfdel FHRIT = 8T |

31Tl faieh 26—03—2025 BT WX EXIER T HIER AaTeld A SIRI §aAT |

AER | FEIRT / —
TEIS AHTEAT TH oy,

A1, Rterm &1 (R0 10) |

CHANGE OF NAME

I, Tarun Sharma s/o Sh. Nandishwar Sharma, r/o Village Minda, P.O. Masroond, Tehsil and
District Chamba (H.P.) declare that in my 12th mark sheet bearing Roll No. 17601469 of CBSE
Board my father's name mistakenly entered as Nandishwar and my mother's name entered as Saroj .
But my father's correct name is Nandishwar Sharma and my mother's correct name is Saroj
Kumari. Concerned note.

TARUN SHARMA

s/o Sh. Nandishwar Sharma,

r/o0 Village Minda, P.O. Masroond,
Tehsil and District Chamba (H.P.).



ST, fRATereT U<er, 10 e, 2025 /20 o4, 1947 695

CHANGE OF NAME

I, Sumitra w/o Late Sh. Khiyalo, r/o Village Garh, P.O. Kail, Tehsil Dalhousie, District
Chamba (H.P.) declare that I have changed my name from Savitri Devi to Sumitra for all purposes

in future. Please note.
SUMITRA
w/o Late Sh. Khiyalo,
r/o Village Garh, P.O. Kail,
Tehsil Dalhousie, District Chamba (H.P.).

CHANGE OF NAME

I, Vinta Devi w/o Jagdish Chand, Village Thah, P.O. Batheri, Sub-Tehsil Kataula, District
Mandi (H.P.) declare that in my Aadhar Card No. 7501 5041 8914 my name Banita Devi is
wrongly entered. Correct name is Vinta Devi.

VINTA DEVI

w/o Jagdish Chand,

Village Thah, P.O. Batheri,

Sub-Tehsil Kataula, District Mandi (H.P.).

CHANGE OF NAME

I, Mahender Singh s/o Sansar Chand, r/o Vaishno Pangi Dhaba School Road Manali, P.O.
& Tehsil Manali, District Kullu (H.P.) declare that my name wrongly entered as Mahinder Singh
instead of Mahender Singh in my daughter Ankita's 10th marks list/12th mark sheet/school records.

Concerned note it.
MAHENDER SINGH
s/0 Sansar Chand,

r/o Vaishno Pangi Dhaba School Road Manali,
P.O. & Tehsil Manali, District Kullu (H.P.).

CHANGE OF NAME

I, Lakshmi Devi w/o Sh. Ravi Prakash, r/o Kalehar, Kharuhal, Tehsil Palampur, District
Kangra (H.P.) hereby declare that I have changed my name from Lakshmi Devi to Laxmi Devi.

Note the relevant information.
LAKSHMI DEVI
w/o Sh. Ravi Prakash,
r/o Kalehar, Kharuhal,
Tehsil Palampur, District Kangra (H.P.).



696 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947
CHANGE OF NAME

I, Narayan Jeet Negi s/o Dil Sukh, r/o VPO Barang, Tehsil Kalpa, District Kinnaur (H.P.)
have changed my name from Narayan Jeet to Narayan Jeet Negi. All concerned note.

NARAYAN JEET NEGI
s/o Dil Sukh, r/o VPO Barang,
Tehsil Kalpa, District Kinnaur (H.P.).

CHANGE OF NAME

I, Devi Ram s/o Loharu Ram, r/o Village Dhawas, P.O. & Tehsil Bagachanogi, District
Mandi (H.P.) have changed my name from Chandu Ram to Devi Ram. All concerned note.

DEVI RAM
s/o Loharu Ram,

r/o Village Dhawas,
P.O. & Tehsil Bagachanogi, District Mandi (H.P.).

CHANGE OF NAME

I, Surinder Singh s/o Sh. Gian Singh, r/o Village Upper Arniala, Tehsil & Disrict Una

(H.P.) declare that I want to correct my daughter's name as Mannat (19-12-2009) instead of
Manmeet Kaur in all relevant documents.

SURINDER SINGH

s/0 Sh. Gian Singh,

r/o Village Upper Arniala,

Tehsil & Disrict Una (H.P.).

CHANGE OF NAME

I, Om Prakash s/o Sh. Nek Ram, r/o Village and P.O. Darwa, Tehsil Kasauli, District Solan

(H.P.) declare that in my service record of Income Tax Department (Central Govt.) my name is

wrongly entered as Om Parkash whereas my correct and actual name is Om Prakash. Concerned
please note.

OM PRAKASH

s/o Sh. Nek Ram,

r/o Village and P.O. Darwa,

Tehsil Kasauli, District Solan (H.P.).

CHANGE OF NAME

I, Shailja Thakur d/o No. 3978013H NK Omi Nand (Retd.), r/o Village Ghori, P.O. Dhabiri,
Tehsil Barsar, Disrict Hamirpur (H.P.) have changed my name from Monika Kumari to Shailja
Thakur, vide affidavit dated 03-04-2025 before notary public Hamirpur (H.P.).

SHAILJA THAKUR
d/o Omi Nand, r/o Village Ghori,
P.O. Dhabiri, Tehsil Barsar, Disrict Hamirpur (H.P.).



IIoTu=, fRamae US9n, 10 3, 2025 /20 o, 1947 697
CHANGE OF NAME

I, Anita Devi aged about 36 years w/o Shri Sher Singh, r/o Village and P.O. Dharer, Tehsil
Palampur, Disrict Kangra (H.P.)-176061 declare that I have changed my name in the Aadhar Card
No. 8243 4103 3365 from Sunita to Anita Devi. All concerned please may note.

ANITA DEVI

w/o Shri Sher Singh,

r/o Village and P.O. Dharer,

Tehsil Palampur, Disrict Kangra (H.P.).

CHANGE OF NAME

I, Ajay s/o Jagat Ram, r/o V.P.O. Salogra, Tehsil & Disrict Solan (H.P.) declare that my
son's name wrongly entered as Radhey Bhardwaj instead of Raghav Kumar in his Aadhar Card.
Please note. My son's Actual & Correct name is Raghav Kumar.

AJAY

s/0 Jagat Ram,

r/o V.P.O. Salogra,

Tehsil & Disrict Solan (H.P.).

CHANGE OF NAME

I, Suma Devi w/o Bhagmal, r/o Village Charna, P.O. & Tehsil Nohradhar, Disrict Sirmaur
(H.P.) have changed my name from Suma Devi to Suman Devi.

SUMA DEVI
w/o Bhagmal,

r/o Village Charna,
P.O. & Tehsil Nohradhar, Disrict Sirmaur (H.P.).

CHANGE OF NAME

I, Satya Devi w/o Raghubir, r/o Subathu Road, Village Dhar-ki-Ber, P.O. Dharampur,
Tehsil Kasauli, Disrict Solan (H.P.) have changed my name from Satya Devi to Sateshwari.

SATYA DEVI

w/o Raghubir,

r/o Subathu Road,

Village Dhar-ki-Ber, P.O. Dharampur,
Tehsil Kasauli, Disrict Solan (H.P.).



698 ST, fRATeeT U<er, 10 31Vd, 2025 /20 o5, 1947
CHANGE OF NAME

I, Vishal Bhargav s/o Shankar Lal, r/o Village Pandah, P.O. Oachghat, District Solan, (H.P.)
have changed my minor daughter's name from Sajal Kumari to Sejal Kumari.

VISHAL BHARGAV

s/o0 Shankar Lal,

r/o Village Pandah,

P.O. Oachghat, District Solan, (H.P.).

CHANGE OF NAME

I, Darshan s/o Sh. Jethu, r/o Village Narhar, P.O. Katwachi, Tehsil Pangna, District Mandi
(H.P.)-175046 do hereby solemnly affirm and declare that my name is wrongly entered as Saju
Ram in my Aadhar Card No. 2011 6822 5916 and my correct name is Darshan.

DARSHAN

s/o Sh. Jethu,

r/o Village Narhar, P.O. Katwachi,
Tehsil Pangna, District Mandi, (H.P.).

CHANGE OF NAME

I, Raksha w/o Sh. Vipan Lal, r/o Village Sari, P.O. Dhadi, Tehsil Jubbal, District Shimla
(H.P.) declare that name of my daughter Trishika is wrongly mentioned as Ananya in her Aadhar
Card. Therefore it should be changed to Trishika in her Aadhar Card.

RAKSHA

w/o Sh. Vipan Lal,

r/o Village Sari, P.O. Dhadi,

Tehsil Jubbal, District Shimla (H.P.).

CHANGE OF NAME

I, Rajesh Kumar s/o Sh. Khem Singh, r/o Village Suketi, P.O. Gadagusain, Tehsil
Balichowki, District Mandi (H.P.) declare that I have changed my minor son's name from Ronit
Thakur to Dushyant Kumar. All concerned please note.

RAJESH KUMAR

s/o Sh. Khem Singh,

r/o Village Suketi, P.O. Gadagusain,
Tehsil Balichowki, District Mandi (H.P.).

I, a0 doI e Ay, 3red ueel, RMEea—5 gRT giad doIm Ui
goIagi-dh EXTENG II9TU, deRAEC http://rajpatrahimachal.nic.in TR IU&S & TaH Acgd AT fdar <1 Ahar 2|




		2025-04-10T17:01:29+0530
	GIAN CHAND SHARMA




