
fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk lfpoky; 
 

vf/klwpuk 
 

f'keyk] 27 vxLr] 2024 
 
 la[;k fo0l0&fo/kk;u& fo/ks;d@1-68@2024-&&fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk dh izfØ;k ,oa dk;Z 
lapkyu fu;ekoyh] 1973 ds fu;e 140 ds  vUrxZr cky fookg izfr"ks/k ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½  fo/ks;d] 
2024 tks vkt fnukad 27 Qjojh] 2024 dks fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk esa iqj%LFkkfir gks pqdk gS] 
loZlk/kkj.k dh lwpukFkZ jkti= esa eqfnzr djus gsrq izsf"kr fd;k tkrk gSA 

 
gLrk{kfjr@& 

¼;'kiky½] 
lfpo] 

fg0 iz0 fo/kku lHkkA 
 

&&&&&&&&&& 
2024 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 4 

 
 

Ckky&fookg izfr"ks/k ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2024 
  

[k.Mksa dk Øe 
 

[k.M% 
 
 1- laf{kIr uke] ykxw gksuk vkSj izkjEHkA  
 2- /kkjk 2 dk la”kks/kuA 
 3- /kkjk 3 dk la”kks/kuA 
 4- /kkjk 18&d dk var%LFkkiuA 
 5- dfri; vf/kfu;fefr;ksa dk la”kks/kuA 
 
 
 

&&&&&&&&& 
2024 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 4 

 
Ckky&fookg izfr"ks/k ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2024 

 
¼fo/kku lHkk esa iqj%LFkkfIkr :i esa½ 

  
 fgekpy izns”k jkT; dks ykxw Ckky&fookg izfr’ks/k vf/kfu;e] 2006 ¼2007 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 6½ 
dk la”kks/ku djus ds fy, fo/ks;dA 
 
 Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds ipgRrjosa o’kZ esa fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk }kjk fuEufyf[kr :i esa ;g 
vf/kfu;fer gks %& 
 
 1- laf{kIr uke] ykxw gksuk vkSj izkjEHk-&&¼1½ bl vf/kfu;e dk laf{kIr uke Ckky&fookg izfr’ks/k 
¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ vf/kfu;e] 2024 gSA 
 



 ¼2½ Hkkjrh; fØf”p;u fookg vf/kfu;e] 1872 ¼15 of 1872½ ikjlh fookg vkSj fookg foPNsn 
vf/kfu;e] 1936(\ ¼3 of 1936½ eqfLye Loh; fof?k ¼”kjh;r½ vf/kfu;e] 1937 ¼26 of 1937½ fo”ks’k fookg 
vf/kfu;e] 1954 ¼43 of 1954½  fgUnw fookg vf/kfu;e] 1955 ¼25 of 1955½ ;k fookg ds lacèk esa viukbZ 
tk jgh fdlh fof/k ;k izFkk ;k :f<+ ;k O;ogkj ;k rRle; izo`Ÿk fdlh vU; fof/k esa fufgr fdlh ckr ds 
izfrdwy ;k mlds vlaaxr gksrs gq, Hkh ;g fgekpy izns”k ds jkT; {ks= esa vf/kokflr lHkh O;fDr;ksa ij 
ykxw gksxkA 
 

 ¼3½ bl vf/kfu;e dh ;g /kkjk] /kkjk 2 ds [k.M ¼ii½ vkSj /kkjk 4  rqjUr izHkko ls izo`Ÿk gksaxh 
vkSj “ks’k micU/k muds vf/kfu;eu dh rkjh[k ls nks o’kZ ds lekiu dh rkjh[k ls izo`Ÿk gksaxs rFkk bl 
vf/kfu;e ds izkjaHk ds lacaèk esa ,sls fdlh mica/k esa fdlh lanHkZ dk vFkZ ml mica/k ds izo`Ÿk gksus ds lanHkZ 
esa yxk;k tk,xkA  
 
 2- /kkjk 2 dk la”kks/ku-&&Ckky&fookg izfr’ks/k vf/kfu;e] 2006 ¼ftls blesa blds i”pkr~ ßewy 
vf/kfu;eÞ dgk x;k gS½ dh /kkjk 2 esa]& 
 

 ¼i½ [k.M ¼d½ ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr [k.M j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 

  ß¼d½ Þckydß ls] ,slk iq#’k ;k ukjh vfHkizsr gS] ftlus bDdhl o’kZ dh vk;q iwjh ugha dh gS]ß( 
 
 ¼ii½  [k.M ¼[k½ esa Þnksuksa i{kdkjksa esa lsÞ “kCnksa ds i”pkr~ ^^]i{kdkjksa dks “kkflr djus okyh fdlh 
izFkk ;k :f<+ ;k O;ogkj lfgr rRle; izo`Ÿk fdlh vU; fof/k esa vUrÆo’V fdlh ckr ds izfrdwy ;k 
vlaxr gksrs gq, Hkh]Þ “kCn vkSj fpUg vUr%LFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 
  
 3- /kkjk 3 dk la”kks/ku-&&ßewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 3 dh mi&/kkjk ¼3½ esa]& Þnks o’kZß “kCnksa ds 
LFkku ij Þikap o’kZß “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 4- /kkjk 18&d dk var%LFkkiu-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 18&d ds i”pkr~ fuEufyf[kr /kkjk 
var%LFkkfir dh tk,xh] vFkkZr~%& 
 
 Þ18&d- vf/kfu;e dk v/;kjksgh izHkko gksuk-&bl vfèkfu;e ds micU/kksa dk] i{kdkjksa dks “kkflr 

djus okyh fdlh izFkk ;k :f<+ ;k O;ogkj lfgr rRle; izo`Ÿk fdlh vU; fof/k esa vUrÆo’V fdlh 
ckr ds izfrdwy ;k vlaxr gksrs gq, Hkh izHkko gksxkAßA 

 
 5- dfri; vf/kfu;fefr;ksa dk la”kks/ku-&&vuqlwph esa fofuÆn’V vf/kfu;fefr;ksa dk muesa oÆ.kr 
jhfr esa la”kksèku fd;k tk,xkA  
 

&&&&&&&&&&& 
                     

vuqlwph 
¼/kkjk 5 ns[ksa½ 

 
  
Øe la[;k o"kZ vf/kfu;e 

la[;k 
laf{kIr uke

 
la”kks/ku 

 
¼1½ ¼2½ ¼3½ ¼4½ ¼5½ 
1- 1872 15 Hkkjrh; fØf'p;u 

fookg vf/kfu;e] 
1872- 

/kkjk 60 ds  [k.M ¼1½ ds LFkku ij 
fuEufyf[kr [k.M j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
  

Þ¼1½  fookg dk vk”k; j[kus okys iq#’k 
vkSj L=h dh vk;q bDdhl o’kZ ls 



de ugha gksxh(ß( 
2- 1936 3 ikjlh fookg vkSj 

foPNsn&vf/kfu;e] 
1936- 

¼d½ /kkjk 3 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ds [k.M 
¼x½ esa Þog efgyk gS rks] vBkjg 
o’kZ dh vk;q iwjh ugha dh gSÞ “kCnksa 
ds LFkku ij Þog efgyk gS rks] 
bDdhl o’kZ dh vk;q iwjh ugha dh 
gSß “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 

 
 

¼[k½ f}rh; vuqlwph esa] ß;fn fookg ds 
i{kdkj 21 o’kZ ls de vk;q ds gSa 
rks muds firk ;k laj{kd ds 
gLrk{kjß in dk yksi fd;k 
tk,xkA 

3- 1954 43 fo'ks"k fookg 
vf/kfu;e] 1954- 

/kkjk 4 ds [k.M ¼x½ esa ÞvBkjg o’kZß 
“kCnksa ds LFkku ij ÞbDdhl o’kZß “kCn 
j[ks tk,axsA 

 
4- 1955 25 fgUnw fookg 

vf/kfu;e] 1955- 
¼d½ /kkjk 5 ds [k.M ¼iii½ esa ÞvBkjg 

o’kZß “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ÞbDdhl 
o’kZß “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 

 
¼[k½  /kkjk 13 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ ds 

[k.M ¼iv½ esa ÞvBkjg o’kZß “kCnksa 
ds LFkku ij ÞbDdhl o’kZß “kCn 
j[ks tk,axsA 

 
 

mÌs';ksa vkSj dkj.kksa dk dFku 
 

 cky fookg izfr"ks/k vf/kfu;e] 2006 dks cky fookg vuq"Bku lEiUu djkus vkSj rRlac) ;k mlds 
vkuq"kafxd ekeyksa dks izfrf"k) djus ds fy, micaf/kr djus gsrq vf/kfu;fer fd;k x;k FkkA vk/kqfud ;qx 
esa efgyk,a izR;sd {ks= esa izxfr dj jgh gSaA rFkkfi] cky fookg u dsoy muds O;olk; dh izxfr esa cfYd 
muds 'kkjhfjd fodkl esa Hkh ck/kd gSA ySafxd lekurk vkSj mPpÙkj f'k{kk izkIr djus ds voljksa ds fy, 
mica/k djus gsrq ckfydkvksa ds fy, fookg dh U;wure vk;q esa o`f) djuk  vko';d gks x;k gSA bl 
izdkj] fgekpy izns'k jkT; esa ykxw cky fookg izfr"ks/k vf/kfu;e] 2006 vkSj vU; lacaf/kr vf/kfu;eksa esa 
la'kks/ku fd;k tkuk rFkk ckfydkvksa ds fy, fookg gsrq U;wure vk;q dks 21 o"kZ djuk izLrkfor fd;k x;k 
gSA 

 
 ;g fo/ks;d mi;qZDr mÌs”;ksa dh iwfrZ ds fy, gSA 
 
 

¼MkW0 ¼duZy½ /kuh jke 'kkafMy½ 
          izHkkjh ea=hA 

 
f”keyk% 
rkjh[k% -------------------------] 2024 

&&&&&&&& 
 



foŸkh; Kkiu 
 

&”kwU;& 
 

&&&&&&&& 
 

izR;k;ksftr fo/kku lEcU/kh Kkiu 
 

&”kwU;& 
 

&&&&&&&&& 
 
 

Ckky&fookg izfr"ks/k ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2024 
 
 fgekpy izns'k jkT; dks ykxw Ckky&fookg izfr’ks/k vf/kfu;e] 2006 ¼2007 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 6½ 
dk vkSj la”kks/ku djus dss fy, fo/ks;dA  
 
 
 
 

 ¼MkW0 ¼duZy½ /kuh jke 'kkafMy½ 
        izHkkjh ea=hA 

 
 

&&&&&&& 
 
 

 
¼'kjn dqekj yxoky½ 
         Lfpo ¼fof/k½A 
 
 
 
 
 
f”keyk% 
 
rkjh[k% ---------------------------------------] 2024 
 
 

&&&&&&&&&& 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
AUTHORITATIVE  ENGLISH  TEXT 

 
                                         BILL NO. 4 OF 2024 

 
THE  PROHIBITION  OF  CHILD  MARRIAGE  (HIMACHAL  PRADESH  

AMENDMENT)  BILL,  2024 
 

 ARRANGEMENT OF CLAUSES 
 
Clauses: 
 
 1. Short title, application and commencement. 
 2. Amendment of section 2. 
 3. Amendment of section 3. 
 4. Insertion of section 18A. 
 5. Amendment of certain enactments. 
 

___________ 
 

BILL No. 4 OF 2024 
 
 

THE  PROHIBITION  OF  CHILD  MARRIAGE  (HIMACHAL  PRADESH  
AMENDMENT) BILL,  2024 

 
(AS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY) 

 
A 
 

BILL 
 
   to amend the Prohibition of Child Marriage Act, 2006 (Act No. 6 of  2007) in its 
application to the State of Himachal Pradesh. 

 
 BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-fifth year of 
the Republic of India as follows:— 
 
 1. Short title, application and commencement .—(1)  This Act may be called the 
Prohibition of Child Marriage (Himachal Pradesh Amendment) Act, 2024. 
 
 (2)  It shall apply to all persons domiciled in the territory of the State of Himachal Pradesh 
notwithstanding anything contrary or inconsistent therewith contained in the Indian Christian 
Marriage Act, 1872 (15 of 1872) the Parsi Marriage and Divorce Act, 1936 (3 of 1936) the Muslim 
Personal Law (Shariat) Application Act 1937 (26 of 1937) the Special Marriage Act, 1954 (43 of 
1954) the Hindu Marriage Act, 1955 (25 of 1955) or any other law or custom or usage or practice 
in relation to marriage, under any other law for the time being in force. 
 
 (3)  This section, clause (ii) of section 2 and section 4 shall come into force immediately 
and the remaining provisions shall come into force on the date of completion of two years from the 
date of its enactment and any reference in any such provision to the commencement of this Act 
shall be construed as a reference to the coming into force of that provision. 



 
 2. Amendment of section 2.—In section 2 of the Prohibition of Child Marriage Act, 
2006 (hereinafter referred to as the “principal Act”),- 
 

  (i)  for clause (a), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:— 
 

   “(a)  “child” means a male or female who has not completed twenty-one years of 
age;”; and 

 
  (ii) in clause (b), after the words “is a child”, the words “notwithstanding anything to 

the contrary or inconsistent therewith contained in any other law for the time 
being in force, including any custom or usage or practice governing the parties” 
shall be inserted. 

 
 3.  Amendment of section 3.—In section 3 of the principle Act, in sub-section (3), for the 
words “two years”, the words “five years” shall be substituted. 
 
 4.   Insertion of section 18-A.—After section 18 of the principal Act, the following 
section shall be inserted, namely:— 
 
  “18A. Act to have overriding effect.—The provisions of this Act shall have effect, 

notwithstanding anything contrary or inconsistent therewith contained in any other law 
for the time being in force, including any custom or usage or practice governing the 
parties.”. 

 
 5. Amendment of certain enactments.—The enactments specified in THE                     
SCHEDULE shall be amended in the manner mentioned therein. 

______________ 
 
 

 THE SCHEDULE 
(See section 5) 

 

Sl. No. Year Act No. Short title Amendment 

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) 

1. 1872 15 The Indian 
Christian Marriage 
Act, 1872. 

In section 60, for clause (1), the following 
clause shall be  substituted, namely:— 
  

“(1)  the age of the man and woman 
intending to be married shall not be 
under twenty-one years;”. 

2. 1936 3 The Parsi 
Marriage and 
Divorce Act, 1936 

  (a)  in section 3, in sub-section (1),  in  
clause (c),  for the words  
“female, has not completed 
eighteen years of age”, the words 
“female, has not completed 
twenty-one years of age” shall be 
substituted. 

 

  (b)  in Schedule II, the expression 
“Signatures of the fathers or 
guardians of the contracting 
parties under 21 years of age” 



shall be omitted. 

3. 1954 43 The Special 
Marriage Act, 
1954 

In section 4, in clause (c), for the  
words “eighteen years”, the words “twenty-
one years” shall be substituted. 
 

4. 1955 25 The Hindu 
Marriage 
Act,1955 

 (a)  in section 5, in clause (iii), for the 
words “eighteen years”, the words 
“twenty-one years” shall be 
substituted. 

 (b)  in section 13, in sub-section (2), in 
clause (iv), for the words “eighteen 
years”, the words “twenty-one 
years” shall be substituted. 

 
 

 
STATEMENT OF OBJECT AND REASONS 

 
 The Prohibition of Child Marriage Act, 2006 was enacted to provide for the prohibition of 
solemnisation of child marriages and for matters connected therewith or incidental thereto. In 
today’s world the women are progressing in every field. The early marriages, however, act as a 
hindrance not only in the progress of their career but also in their physical development. In order to 
provide for gender equality and opportunities of obtaining higher education, it has become 
necessary to increase the minimum age of marriage for the girls. Thus, it is proposed to amend the 
Prohibition of Child Marriage Act, 2006  and other related Acts in their application to the State of 
Himachal Pradesh and increase the minimum age for marriage for girls to 21 years.  
 
 This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives. 
 
 

      (DR. (COL.) DHANI RAM SHANDIL) 
       Minister-in-charge. 

SHIMLA: 
The……………..2024. 
 
 

__________ 
  
 
 

FINANCIAL  MEMORANDUM 
 

— Nil— 
 
 

__________  
 

MEMORANDUM  REGARDING  DELEGATED  LEGISLATION 
 

 
— Nil— 

 



 ____________ 
THE PROHIBITION OF CHILD MARRIAGE (HIMACHAL PRADESH AMENDMENT) 

BILL, 2024 
 

 A 
 

 BILL 
 

           to amend the Prohibition of Child Marriage Act, 2006 (Act No. 6 of  2007) in its 
application to the State of Himachal Pradesh. 
 
 

 
 (DR. (COL.) DHANI RAM SHANDIL) 

Minister-in-Charge. 
       
 

_______________  
 
 
 

(SHARAD  KUMAR  LAGWAL) 
                              Secretary (Law). 
 
 
 
 
SHIMLA: 
The…………, 2024 
 
 

______________ 


