fearae e faum= aw aRare

IHC, 27 TR, 2024

e faoo—faumas— a8 / 1-68 / 2024 —fRAMae weeT faems @91 @1 ufhar vd el
Fared Haen, 1973 & M 140 @ Iwaid 91t fdarg ufowy (Bmae u<wr deed)  faeres,
2024 S MW fadfis 27 GRA¥l, 2024 HI fZorae wow faum @ #§ grIenfiq & g@r g
HIARIRT &1 ared IodE H gfad d gg Uit fdar S 2

IR / —
(Temred),

f20 wo faum= |vr |

2024 &1 AIs A<D 4

ITe—fare iy (Remae v M) fadas, 2024
TUgl BT HH

W& ¥, N BFT1 3R YR |
gRT 2 BT AT |

gRT 3 BT M |

IRT 18—D P IJd: AT |
oy st o1 e |

ok owbd=

2024 BT ATd AP 4

qTe—faars gfimy (fBArae uaer deieF) fada®, 2024
(faeme 1 # gReenfia wu )

RATIE USRI Bl AN aTa—(dars Uicrer S7fEf=1=s, 2006 (2007 BT ARTRH F=1E 6)
HT AWM H B forg faee |

YR TR & UdgcdRd 99 § feqrad ueer faum awr grr fa=foRad wu & g
Srfefrafad 81—

1. Hfera M, R] BT SR UR™——(1) 39 MMM @1 wiéra M qra—faare ufome
(fewTaeT W ene) Srfafere, 2024 € |




(2) v forflTas faare fdfaH, 1872 (15 of 1872) IR fdare &R fiare fawwsg
eI, 19367 (3 of 1936) GReW WA fAfer (K@) srfefraH, 1937 (26 of 1937) fawiy faare
4, 1954 (43 of 1954) f2=g fdarg orfaIf—™, 1955 (25 of 1955) AT fdaTe & Hag H U
ST @ =i fafe a1 v a1 wfg A1 aeR A1 aoand Ugd el o fafdr § fAifga foedt aa &
yfihet a1 IAD w«mgﬁﬁgqnﬂug%wamzﬁwaﬁﬁmwmw
Eﬂﬂl%ﬁml

(3) zu AW # IT ORI, ORI 2 & W (i) IR URT 4 T UG A U B
3R T IUGH I SMUTRET B ARG A QT 99 & FAUA D dNG F UG BT JAT $9
ARAFTH & URY & Fag H U AT Suey # Bl WaW &1 o1l I9 IUdY & UK Bl b HaH
H SITRIT ST |

2. ORT 2 & GYEA——da—fdarg ufomy fdfrm, 2006 ((GR1 39H 39 U9anq “qd
A" FHET AT 8) DT URT 2 H—

(i) @vs (@) & W R FAfaRad @vs @r S, sfeiid—
"(@) “aTeld” W, VAT JoY AT AR AT B, f sai 9y @l g R T8 B 8,

(i) @S (@) # "TA UGTHRI | A" TR D YA L UTBRI DI IMRIT B aren fhdT
g7 AT Hig AT JdeR Aled doa9d Ug< [l 3 Al # srafdse i) arq & ufdaa a1
AT B g 1 s 3R g sravenfa fy g |

3. ORI 3 & HARA—"qa A9 o aRT 3 B IT—GRT (3) H— "I 9" ¥e’l b
M R Ui ay” 9eq G ST |

4. ORI 18—F B JARIUA—TA AT & aRT 18—F & Ugan| FfeIRaa gRT
AU &I ST, rTiq—

"18—h. AT BT JARE Y9G SHL—s9 AT & SuS= B, TeTdRl b IR
PR ITell fHAT eI AT e A7 FIeR Aied aoamd Ug< [l o= Al § srfdee i
q1d & Ufddrel IT A B 8Y W YHTG BT |” |

5. wiaud RFEAREl & Seem——srggal # fafde s afafaal o s+ affa
JfF & e fhar S |

e SUR
©IRT 5 )
B T Iy s fere A REICEI
Hq=T
(1) (2) (3) (4) ()
1. 1872 15 TR fhf¥eas URT 60 @ WUS (1) & WM W
faarg srfarfeam, frfoRaa @ve @r e, sreriq—
1872. (1) fOATE @1 AR @ dTel I
IR S Bl Y sTFHE 99 |




2. 1936 3 IR¥ faarg 3R (F) gRT 3 DI ST (1) & Gvs
faesg—arfafam, (M) ¥ g8 AR © I, AORE
1936. qy @ Y YR TE DI 8" ARl

g fear
3. 1954 43 faemy faarg URT 4 & WUS () H "3ORE q¥”
rfSfaH, 1954. YG b WE TR OSIHN IY I

4. 1955 25 | foq faare (@) a~1 5 & @Wus (i) § "3ORE
arferfrr, 1955. Iy IRl B W R gIBE

(@) gRT 13 @I ST-aRT (2) &
Qg (V) # "36RE 9" |
D WM W SFHON qY I
W S |

I} 3R PR BT HUA

a1e faqre gfavy AfR=™, 2006 P11 [daT8 FOM AU BRI IR THdg AT IqD
ST Amel o ufiffg & & forg Suafda ox oq Rifafia fear o | smyfe gu
H AR yAd &3 H W BR E! ¢ | 9AMY, a1 {98 9 dael S AGErd DI W H dfcd
S5 ARG fAer § ff 9 8 | <ifie T iR SeaeR R o & & ofavRi & forg
SUeY B =Y dNcIprell & oy fdare & <gAaw g H ghg BRAT  3MaeIS B AT © | o9
UHR, A Uae 59§ AN 91 [qarg ufovy ffaftRE, 2006 3R o HafRrd srfefrAl |
AU fhar S e arfortell & fory faars &g gAdH MY BT 21 a9 AT IRt fhar T
g

Iz fagae Sugad Sewdl @l gfd & fau g |

(Sfo (B+ie1) &=t M ifsa)
JHRT HAT |



qTe—faarg gfony (fearae uer deieF) fada®, 2024

feArae UQe 59 ®1 AN dre—fdarg ufmer rfafRM, 2006 (2007 &1 AT H=TiE 6)
BT AR FeeT d & forg g |

(Sfo (B+ie1) &= M TMifSa)
UHRT HAT |

(¥RE HAR TAT)
g (fafd) |




AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT
BiLL No. 4 OF 2024

THE PROHIBITION OF CHILD MARRIAGE (HIMACHAL PRADESH
AMENDMENT) BILL, 2024

ARRANGEMENT OF CLAUSES
Clauses:

Short title, application and commencement.
Amendment of section 2.

Amendment of section 3.

Insertion of section 18A.

Amendment of certain enactments.

arwbdpE

BiLL No. 4 OF 2024

THE PROHIBITION OF CHILD MARRIAGE (HIMACHAL PRADESH
AMENDMENT) BILL, 2024

(As INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY)
A
BILL

to amend the Prohibition of Child Marriage Act, 2006 (Act No. 6 of 2007) in its
application to the State of Himachal Pradesh.

BE it enacted by the Legidative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-fifth year of
the Republic of India as follows.—

1. Short title, application and commencement .—(1) This Act may be caled the
Prohibition of Child Marriage (Himachal Pradesh Amendment) Act, 2024.

(2) It shal apply to al persons domiciled in the territory of the State of Himachal Pradesh
notwithstanding anything contrary or inconsistent therewith contained in the Indian Christian
Marriage Act, 1872 (15 of 1872) the Parsi Marriage and Divorce Act, 1936 (3 of 1936) the Muslim
Personal Law (Shariat) Application Act 1937 (26 of 1937) the Special Marriage Act, 1954 (43 of
1954) the Hindu Marriage Act, 1955 (25 of 1955) or any other law or custom or usage or practice
in relation to marriage, under any other law for the time being in force.

(3) This section, clause (ii) of section 2 and section 4 shall come into force immediately
and the remaining provisions shall come into force on the date of completion of two years from the
date of its enactment and any reference in any such provision to the commencement of this Act
shall be construed as a reference to the coming into force of that provision.



2.  Amendment of section 2.—In section 2 of the Prohibition of Child Marriage Act,
2006 (hereinafter referred to as the “principal Act”),-

(i) for clause (a), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(@) “child” means amale or female who has not completed twenty-one years of
age;”; and

(i) in clause (b), after the words “is a child”, the words “notwithstanding anything to
the contrary or inconsistent therewith contained in any other law for the time
being in force, including any custom or usage or practice governing the parties’
shall be inserted.

3.  Amendment of section 3.—In section 3 of the principle Act, in sub-section (3), for the
words “two years’, the words “five years’ shall be substituted.

4. Insertion of section 18-A.—After section 18 of the principal Act, the following
section shall be inserted, namely:—

“18A. Act to have overriding effect.—The provisions of this Act shall have effect,
notwithstanding anything contrary or inconsistent therewith contained in any other law
for the time being in force, including any custom or usage or practice governing the
parties.”.

5. Amendment of certain enactments—The enactments specified in THE
SCHEDULE shall be amended in the manner mentioned therein.

THE SCHEDULE

(See section 5)
Sl. No. Year Act No. Short title Amendment
1) (@) (©), (4) ©)
1. 1872 15 The Indian In section 60, for clause (1), the following
Christian Marriage clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(O the age of the man and woman
Act, 1872. intending to be married shall not be
under twenty-oneyears;”.

2. 1936 3 The Parsi @ in section 3, in sub-section (1), in
. clause (c), for the words

Marriage and “female, has not completed

Divorce Act, 1936 eighteen years of age’, the words

“female, has not completed
twenty-one years of age” shall be
substituted.

(b) in Schedule I1, the expression
“Signatures of the fathers or
guardians of the contracting
parties under 21 years of age’




shall be omitted.

3. 1954 43 The Special In section 4, in clause (c), for the
words “eighteen years’, the words “twenty-

Marriage Act, oneyears’ shall be substituted.
1954
4. 1955 25 The Hindu (8 in section 5, in clause (iii), for the
. words “eighteen years’, the words
Marriage “twenty-one  years’ shal be
Act,1955 substituted.

(b) insection 13, in sub-section (2), in
clause (iv), for the words “ eighteen
years’, the words “twenty-one
years’ shall be substituted.

STATEMENT OF OBJECT AND REASONS

The Prohibition of Child Marriage Act, 2006 was enacted to provide for the prohibition of
solemnisation of child marriages and for matters connected therewith or incidental thereto. In
today’s world the women are progressing in every field. The early marriages, however, act as a
hindrance not only in the progress of their career but also in their physical development. In order to
provide for gender equality and opportunities of obtaining higher education, it has become
necessary to increase the minimum age of marriage for the girls. Thus, it is proposed to amend the
Prohibition of Child Marriage Act, 2006 and other related Acts in their application to the State of
Himachal Pradesh and increase the minimum age for marriage for girlsto 21 years.

This Bill seeksto achieve the aforesaid objectives.

(DR. (COL.) DHANI RAM SHANDIL)
Minister-in-charge.

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

— Nil—

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

— Nil—



THE PROHIBITION OF CHILD MARRIAGE (HIMACHAL PRADESH AMENDMENT)
BILL, 2024

A
BILL

to amend the Prohibition of Child Marriage Act, 2006 (Act No. 6 of 2007) in its
application to the State of Himachal Pradesh.

(DR. (COL.) DHANI RAM SHANDIL)
Minister-in-Charge.

(SHARAD KUMAR LAGWAL)
Secretary (Law).




