
 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

jkti=] fgekpy izns'k 

fgekpy izns'k jkT; 'kklu }kjk izdkf'kr 
cq/kokj] 15 vDrwcj] 2025@23 vkf'ou] 1947 

 

 
 
 

 
fgekpy izns'k ljdkj 

 
fof/k foHkkx 

 
vf/klwpuk 

 
f'keyk&2] 14 vDrwcj] 2025 

 
 la[;k% ,y-,y-vkj-&Mh-¼6½&11@2025&yst-&&fgekpy izns'k ds jkT;iky us Hkkjr ds lafo/kku ds 
vuqPNsn  200 ds v/khu iznRr 'kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx djrs gq,  fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL;ksa ds HkÙks vkSj 
152&jkti=@2025&15&10&2025          ¼6575½  



 6576        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 15 vDrwcj] 2025@23 vkf'ou] 1947         
 
 

isa'ku½ la'kks/ku fo/ks;d] 2025 ¼2025 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 9½ dks vuqeksfnr dj fn;k gS rFkk vuqPNsn 348 
ds [k.M ¼3½ ds v/khu] fo/ks;d ds vaxzsth ikB dks jkti=] fgekpy izns'k esa izdkf'kr djus ds fy, 
izkf/k—r dj fn;k gSA vr% mijksDr fo/ks;d dks o"kZ 2025 ds vf/kfu;e la[;kad 38 ds :i esa vaxszth 
izkf/k—r ikB lfgr jkti= ¼bZ&xtV½ fgekpy izns'k esa izdkf'kr fd;k tkrk gSA 

 
vkns'k }kjk] 

gLrk{kfjr@&  
¼MkW0 foosd T;ksfr½] 

la;qDr fof/k ijke'khZA  
&&&&&&&& 

 
2025 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kd 38- 

 
fgekpy Áns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼LknL;ksa ds HkÙks vkSj isa'ku½ la'ksk/ku vf/kfu;e] 2025 

  
/kkjkvksa dk Øe 

 
/kkjk %   
 
 1- laf{kIr ukeA 
 2- /kkjk 3 dk la'kks/kuA       
 3- /kkjk 4 dk la'kks/kuA  
 4- /kkjk 4&[k dk izfrLFkkiuA   
 5- /kkjk 5 dk izfrLFkkiuA 
 6- /kkjk 5&d dk yksiA 
 7- /kkjk 6 dk la'kks/kuA     
 8- /kkjk 6&d dk la'kks/kuA     
 9- /kkjk 6&[k dk la'kks/kuA 
 10- /kkjk 6&x x dk yksiA   
 

&&&&&&&&&& 
 
 

2025 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 38- 
 

fgekpy Áns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼LknL;ksa ds HkÙks vkSj isa'ku½ la'kks/ku vf/kfu;e] 2025 
 

¼ekuuh; jkT;iky egksn; }kjk ;Fkkvuqeksfnr½ 
 

 fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼LknL;ksa ds HkÙks vkSj isa'ku½ vf/kfu;e] 1971 ¼1971 dk vf/kfu;e 
la[;kad 8½ dk vkSj la'kks/ku djus ds fy, vf/kfu;eA 

 
 Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds fNgÙkjosa o’kZ esa fgekpy izns'k fo/kku LkHkk }kjk fuEufyf[kr :Ik esa ;g 
vf/kfu;fer gks%& 
 
 
 1-   laf{kIr uke-&&bl vf/kfu;e dk laf{kIr uke fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼LknL;ksa ds HkÙks vkSj 
isa'ku½ la'kks/ku vf/kfu;e] 2025 gSA 



 

 

6577jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 15 vDrwcj] 2025@23 vkf'ou] 1947         
 2-   /kkjk 3 dk la'kks/ku-&&fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk ¼LknL;ksa ds HkÙks vkSj isa'ku½ vf/kfu;e] 1971 
¼ftls blesa blds Ik'pkr~ ^^ewy vf/kfu;e** dgk x;k gS½ dh /kkjk 3 esa]  
 

  ¼d½ gkf'k, ds 'kh"kZd esa ^^osru vkSj izfrdjkRed HkRrk** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^lnL; ds osru** 
'kCn j[ks tk,axs( 

  

  ¼[k½ mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa]& 
 

    ¼i½ ^^ipiu gtkj** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^ipklh gtkj** 'kCn j[ks tk,axs( vkSj 
 

   ¼ii½ ^^vkSj ikap gtkj #i, dh nj ls izfrdjkRed HkRrk** 'kCnksa dk yksi fd;k tk,xk( 
 

  ¼x½ mi&/kkjk ¼1&d½ ds i'pkr~ fuEufyf[kr j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
   

   ^^¼2½ lnL; dk osru vk;dj vf/kfu;e] 1961 ¼1961 dk 43½ dh /kkjk 48 ds 
Li"Vhdj.k ds [k.M ¼v½ ds v/khu micaf/kr ykxr eqnzkLQhfr lwpdkad ds vk/kkj 
ij izFke vizSy] 2030 ls izkjEHk gq, izR;sd ikap o"kks± ds i'pkr~ c<+k;k tk,xkA**A 

 

 3- /kkjk 4 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 4 dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ ds [kaM ¼ii½ esa ^^,d gt+kj 
vkB lkS** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gt+kj ikap lkS** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
  
 4- /kkjk 4&[k dk izfrLFkkiu-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 4&[k ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr j[kk 
tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 
  ^^4&[k- fuokZpu {ks= vkSj dk;kZy; HkRRkk]&¼1½ ÁR;sd lnL; dks ,d yk[k chl gtkj #Ik, 

dh nj ls fuokZpu {ks= HkŸkk Hkh lanŸk fd;k tk,xkA 
 
   ¼2½   ÁR;sd lnL; dks uCcs gtkj #Ik,  izfrekl dh nj ls dk;kZy; HkŸkk lanŸk fd;k 

tk,xkAÞA 
 

 5- /kkjk 5 dk izfrLFkkiu-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 5 ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr j[kk tk,xk] 
vFkkZr~%& 
 
  ^^5- lq[k lqfo/kk,a-&lnL; lHkk dh cSBd ds LFkku ij fj;k;rh njksa ij ,sls fuokl LFkku dk 

gdnkj gksxk tks /kkjk 7 ds v/khu fu;eksa }kjk fofgr fd;k tk,A**A 
 

  6- /kkjk 5&d dk yksi-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 5&d dk yksi fd;k tk,xkA 
 

 7- /kkjk  6 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 6 esa]& 
 
  ¼d½ mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa]&  
 
 ¼i½ ^^pkj yk[k #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^Ng yk[k #Ik,** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA  
 ¼ii½  f}rh; ijarqd ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr%& 
 

 

    ^^ijarq VSDlh }kjk ;k=k dk O;; okLrfod vkèkkj ij gksxk fdUrq izfr fdyksehVj 
izHkkj iPphl #i, ls vuf/kd rFkk Ng yk[k #i, dh vf/kdre lhek ds Hkhrj 
gksxk%**( vkSj 

 
  ¼[k½  mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa ^^ÁR;sd lnL;** ds Ik'pkr~ ^^vkfèkdkfjd nkSjs ds nkSjku** “kCn 

vUr%LFkkfir fd, tk,axs vkSj ^^iPPkhl gtkj** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^ipkl gtkj** “kCn 
j[ks tk,axsA 



 6578        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 15 vDrwcj] 2025@23 vkf'ou] 1947         
 8- /kkjk 6&d dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 6&d esa]& 
 
  ¼d½ ^^nks yk[k #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^rhu yk[k #Ik;s** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 

  ¼[k½  izFke ijarqd ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 

   ^^ijarq VSDlh }kjk ;k=k dk O;; okfLrfod vk/kkj ij gksxk fdUrq izfr fdyksehVj izHkkj 
^iPphl :Ik,* ls vuf/kd rFkk *rhu yk[k #Ik,* dh vf/kdre lhek ds Hkhrj gksxk%ß( 
vkSj  

 
  ¼x½ f}rh; ijarqd esa ^^nks yk[k #Ik,]** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^rhu yk[k #Ik,*** “kCn j[ks 

tk,axsA  
 

 9- /kkjk 6&[k dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 6&[k esa]& 
 

  ¼d½ mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa ^^NÙkhl gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^ipkl gtkj #Ik,** “kCn j[ks 
tk,axsA 

  ¼[k½ mi/kkjk ¼1½ ds i'pkr~ fuEufyf[kr var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~& 
 
   ^^¼1&d½ lnL; dk osru vk;dj vf/kfu;e] 1961 ¼1961 dk 43½ dh /kkjk 48 ds 

Li"Vhdj.k ds [k.M ¼v½ ds v/khu micaf/kr ykxr eqnzkLQhfr lwpdkad ds vk/kkj ij 
izFke vizSy] 2030 ls izkjEHk gq, izR;sd ikap o"kks± ds i'pkr~ c<+k;k tk,xkA**A 

 
 10- /kkjk 6&x x dk yksi-&&/kkjk 6&x x dk yksi fd;k tk,xkA  
 
 

&&&&&&&&& 

 
 

AUTHORITATIVE  ENGLISH  TEXT 
 

Act No. 38  of  2025. 
 

THE  HIMACHAL  PRADESH  LEGISLATIVE  ASSEMBLY  (ALLOWANCES  AND  
PENSION  OF  MEMBERS)  AMENDMENT ACT,  2025 

 
ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS 

 
Sections: 
 
 
 1. Short title. 
 2. Amendment of section 3. 
 3. Amendment of section 4. 
 4. Substitution of section 4-B. 
 5. Substitution of section 5. 
 6. Omission of section 5-A. 
 7. Amendment of section 6. 
 8. Amendment of section 6-A. 
 9. Amendment of section 6-B. 
 10. Omission of section 6-CC. 



 

 

6579jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 15 vDrwcj] 2025@23 vkf'ou] 1947         
Act No.  38 of  2025. 

 
THE  HIMACHAL   PRADESH  LEGISLATIVE  ASSEMBLY  (ALLOWANCES  AND  

PENSION  OF  MEMBERS)  AMENDMENT ACT,  2025 
 

(AS ASSSENDED TO BY THE GOVERNOR) 
 

AN 
 

ACT 
 

 further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of 
Members) Act, 1971 (Act No. 8 of 1971). 
 
 BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-sixth Year 
of the Republic of India as follows:— 
 
 1. Short title.—This Act may be called The Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly 
(Allowances and  Pension of Members) Amendment Act, 2025. 

 
 2. Amendment of section 3.—In section 3 of the Himachal Pradesh Legislative 
Assembly  (Allowances and Pension of Members)  Act, 1971 (hereinafter referred to as the  
“principal Act”),— 
 
   (a) in marginal heading for the words "Salary and compensatory allowance", the 

words "Salary to a Member" shall be substituted; 
   
  (b) in  sub-section  (1),— 
 
   (i) for  the  words  “fifty five  thousand”, the  words  “eighty five thousand”  

shall  be substituted; and 
 

   (ii) the words "and compensatory allowance at the rate of  five thousand rupees" 
shall be omitted; 

 
  (c) after sub-section (1-A), the following shall be inserted, namely:— 
 
   “(2) The salary of a member shall be increased after every five years commencing 

from 1st April, 2030 on the basis of Cost Inflation Index provided under clause (v) 
of Explanation to section 48 of the Income Tax Act, 1961(43 of 1961).”. 

 

 3. Amendment of section 4.—In  section  4  of  the  principal  Act, in sub-section (1),  in    
clause (ii), for the words “one thousand eight hundred”, the words “two thousand five hundred” 
shall be substituted. 
 

 4. Substitution of section 4-B.—For section 4-B of the principal Act, the following shall 
be substituted, namely:—                                                               
 
  “4-B.  Constituency and Office Allowance.—(1) There shall be paid to each member 

a constituency allowance at the rate of one   lakh  twenty thousand rupees per mensem. 
 
   (2)  There shall be paid to each member an office allowance at  the rate of  ninety 

thousand rupees per mensem. ”. 



 6580        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 15 vDrwcj] 2025@23 vkf'ou] 1947         
 5. Substitution of section 5.—For section 5 of the principal Act, the following shall be    
substituted, namely:- 
 
  "5. Amenities.—A member shall be entitled to such residential accommodation on 

concessional rates at the place of sitting of the Assembly as may be prescribed by rules 
under section 7. ". 

  
 6.   Omission of section 5-A.—Section 5-A of  the principal Act shall be omitted. 

 
 7.  Amendment of section 6.—In section 6 of  the  principal Act,—   
                                             
           (a)   in sub-section (1),— 
                                                                     
                  (i) for the words “four  lac  rupees”, the words “six lakh rupees” shall  be 

substituted;                                                                                                          
    
   (ii)  for the second proviso, the following shall be substituted, namely:— 
       
    “Provided that the expenses of journey by taxi shall be on actual basis but 

per kilometer charges shall not exceed twenty five rupees and shall be within 
the maximum limit of six lakh rupees:”; and 

 

  (b)  in  sub-section (2), after the  words  “Each member”, the   words  “during  official   
tour”  shall be  inserted  and for  the  words  “twenty five  thousand”,  the words  
“fifty thousand” shall be substituted. 

 

 8.  Amendment of section 6-A.—In section 6-A of  the  principal Act,— 
 

  (a) for  the words “two lac  rupees”, the words  “three lakh rupees” shall be 
substituted; 

                            
  (b)   for the  first  proviso,   the following shall  be substituted, namely: 
       
    “Provided that the expenses of journey by taxi shall  be on actual basis but per 

kilometer charges shall not exceed twenty five  rupees and shall be within  the  
maximum  limit  of  three  lakh rupees:”;  and 

 
  (c)   in  the  second  proviso,  for  the words “two lac rupees,” the words “three lakh 

rupees” shall be substituted. 

 
 9. Amendment of section 6-B.—In  section 6-B of the principal  Act,—    
                                
              (a)  in sub-section (1),  for  the  words and figures  “Rs. 36,000”,  the words “fifty 

thousand rupees” shall be substituted; and   
 
  (b) after sub-section (1), the following shall be inserted, namely:— 
 
   “(1-A) The pension of a member  for the first term shall be increased after every 

five years commencing from 1st April, 2030 on the basis of Cost Inflation Index 
provided under clause (v) of Explanation to section 48 of the Income Tax Act, 
1961(43 of 1961).”. 

    
 10. Omission of section 6-CC.—Section 6-CC shall be omitted. 



 

 

6581jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 15 vDrwcj] 2025@23 vkf'ou] 1947         
fof/k foHkkx 

 
vf/klwpuk 

 
f'keyk&2] 14 vDrwcj] 2025 

 
 la[;k% ,y-,y-vkj-&Mh-¼6½&5@2025&yst-&&fgekpy izns'k ds jkT;iky us Hkkjr ds lafo/kku    
ds vuqPNsn 200 ds v/khu iznRr 'kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx djrs gq,  fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk v/;{k vkSj 
mik/;{k osru ¼la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2025 ¼2025 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 10½ dks vuqeksfnr dj fn;k gS rFkk 
vuqPNsn 348 ds [k.M ¼3½ ds v/khu] fo/ks;d ds vaxzsth ikB dks jkti=] fgekpy izns'k esa izdkf'kr djus 
ds fy, izkf/k—r dj fn;k gSA vr% mijksDr fo/ks;d dks o"kZ 2025 ds vf/kfu;e la[;kad 40 ds :i esa 
vaxszth izkf/k—r ikB lfgr jkti= ¼bZ&xtV½ fgekpy izns'k esa izdkf'kr fd;k tkrk gSA 

 
vkns'k }kjk] 

gLrk{kfjr@& 
¼MkW0 foosd T;ksfr½] 

la;qDr fof/k ijke'khZA  
&&&&&&&& 

 
2025 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 40- 

 
fgekpy Áns'k fo/kku lHkk v/;{k vkSj mik/;{k osru ¼la'ksk/ku½ vf/kfu;e] 2025 

 
/kkjkvksa ds Øe 

 
/kkjk%   
 
 1- Lkaf{kIr uke A 
 2- /kkjk 3 dk la”kks/kuA       
 3- /kkjk 4 dk la”kks/kuA 
 4- /kkjk 8 dk yksiA 
  5- /kkjk 10&d dk la”kks/kuA    
    
       

&&&&&&&& 
 
 

2025 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 40- 
 

 
fgekpy Áns'k fo/kku lHkk v/;{k vkSj mik/;{k osru ¼la'kks/ku½ vf/kfu;e] 2025 

 
¼ekuuh; jkT;iky egksn; }kjk ;Fkkvuqeksfnr½ 

 
 fgekpy Áns”k fo/kku lHkk v/;{k vkSj mik/;{k osru vf/kfu;e] 1971 ¼1971 dk vf/kfu;e 
la[;kad 4½ dk vkSj la”kks/ku djus ds fy, vf/kfu;e A 
 
 Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds fNgÙkjosa o’kZ esa fgekpy izns”k fo/kku LkHkk }kjk fuEufyf[kr :Ik esa ;g 
vf/kfu;fer gks%& 



 6582        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 15 vDrwcj] 2025@23 vkf'ou] 1947         
 1- Lkaf{kIr uke-&&bl vf/kfu;e dk laf{kIr uke fgekpy Áns”k fo/kku lHkk vè;{k vkSj mik/;{k 
osru ¼la'kks/ku½ vf/kfu;e] 2025 gSA 
 
 2- /kkjk 3 dk la”kks/ku-&&fgekpy Áns”k fo/kku lHkk v/;{k vkSj mik/;{k osru vfèkfu;e] 1971 
¼ftls blesa blds i'pkr~ ^^ewy vf/kfu;e** dgk x;k gS½ dh èkkjk 3 esa]& 
  
 ¼d½ mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa] ^^vLLkh gtkj** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^ipkuoaas  gtkj** 'kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 ¼[k½ mi&/kkjk ¼1&v½ ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr j[kk tk;sxk] vFkkZr~%&& 
 
  ^^¼1&v½ v/;{k dk osru] vk;dj vf/kfu;e] 1961 ¼1961 dk 43½ dh /kkjk 48 ds Li"Vhdj.k 

ds [k.M ¼5½ ds v/khu micaf/kr ykxr eqnzkLQhfr lwpdkad ds vk/kkj ij izFke vizSy] 2030 
ls izkjEHk gksrs gq, izR;sd ikap o"kks± ds i'pkr~ c<+k;k tk,xkA**( vkSj 

 

 ¼x½ mi&/kkjk ¼1&vk½ esa ^^ipkuosa gtkj** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^,d yk[k ipkl gtkj** 'kCn j[ks 
tk,axsA 

   
 3-  /kkjk 4 dk la”kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 4 eas]& 
 
 ¼d½ mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa]&&^^ipgrj gtkj** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^ckuosa gtkj** 'kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 ¼[k½ mi&/kkjk ¼1&v½ ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr~%&& 
 
  ^^¼1&v½ mik/;{k dk osru] vk;dj vf/kfu;e] 1961¼1961 dk 43½ dh /kkjk 48 ds Li"Vhdj.k 

ds [k.M ¼5½ ds v/khu micaf/kr ykxr eqnzkLQhfr lwpdkad ds vk/kkj ij izFke vizSy] 2030 
ls izkjEHk gksrs gq, izR;sd ikap o"kks± ds i'pkr~ c<+k;k tk,xkA**( vkSj 

 
 ¼x½ mi&/kkjk  ¼1&vk½ esa] ^^ipkuosa gtkj** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^,d yk[k ipkl gtkj** 'kCn j[ks 

tk,axsA 
 
 4- /kkjk 8 dk yksi-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 8 dk yksi fd;k tk,xkA 
 
 5- /kkjk 10&d dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 10&d esa]&& 
 
  ¼d½  mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa]&& 
 
    (i) ^^pkj yk[k #Ik;s** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^Ng yk[k #Ik;s** 'kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
   (ii) mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ds izFke ijarqd ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 
    ^^ijarq VSDlh }kjk dh xbZ ;k=k dk O;; okLrfod vk/kkj ij lans; gksxk fdUrq 

izfr fdyksehVj izHkkj iPphl #Ik;s ls vuf/kd rFkk N% yk[k #i;s dh vfèkdre 
lhek ds Hkhrj gksxk**%A( vkSj 

 
   (iii)  f}rh; ijarqd esa ^^pkj yk[k #Ik;s** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^Ng yk[k #Ik;s** “kCn j[ks 

tk,axsA 
 
  ¼[k½ mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa ^^iPPkhl gtkj** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^ipkl gtkj** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 



 

 

6583jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 15 vDrwcj] 2025@23 vkf'ou] 1947         
AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT 

 
  Act No. 40 of 2025. 

 
THE HIMACHAL PRADESH  LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY SPEAKER’S AND DEPUTY 

SPEAKER’S SALARIES (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2025 
 

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS 
Sections:  

 
 1. Short title.  
 2. Amendment of section 3.   
 3. Amendment of section 4.  
 4. Omission of section 8. 
 5. Amendment of section 10-A.     
                                                  

 
 

___________ 
 

Act No. 40 of 2025. 
 

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH  LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY SPEAKER’S AND DEPUTY 
SPEAKER’S SALARIES (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2025 

 
(AS ASSENTED TO BY THE GOVERNOR) 

 
AN 

 
ACT 

 
 further to amend the Himachal Pradesh  Legislative Assembly Speaker’s and Deputy 
Speaker’s Salaries Act, 1971 (Act No. 4 of 1971). 
 
 BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-sixth Year of 
the Republic of India as follows:— 
  
 1. Short title.—This Act may be called the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly 
Speaker’s and Deputy Speaker’s Salaries (Amendment) Act, 2025.     
         
 2.  Amendment of section 3.—In Section 3 of the Himachal Pradesh Legislative  
Assembly Speaker’s and Deputy Speaker’s Salaries Act, 1971 (hereinafter referred to as the 
“principal  Act”),— 
 
 (a)  in sub-section (1), for the words “eighty thousand”, the words “ninety five thousand”  

shall be substituted;  
 
 (b)  for sub-section (1-A), the following shall be substituted, namely:— 
 
  "(1-A)  The salary of the Speaker shall be increased after every five years commencing 

from 1st April, 2030 on the basis of Cost Inflation Index provided under clause (v) of 
Explanation to section 48 of the Income Tax Act, 1961 (43 of 1961)."; and 



 6584        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 15 vDrwcj] 2025@23 vkf'ou] 1947         
 (c)  in   sub-section   (1-B),  for   the  words  “ninety five  thousand”, the words “one lakh 

fifty thousand”  shall be  substituted.   
 
 3. Amendment of section 4.—In section 4 of the principal Act,—                                                 
 
 (a)  in   sub-section (1),  for   the    words, “seventy  five     thousand”,  the  words  “ninety 

two thousand”  shall  be substituted; 
 
 (b) for sub-section (1-A), the following shall be substituted, namely:— 
 
  "(1-A)  The salary of the Deputy Speaker shall be increased after every five years 

commencing from 1st April, 2030 on the basis of cost inflation index provided under 
clause (v) of Explanation to section 48 of the Income Tax Act, 1961(43 of 1961)."; and 

 
 (c)  in  sub-section  (1-B),  for   the  words  “ninety  five thousand”, the words “one lakh 

fifty thousand”  shall be substituted.  
 
 4. Omission of section 8.—Section 8 of the principal Act shall be omitted. 
 
 5. Amendment of section 10-A.—In section 10-A of the principal Act,—                                        
               
 (a)  in sub-section (1),— 
 
  (i)  for the words “four lac rupees”, the words “six  lakh rupees”  shall  be  

substituted;  
                                                                                                             
         (ii)  for the first  proviso, the following  shall be  substituted, namely:—  
  
   “Provided that the expenses of journey by taxi shall be on actual basis but per 

kilometer charges shall not exceed twenty five rupees and shall be within the 
maximum limit of six lakh rupees:”; and 

 
  (iii)  in the second  proviso, for the  words “four lac rupees” the words “six lakh 

rupees” shall be substituted; and  
 
  (b)  in sub-section (2), for the  words “twenty five  thousand”,   the words “fifty thousand” 

shall be  substituted. 

 
__________ 

 
 
 
 

fof/k foHkkx 
 

vf/klwpuk 
 

f'keyk&2] 14 vDrwcj] 2025 
 

 la[;k% ,y-,y-vkj-&Mh-¼6½&4@2025&yst-&&fgekpy izns'k ds jkT;iky us Hkkjr ds lafo/kku ds 
vuqPNsn 200 ds v/khu iznRr 'kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx djrs gq,  eaf=;ksa ds osru vkSj HkÙkk ¼fgekpy izns'k½  



 

 

6585jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 15 vDrwcj] 2025@23 vkf'ou] 1947         
la'kks/ku fo/ks;d] 2025 ¼2025 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 8½ dks vuqeksfnr dj fn;k gS rFkk vuqPNsn 348 ds 
[k.M ¼3½ ds v/khu] fo/ks;d ds vaxzsth ikB dks jkti=] fgekpy izns'k esa izdkf'kr djus ds fy, izkf/k—r 
dj fn;k gSA vr% mijksDr fo/ks;d dks o"kZ 2025 ds vf/kfu;e la[;kad 39 ds :i esa vaxszth izkf/k—r ikB 
lfgr jkti= ¼bZ&xtV½ fgekpy izns'k esa izdkf'kr fd;k tkrk gSA 

 
vkns'k }kjk] 

gLrk{kfjr@& 
¼MkW0 foosd T;ksfr½] 

la;qDr fof/k ijke'khZA  
 

&&&&&&&& 
 

2025 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 39- 
 

eaf=;ksa ds osru vkSj HkRRkk ¼fgekpy izns'k½ la'kks/ku vf/kfu;e] 2025 
  

/kkjkvksa ds Øe 
 

/kkjk %   
 
 1- Lkaf{kIr uke A 
 2- /kkjk 3 dk la'kks/kuA       
 3- /kkjk 4 dk izfrLFkkiuA  
 4- /kkjk 7 dk la'kks/kuA 
 5- /kkjk 10 dk yksiA 
 6- /kkjk 14&d vkSj 14&[k dk var%LFkkiuA  
 
 

&&&&&&&&&& 
    

2025 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 39- 
 

eaf=;ksa ds osru vkSj HkRRkk ¼fgekpy izns'k½ la'kks/ku vf/kfu;e] 2025 
 

¼ekuuh; jkT;iky egksn; }kjk ;Fkkvuqeksfnr½ 
 

 eaf=;ksa ds osru vkSj HkRRkk ¼fgekpy izns'k½ vf/kfu;e] 2000 ¼2000 dk vfèkfu;e la[;kad 11½ dk 
vkSj la'kks/ku djus ds fy, vf/kfu;eA 
 
 Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds fNgÙkjosa o’kZ esa fgekpy izns'k fo/kku LkHkk }kjk fuEufyf[kr :Ik esa ;g 
vf/kfu;fer gks%& 
 
 1-  Lkaf{kIr uke-&&bl vf/kfu;e dk laf{kIr uke eaf=;ksa ds osru vkSj HkRRkk ¼fgekpy izns'k½ 
la'kks/ku vf/kfu;e] 2025 gSA 
 
 2-  /kkjk 3 dk la'kks/ku-&&eaf=;ksa ds osru vkSj HkÙkk ¼fgekpy çns'k½ vf/kfu;e] 2000 ¼ftls blesa 
blds i'pkr~ ^^ewy vf/kfu;e** dgk x;k gS½ dh /kkjk 3 esa]& 
 
   ¼d½ mi&èkkjk ¼1½ ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr~%&  



 6586        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 15 vDrwcj] 2025@23 vkf'ou] 1947         
  ^^¼1½ çR;sd eU=h fuEufyf[kr njksa ij osru ysus dk gdnkj gksxk] vFkkZRk~%& 
 
    ¼d½  eq[; eU=h  ,d yk[k ianzg gtkj #i, çfrekl(       
 
    ¼[k½ dsfcusV eU=h  ipkuos gtkj #i, çfrekl(  
 
    ¼x½ jkT; eU=h  frjkuos gtkj #i, çfrekl( vkSj      
  
    ¼?k½ mi eU=h  vLlh gtkj #i, çfreklA**( vkSj 
 
  ¼[k½ mi&/kkjk ¼2½ ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 
   ^^¼2½ eaf=;ksa dk osru vk;dj vf/kfu;e] 1961 dh /kkjk 48 ds Li"Vhdj.k ds [k.M ¼v½ 

ds v/khu micaf/kr ykxr eqnzkLQhfr lwpdkad ds vk/kkj ij izFke vizSy] 2030 ls izkjEHk 
gq, izR;sd ikap o"kks± ds i'pkr~ c<+k;k tk,xkA**A 

 
 3- /kkjk 4 dk izfrLFkkiu-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 4 ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr j[kk tk,xk] 
vFkkZr~%& 
 

  ^^4- lRdkj HkRrk-&izR;sd eU=h ,d yk[k ipkl gtkj #i, izfrekl dh nj ls lRdkj HkRrk 
izkIr djus dk gdnkj gksxkA**A 

 
 
 4- /kkjk 7 dk la'kks/ku-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 7 esa]&&  
 
  ¼d½ mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa]&&  
 
   ¼i½ ^^pkj yk[k #Ik,** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^Ng yk[k #i,** 'kCn j[ks tk,axsA  
 
   ¼ii½ izFke ijarqd ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr ijUrqd j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 
    ^^ijarq VSDlh }kjk dh xbZ ;k=k dk O;; okLrfod vkèkkj ij lans; gksxk fdUrq 

izfr fdyksehVj izHkkj iPphl #Ik, ls vufèkd rFkk Ng yk[k #i, dh vfèkdre 
lhek ds Hkhrj gksxkA**( vkSj 

 
   ¼iii½ f}rh; ijarqd esa ^^pkj yk[k #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^Ng yk[k #i,** “kCn j[ks 

tk,axs( vkSj   
 
  ¼[k½ mi/kkjk ¼2½ esa ^^iPPkhl gtkj** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^ipkl gtkj** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 
 5- /kkjk 10 dk yksi-&&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 10 dk yksi fd;k tk,xkA 
 
 
 6- /kkjk 14&d vkSj 14&[k dk var%LFkkiu-&&/kkjk 14 ds i'pkr~ fuEufyf[kr var%LFkkfir fd;k 

tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 
  ^^14&d- iwoZ eq[; eU=h dks vkokl-&iwoZ eq[; eU=h Vkbi&VI ;k mlls Åij ds izoxZ ds 

vkokl dk gdnkj gksxkA 



 

 

6587jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 15 vDrwcj] 2025@23 vkf'ou] 1947         
  14&[k- usrk izfri{k dks osru vkSj HkRrs-&usrk izfri{k] mlh nj ij osru] HkRrs vkSj izlqfo/kk,a 

izkIr djus dk gdnkj gksxk tks bl vf/kfu;e ds v/khu ljdkj ds dsfcusV eU=h dks vuqKs; 
gSA 

 
 Li"Vhdj.k-&bl /kkjk ds iz;kstu ds fy, ^^usrk izfri{k** ls] fo/kku lHkk dk lnL; tks rRle; 
ljdkj ds izfri{k esa lokZf/kd la[;kcy j[kus okys foi{kh ny dk usrk gS vkSj ftls fo/kkulHkk v/;{k 
}kjk ,sls usrk ds :i esa ekU;rk iznku dh xbZ gS] vfHkizsr gSA 
 
 ¼2½ bl vf/kfu;e ds v/khu dsfcusV eU=h dks fof'k"Vr;k micaf/kr ds flok;] usrk izfri{k 
fgekpy izns'k dh fo/kku lHkk ds lnL; ds :i esa osru] HkRrs vkSj izlqfo/kkvksa ds :i esa fdlh jkf'k dks 
izkIr djus dk gdnkj ugha gksxkA**A 
 

&&&&&&&&& 
 

AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT 
 

Act  No. 39 of 2025. 
 

THE SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES OF MINISTERS (HIMACHAL PRADESH) 
AMENDMENT ACT, 2025 

 
ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS 

 
Sections:  
 
 1. Short title.  
 2. Amendment of section 3.   
 3. Substitution of section 4.         
 4. Amendment of section 7.  
 5. Omission of section 10.  
 6. Insertion of sections 14-A and 14-B. 
 

__________ 
    
 

 Act  No. 39 of 2025. 
 

 THE SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES OF MINISTERS (HIMACHAL PRADESH) 
AMENDMENT ACT, 2025 

 
 (AS ASSENTED TO BY THE GOVERNOR) 

 
AN 

 
ACT 

 
 further to amend the Salaries and Allowances of Ministers (Himachal Pradesh) Act, 2000 
(Act No. 11 of 2000). 
 
 BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-sixth Year of 
the Republic of India as follows:—  



 6588        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 15 vDrwcj] 2025@23 vkf'ou] 1947         
 1. Short title.—This Act may be called the Salaries and Allowances of Ministers 
(Himachal Pradesh) Amendment Act, 2025.             
 
 2.  Amendment of section 3.—In section 3 of the Salaries and Allowances of Ministers 
(Himachal Pradesh) Act, 2000 (hereinafter referred to as the  “principal Act”), —  
 
 (a) for sub-section (1), the following shall be substituted, namely:—  
  
  “(1) Each Minister shall be entitled to receive a  salary at the  following rates, 

namely:— 
 
  (a) Chief Minister One  lakh fifteen thousand rupees per mensem; 
 

  (b) Cabinet Minister     Ninety five thousand rupees per mensem; 
 

  (c) Minister of State  Ninety three thousand rupees per mensem; and 
 

  (d) Deputy Minister      Eighty thousand rupees per mensem.”; and  
 
 (b) for sub-section (2), the  following  shall  be  substituted, namely:— 
 
  "(2)  The salary of a Minister shall be increased after every five years commencing 

from 1st April, 2030 on the basis of Cost Inflation Index provided under clause (v) of 
Explanation to section 48 of the Income Tax Act, 1961.".   

 
                  
 3. Substitution of section 4.—For  section 4 of the principal Act,  the following  shall be      
substituted, namely:— 
 
  “4.  Sumptuary Allowance.—Each Ministers shall be entitled to receive sumptuary 

allowance at the rate of  rupees one lakh fifty thousand per mensem.”.  
  
 
 4. Amendment of section 7.—In section 7 of the principal Act,—                                                  
 
 (a) in sub-section (1),—                                                         
  
  (i)   for  the words “four lac rupees”, the words “six lakh rupees” shall  be substituted; 
 
  (ii)  for the first  proviso, the following proviso shall be  substituted, namely:—  
 
   “Provided that the expenses of journey by taxi  shall be on actual basis but per 

kilometer charges shall not  exceed twenty five rupees and  shall be  within the 
maximum limit of six lakh rupees:”; and 

 
  (iii)  in the second proviso, for   the   words “four lac rupees”, the words “six lakh 

rupees”  shall  be  substituted;  and  
 
 (b)  in sub-section (2),  for  the  words “twenty five  thousand”, the   words “fifty thousand” 

shall be  substituted. 
 
 
 5. Omission of section 10.—Section 10 of the principal Act shall be omitted.  



 

 

6589jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 15 vDrwcj] 2025@23 vkf'ou] 1947         
 6. Insertion of sections 14-A and 14-B.—After section 14 of the principal Act, the 
following shall be inserted, namely:— 
 
  "14-A.  Residence to Ex-Chief Minister.—The Ex-Chief Minister shall be entitled 

for an accommodation of  Type-VI category or above. 
 
  14-B.  Salary and allowances to Leader of Opposition.—(1) The Leader of 

Opposition shall be entitled to receive  salary, allowances and benefits as admissible to 
a Cabinet Minister of the Government under this Act. 

 
  Explanation.—For the purpose of this section, "Leader of Opposition" means a 

Member of the Legislative Assembly, who is, for the time being, the Leader of the 
party in opposition to the Government having the greatest numerical strength and 
recognised as such by the Speaker of the Legislative Assembly. 

 
  (2)  The Leader of Opposition shall not be entitled to receive any sum by way of 

salary, allowances and benefits, as a Member of the Legislative Assembly of 
Himachal Pradesh  except what is specifically provided to a Cabinet Minister 
under this Act.". 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 6590        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 15 vDrwcj] 2025@23 vkf'ou] 1947         
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

fu;U=d] eqnz.k rFkk ys[ku lkexzh] fgekpy izns'k] f'keyk&5 }kjk eqfnzr rFkk izdkf'kr 
bysDVªkWfud gLrk{kfjr jkti=] oSclkbV http://rajpatrahimachal.nic.in ij miyC/k gS ,oe~ vkWuykbu lR;kfir fd;k tk ldrk gSA   


		2025-10-15T19:46:48+0530
	DAYA NAND SHARMA




