Bl erew v wer

This 1s a digitally signed Gazette, to verify click here.
http://rajpatrahimachal.nic.in

o194, feATae uaer

R <Yl ST I gRT UahIfed

UAR, 15 3ER, 2025 /23 AR, 1947

fRHraeT UeY WRAR

fafer favmr

RMe—2, 14 ddR, 2025

AT YU MR—SL.(6)—11 / 2025—arSl.——TBHATEOA U & TUT o WRA & Qe &
JgEdE 200 b I Uacd ARl BT YANT HRd 8Y [ZATael U9l fqem |91 (Wail & W 3R
152—XTSTU= / 2025—15—10—2025 (6575)




6576 RToT93, fEATIe USel, 15 JaER, 2025 /23 3MfRaH, 1947

Yore) A AR, 2025 (2025 &1 fRIS HwATE 9) B STAIed ) feam & T orfwe| 348
% @ue (3) B NI, fagd & 3FSH Ue B Iou=, RAEe Uy # HHEid &A@ forw
WAGd wR e 81 31 SWiad faed & 9¥ 2025 & oW Wwgies 38 @& ®T H Sfoh
I UTe afed Iorud (§—Tore) s uer § yHiiia far Sar 2

3SR §INT,
FETIETRT / —

(Sfo fags <aif),
Hgaa fafdr g=redt |

2025 T AT G&TH 38.

Romae vew a9 (Wl & 9 &R UYH) \§emE orfefeaH, 2025

SRTSN BT HY

fere A |

€RT 3 BT AN |
&RT 4 BT T |
ORI 4—F BT HicRATIA |
gRT 5 BT FaRATIA |
¢§RT 5— T Y |
&RT 6 BT TN |
&RT 6—F BT T |
9. URT 6—F BT FII |
10. €RT 6—7T T BT @Y |

© N oA WDN =

2025 T JAEAIT G 38.

fRArae v fau | (WSl & Wy 3R UeF) e SrfiifeaH, 2025

(A TSI HEIed §RT JATTAIG)

e U fou |9 (\ew & Wi 3iR UeE) tfafe, 1971 (1971 &1 SRIfEH
TAEH 8) Bl SR FIAMEM B & fory rfdfH |

YR TORY & OgaRd a¥ § fRamd w9 o awr gr1 f=falRad wg & I8
rferfrafad gr—

1. <R TM——sa rfaf e @1 i W fRaree ucer faue w9 (Wil & 9 8k
Uee) ened R, 2025 B |



RIST94, fEATae USel, 15 JMaER, 2025 /23 3MfRad, 1947 6577
2. ORI 3 & GURFA——2Arde Ue faum 991 (@l @ W iR Uem) ifdfram, 1971
(1 o8 g9a Twarq e SIRIfTH” FHET AT §) & ORI 3 H,

(@) BRW & N¥d # “Jav AR UfTHcHid T’ &l & WH R 9™ & dad”
Ieg \_rITQ.ﬁ,-

(@) Su—orT (1) H—

(i) “UgUq BOIR” ¥l & WIE WR TR BRI W SIMG; 3R

(i) 3R UM BOIR BUY B X A URTHRIHS I Aeal BT Ald fhar ST,
(1) SU—RT (1—%) & g falRad @r S, srerid—

“(2) WS BT dad SMISR IAMAFTIH, 1961 (1961 HI 43) B ORI 48 &
LR & Gug (V) & 3T IR AN IR GADhIdH @ AR
TR YA 3, 2030 W URW §U IS UM I & YA IR S | |

3. ORI 4 & WOEA—d ARH & gRT 4 3 SWRT (1) & @ (i) 4 "T$ TR
3MS Wl ¥El & WM W "] YR Ui Al s [/ SIG |

4, HURT 4—Q BT YRR~ ARRE B gRT 4—9 & WIF R FfeiRad @
ST, STQﬁF[:—

"4—g. fafee &3 IR IR Twl—(1) TS TN D Th o 9 EOR B9Y
B &R 9 FarE eF w1 9@ dad fBar S|

2) TP AW Bl T TR TUY  UFHN B SR W HRTAd Wl dad b
ST | |

5. ORI 5 H URRMUA—H ARRH &I grRT 5 & WIE R =foRad @r S,
rerfa—

“5. @ AU~ 9T & 458 & WM R NIl &= R W Fard @ &1
BHAR BN Gl RT 7 & e e gy fafed e smg - |

6. ©RT 5—F BT A——H IMAIH P &RT 5—F BT AT AT ST |
7. ORI 6 B HARH—H AT B aRT 6 H—

(@) STIRT (1) §—

() "R oG JBUY" YRl B WME R "B G BUY & W S |
(i) e wge & I W AEfoRad @ S, sferfa—

"IRg Sl gRT I BT I AR AR R BT foeg ufd fetiiex
TR Uedid ¥UY 3 A6 I B8 oRg BUU dI Jfhdd A & HidR
gﬁ—‘ﬂiu;(iﬁ?

(@) SU-gRT (2) ¥ "U¥d A’ B U CAMEBIRG IR b IR IR
TG fhU ST QIR U= 8ol oG] & ¥H W U BoR’ Ieq

Y SIC |




6578

oY, BT ST, 15 STaRER, 2025 /23 IMMRAH, 1947

8. ©RT 6% BT AL AATIH BT gRT 6— H—

(@) "< g BUY @I D WM W W g S Ieq [ ST |
(@) YoM e & I W Fr=feiRad @ Sme, Jeria—

“IRg <ol R ITHT &I I aIRAId MR W BrT feg ufd frariier uvR
TN ®UT 3 IFSE AT ORI BI¢ Bl AfhaH AT d HIdR 8
3R

(M fedfa wRge 9 "I dRg JUY” &l b WE WA AR JUY Il
SITGT |

9. R 6~ BT FINUA.——d AAFTTH I aRT 6-7 H—

1

THE

(@) SUIRT (1) § "B 89R TUT Ieq] & WM W TN EolR $IY” @ /G
ST |
(@) STERT (1) & ggarq efaRad iaxenfia faar Sirg, sreifq—

“(1—P) W B IqT A-RR AT, 1961 (1961 BT 43) DI ORI 48 D

TR & WUS (V) & I IUSRIT AN JERDIT adid & AR TR
TR 3, 2030 ¥ UR™ BU YD UIF qul & YA 9T ST |” |

0. ©RT 6—T I BT A9—RT 6—7 T BT T fHIT FTUIT |

AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT

Act No. 38 of 2025.

HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (ALLOWANCES AND
PENSION OF MEMBERS) AMENDMENT ACT, 2025

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS

Sections:

1

2

3

4

5.

6. Omission of section 5-A.
7

8

9

1

Short title.

Amendment of section 3.
Amendment of section 4.
Substitution of section 4-B.
Substitution of section 5.

Amendment of section 6.

Amendment of section 6-A.
. Amendment of section 6-B.
0. Omission of section 6-CC.



oY=, AT USTT, 15 STaER, 2025 /23 IMRAH, 1947 6579
Act No. 38 of 2025.

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY (ALLOWANCES AND
PENSION OF MEMBERS) AMENDMENT ACT, 2025

(AS ASSSENDED TO BY THE GOVERNOR)
AN
ACT

further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of
Members) Act, 1971 (Act No. 8 of 1971).

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-sixth Year
of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short title.—This Act may be called The Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly
(Allowances and Pension of Members) Amendment Act, 2025.

2. Amendment of section 3.—In section 3 of the Himachal Pradesh Legislative
Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members) Act, 1971 (hereinafter referred to as the
“principal Act”),—

(a) 1in marginal heading for the words "Salary and compensatory allowance", the
words "Salary to a Member" shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (1),—
(i) for the words “fifty five thousand”, the words “eighty five thousand”
shall be substituted; and

(i1) the words "and compensatory allowance at the rate of five thousand rupees"
shall be omitted;

(c) after sub-section (1-A), the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“(2) The salary of a member shall be increased after every five years commencing
from 1 April, 2030 on the basis of Cost Inflation Index provided under clause (v)
of Explanation to section 48 of the Income Tax Act, 1961(43 of 1961).”.

3. Amendment of section 4.—In section 4 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), in
clause (ii), for the words “one thousand eight hundred”, the words “two thousand five hundred”
shall be substituted.

4. Substitution of section 4-B.—For section 4-B of the principal Act, the following shall
be substituted, namely:—

“4-B. Constituency and Office Allowance.—(1) There shall be paid to each member
a constituency allowance at the rate of one lakh twenty thousand rupees per mensem.

(2) There shall be paid to each member an office allowance at the rate of ninety
thousand rupees per mensem. .



6580

oY, BT ST, 15 STaRER, 2025 /23 IMMRAH, 1947

5.

Substitution of section 5.—For section 5 of the principal Act, the following shall be

substituted, namely:-

10.

"5. Amenities.—A member shall be entitled to such residential accommodation on
concessional rates at the place of sitting of the Assembly as may be prescribed by rules
under section 7. ".

Omission of section 5-A.—Section 5-A of the principal Act shall be omitted.

Amendment of section 6.—In section 6 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1),—
(i) for the words “four lac rupees”, the words “six lakh rupees” shall be
substituted;

(i1) for the second proviso, the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“Provided that the expenses of journey by taxi shall be on actual basis but
per kilometer charges shall not exceed twenty five rupees and shall be within
the maximum limit of six lakh rupees:”; and

(b) in sub-section (2), after the words “Each member”, the words “during official
tour” shall be inserted and for the words “twenty five thousand”, the words
“fifty thousand” shall be substituted.

Amendment of section 6-A.—In section 6-A of the principal Act,—

(a) for the words “two lac rupees”, the words “three lakh rupees” shall be
substituted;

(b) for the first proviso, the following shall be substituted, namely:

“Provided that the expenses of journey by taxi shall be on actual basis but per
kilometer charges shall not exceed twenty five rupees and shall be within the
maximum limit of three lakh rupees:”; and

(c) in the second proviso, for the words “two lac rupees,” the words “three lakh
rupees” shall be substituted.
Amendment of section 6-B.—In section 6-B of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words and figures “Rs. 36,0007, the words “fifty
thousand rupees” shall be substituted; and

(b) after sub-section (1), the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“(1-A) The pension of a member for the first term shall be increased after every
five years commencing from 1st April, 2030 on the basis of Cost Inflation Index
provided under clause (v) of Explanation to section 48 of the Income Tax Act,
1961(43 of 1961).”.

Omission of section 6-CC.—Section 6-CC shall be omitted.



oY=, AT USTT, 15 STaER, 2025 /23 IMRAH, 1947 6581
fafer famm

RMeT—2, 14 JdER, 2025

W TA.UARMR—31.(6)—5 / 2025—aoT.—2Adel TS @& Iogulel o 9Rd & el
% IAITIE 200 B ST Ud TRl PN TIRT A g A Uer e 91 aremel @i
SUTEe I (HeNed) fderres, 2025 (2025 T fdeies W&ATd 10) DI IAFANSd B AT § T2T
IS 348 T WUS (3) B M, [IEIDd & IUSH UG Bl oMU, BAMES TR H YR B
@ forg wftrpd &x fear 2| or: SWiad fadgd &1 af 2025 @ Sifom dw@aid 40 @& w9 #
ST U TS Afed Ioyd (§—Toie) fRArae Uaer H Ui fhar S = |

SICN N
FAEIRT / —

(Sfo fags <aif),
Hgad fafdr g=medt |

2025 T JAAFIH G&=idh 40.

feATae UQw faure 4T oreger 3R Surge I+ (SRTE) i, 2025

RIS ® HH

e A |

gRT 3 BT I |
gRT 4 BT TN |
gRT 8 BT AT |

&RT 10— BT I |

a o bd =

2025 T JATEAFIT G 40.

fevTae uewr faur T areuer iR SuTHel Ja- (Weier) SrfdrfeE, 2025

(AT ISYUT H8Ied gIRT JAT3TAIGd)

e ow foue 9WT eegel iR SuTde dad SffdfeEH, 1971 (1971 &1 SifSfEw
TAE® 4) BT R AR B o forg i |

YR TRNY & Oeard a¥ d fRamd uew {um o grr fA=feRed w9 4 g
srferferafag gn—



6582 RToT93, fEATIe USel, 15 JaER, 2025 /23 3MfRaH, 1947

1. & AH——s IS IH &1 Afera A fRHTe g<er faum | ereveT SfiR SuTeded
I (Femer) arfdferE, 2025 R |

2. YRT 3 BT GUYT— A= U9 Ao quT 3fegel 3R Sutegel Jd- 3ifSfd, 1971
(1 39 g9 gvanq “Ho STfaH” &'l AT §) & 9T 3 H—

(@) SU-URT (1) H, "3 BOIR” VG] & WM W UG BOR eq W SIG |
(@) SU—GRT (1—31) B oI UR FEfIRad </ SIRAT, sfeifdq——

"(1—31) 3NeET BT I, JATTBX IMATIH, 1961 (1961 BT 43) B RT 48 B TICIHIU]
T U (5) B ST IYGET AN EDIA adbih & ARR IR YAH 37U, 2030
A UR™ BId 8U YD UTd auf & UTE qrdl ST |”; iR

() SU—YRT (1—3M) H “gad TR’ TRl & WM R "Th oG T g9’ @ /g

ST |
3. YR 4 HT GARH— IATH &7 gRT 4 H—

(@) SU-URT (1) H——"Ug8cR 89R’ ¥&I & RF W “qHd IR’ eq I SI9 |

(@) ST-oRT (1-31) B ¥ W FrfRad @ s, serfq—

"(1—37) SUTTET BT dad, MG IMfATTIH, 1961(1961 BT 43) Bl GRT 48 B FACIHIT
T QU (5) B ST IYGET AN EDIA adbih & ARR IR YAH 37U, 2030
A UR™ BId 8U YD UTd aul & UTE gerdl ST |”; 3iR

(1) SU-GRT (1-_T) #, “JaMd R’ ¥Rl & WM R “TH g TN g9R’ @ G

ST |
4. URT 8 BT AU—— IMATH B &RT 8 H A9 fHar FTG |
5. ®RT 10—% & QARM.——Td ARIH B arRT 10-F H——

(@) ST—eRT (1) H—

() "R TRg U’ TG © WM R “BE ARG TR Ieq ]I SIG |

ON ON

(i) SU-GRT (1) & Yo RSP & LA W {frRad a1 S, fefia—

"R Al GRT DI TS AT BT Y IS MR W Fad 8T fheg
gl fheAier JR U=eiid $9d 9§ 3Fd T B g v Bl Afhad
™ & AR BT |; BIR

(i) f&d WP H IR A 39" Y&l & @[ R B8 AG IR AR G
ST |

(@) SU—URT (2) § "0 89X ¥ea] & M WR UGN BRI I SIG |



RIST94, fEATae USel, 15 JMaER, 2025 /23 3MfRad, 1947 6583
AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT

Act No. 40 of 2025.

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY SPEAKER’S AND DEPUTY
SPEAKER’S SALARIES (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2025

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS

Sections:
1. Short title.
2.  Amendment of section 3.
3.  Amendment of section 4.
4. Omission of section 8.
5. Amendment of section 10-A.

Act No. 40 of 2025.

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY SPEAKER’S AND DEPUTY
SPEAKER’S SALARIES (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2025

(AS ASSENTED TO BY THE GOVERNOR)
AN
ACT

further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly Speaker’s and Deputy
Speaker’s Salaries Act, 1971 (Act No. 4 of 1971).

BEit enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-sixth Year of
the Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short title.—This Act may be called the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly
Speaker’s and Deputy Speaker’s Salaries (Amendment) Act, 2025.

2.  Amendment of section 3.—In Section 3 of the Himachal Pradesh Legislative
Assembly Speaker’s and Deputy Speaker’s Salaries Act, 1971 (hereinafter referred to as the
“principal Act”),—

(a) 1in sub-section (1), for the words “eighty thousand”, the words “ninety five thousand”
shall be substituted;

(b) for sub-section (1-A), the following shall be substituted, namely:—
"(1-A) The salary of the Speaker shall be increased after every five years commencing

from 1st April, 2030 on the basis of Cost Inflation Index provided under clause (v) of
Explanation to section 48 of the Income Tax Act, 1961 (43 of 1961)."; and



6584

oY, BT ST, 15 STaRER, 2025 /23 IMMRAH, 1947

(c)

(a)

(b)

(c)

4.

5.

in sub-section (1-B), for the words “ninety five thousand”, the words “one lakh
fifty thousand” shall be substituted.

Amendment of section 4.—In section 4 of the principal Act,—

in sub-section (1), for the words, “seventy five thousand”, the words “ninety
two thousand” shall be substituted;

for sub-section (1-A), the following shall be substituted, namely:—
"(1-A) The salary of the Deputy Speaker shall be increased after every five years
commencing from Ist April, 2030 on the basis of cost inflation index provided under

clause (v) of Explanation to section 48 of the Income Tax Act, 1961(43 of 1961)."; and

in sub-section (1-B), for the words “ninety five thousand”, the words “one lakh
fifty thousand” shall be substituted.

Omission of section 8.—Section 8 of the principal Act shall be omitted.

Amendment of section 10-A.—In section 10-A of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1),—

(1) for the words “four lac rupees”, the words “six lakh rupees” shall be
substituted;

(i) for the first proviso, the following shall be substituted, namely:—
“Provided that the expenses of journey by taxi shall be on actual basis but per
kilometer charges shall not exceed twenty five rupees and shall be within the

maximum limit of six lakh rupees:”; and

(i11) in the second proviso, for the words “four lac rupees” the words “six lakh
rupees” shall be substituted; and

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “twenty five thousand”, the words “fifty thousand”

shall be substituted.

fafer v

ReFe—2, 14 37aRfER, 2025

T Tel.Uel.3R.—SV.(6)—4 / 2025—ol.——fRATEd TS & oAU 9 9Rd & Afqed &
T 200 @ I Usd WAMKAT BT TN HRd gU AR & da9 IR 91 (fBHr=re us)



oY=, AT USTT, 15 STaER, 2025 /23 IMRAH, 1947 6585

M fadras, 2025 (2025 dT RIS Awdis 8) & SiHlfed &R AT 8 TT T 348 &
Gus (3) B M, fIed & S U8 &I IS, ZAred Uael § YHIRd - & oy urerpd
IR AT 2| 3 SR fAEdd BT 9y 2025 & AAFIH FATH 39 & wU H S WIHT U6
Afed o1 (3—Toie) faarad ucer § gaifera fdar Sirar 2|

SICN N
FAEIRT / —

(Sto fagem fa),
Hgad fafdr g=medt |

2025 T JAAIH A=TH 39.
A3 & 99 iR 9 (Rrae wew) |eiee rfdf=aH, 2025

RIS B hH

fereg A |

gRT 3 BT T |

&RT 4 BT GiaRATI |

§RT 7 BT TN |

¢RT 10 BT AT |

gRT 14—F 3R 14— BT AT |

2

2025 T 3T T=idh 39.

AR B 994 iR W (Rerae uwn) HeveE 1S e, 2025

(A TSI HEled §RT JAT3TAIGa)

A3 & 994 IR W (Rvrae u<wn) ifarfa, 2000 (2000 &1 Mffaw Hw=did 11) @
3R e v & forg srfdrfes |

TRT TR & ogaRd 9¥ ¥ Ramd g faum o gnr f=falRad wa § g
srfafrafad gr—

1. 98 aM—sa Mm@ dfera M ARl @ 999 8k v (BEmaa uew)
Temer arfarferaH, 2025 2|

2. YRT 3 PT AAE—HABR & da49 IR w1 (Raraer wewn) «ifafram, 2000 (1 g9
D LA el ARTIH BB AT 8) B GRT 3 H—

(@) SU-aRT (1) & wIF W) HAfaRad @r Sgm, ierid—



6586 RToT93, fEATIe USel, 15 JaER, 2025 /23 3MfRaH, 1947
“(1) vA® A= frEfaRed <R oR 9a9 o1 BT §HeR BN, fAfq—
(@) = 91 U o™ Ugs BOIR BUY HlHNT;
(@) Dfdde A= T=Md g9k Uy gioHm;
M g A= RMT g9R B9 TfaAr; iR
(&) S F= IR BOIR BUT HfeA |7 3R
(@) SU—GRT (2) & M W FEfaRad x@r Se, serfd—
“(2) w3 BT 9a9 ISR ATIH, 1961 B &RT 48 & WL & TUS (V)
@ SN USRI AN HRRWIT JADID & MR UR UH AU, 2030 H IR
gY YD UiE qul & U derdT ST | |
. ORI 4 BT JRRIOE.—Ad ARFRE & aRT 4 & RIF W FHEfoRad @r S,
SDIGES

"4, IhR Adl—UAPd A Uh oI T 8ol BUT UfART P o) W IehR Tl
YTl YT BT B8haR BT |

ORI 7 & GO~ JRATH & aRT 7 H—

(@) STIRT (1) H—

() "R 9 BUY VR B WM W BT ARG DUV R G SN |

(i) Yo WP d WM W FAFIRad tRegd @1 ST, 3id—

"R AT GRT B T[S AT BT Y IRKIAd MR W G 8T g
gfc fheier g9R U=y ¥U¢ I IS T B8 ARG BUY Bl S
A4 & AR BT I SR

(iii) fgdg W # IR I TIY” W&l & WU W BT A YU AR
ST 3R

(@) SUIRT (2) § U= ORI & WIF TR “Ua §9R 98 - ST |

gRT 10 T AY.—He T @1 aRT 10 H7 A9 far A |

HRT 14—F AR 14—F BT FTRIUT.—RT 14 & Tarq AfeRad sid-wenfua faar
ST, JTTq—

“14—F. I4 &I A P IEE—Yd =& A <RU-VI I IqH FW D YT B
3ITaTH BT EHER BT |




oY=, AT USTT, 15 STaER, 2025 /23 IMRAH, 1947 6587

14—, a1 Yfduer 1 da SR 9xl—-ar ufue], S &% W 9d9, A AR ygfaemd
UT<T R+ BT haR BN Sl 39 AR & ¥ TRBR & Bfddc A1 DI M=
=

WREPRU—T IRT b YAIoT & forg =1 ufauer” |, faegm 997 & 9 Sl dod93
IRBR & Ufgel § Adifed GRS Y& diel fduell g1 &1 a1 8 SR 59 fum=ayr sreyer
ERT UG =T & ®©T & qr=gdl e &I T3 2, IfIud 2 |

2) v JfRfd & JAfF dfee d=0 o fARredn Sudfa @ R, [ar ufauer
fedTere yeer @1 fur |91 & Hew & WU A ddd, W SR ggfaumell & wu H R Rr @

UTd HR DT 8haR Aal g | |

AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT

Act No. 39 of 2025.

THE SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES OF MINISTERS (HIMACHAL PRADESH)
AMENDMENT ACT, 2025

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS

Sections:
1.  Short title.
2.  Amendment of section 3.
3. Substitution of section 4.
4. Amendment of section 7.
5.  Omission of section 10.
6. Insertion of sections 14-A and 14-B.

Act No. 39 of 2025.

THE SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES OF MINISTERS (HIMACHAL PRADESH)
AMENDMENT ACT, 2025

(AS ASSENTED TO BY THE GOVERNOR)
AN
ACT

further to amend the Salaries and Allowances of Ministers (Himachal Pradesh) Act, 2000
(Act No. 11 of 2000).

BEit enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-sixth Year of
the Republic of India as follows:—



6588

oY, BT ST, 15 STaRER, 2025 /23 IMMRAH, 1947

1.

Short titlee—This Act may be called the Salaries and Allowances of Ministers

(Himachal Pradesh) Amendment Act, 2025.

2.

Amendment of section 3.—In section 3 of the Salaries and Allowances of Ministers

(Himachal Pradesh) Act, 2000 (hereinafter referred to as the “principal Act”), —

(a)

for sub-section (1), the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1) Each Minister shall be entitled to receive a salary at the following rates,
namely:—

(a) Chief Minister One lakh fifteen thousand rupees per mensem;
(b) Cabinet Minister Ninety five thousand rupees per mensem;
(c) Minister of State  Ninety three thousand rupees per mensem; and

(d) Deputy Minister  Eighty thousand rupees per mensem.”; and

(b) for sub-section (2), the following shall be substituted, namely:—

3.

"(2) The salary of a Minister shall be increased after every five years commencing
from 1st April, 2030 on the basis of Cost Inflation Index provided under clause (v) of
Explanation to section 48 of the Income Tax Act, 1961.".

Substitution of section 4.—For section 4 of the principal Act, the following shall be

substituted, namely:—

4.

(a)

“4, Sumptuary Allowance.—Each Ministers shall be entitled to receive sumptuary

allowance at the rate of rupees one lakh fifty thousand per mensem.”.

Amendment of section 7.—In section 7 of the principal Act,—

in sub-section (1),—

(1) for the words “four lac rupees”, the words “six lakh rupees” shall be substituted;

(i1) for the first proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely:—
“Provided that the expenses of journey by taxi shall be on actual basis but per
kilometer charges shall not exceed twenty five rupees and shall be within the

maximum limit of six lakh rupees:”; and

(ii1) in the second proviso, for the words “four lac rupees”, the words “six lakh
rupees” shall be substituted; and

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “twenty five thousand”, the words “fifty thousand”

5.

shall be substituted.

Omission of section 10.—Section 10 of the principal Act shall be omitted.



oY=, AT USTT, 15 STaER, 2025 /23 IMRAH, 1947 6589

6. Insertion of sections 14-A and 14-B.—After section 14 of the principal Act, the
following shall be inserted, namely:—

"14-A. Residence to Ex-Chief Minister.—The Ex-Chief Minister shall be entitled
for an accommodation of Type-VI category or above.

14-B. Salary and allowances to Leader of Opposition.—(1) The Leader of
Opposition shall be entitled to receive salary, allowances and benefits as admissible to
a Cabinet Minister of the Government under this Act.

Explanation.—For the purpose of this section, "Leader of Opposition" means a
Member of the Legislative Assembly, who is, for the time being, the Leader of the
party in opposition to the Government having the greatest numerical strength and
recognised as such by the Speaker of the Legislative Assembly.

(2) The Leader of Opposition shall not be entitled to receive any sum by way of
salary, allowances and benefits, as a Member of the Legislative Assembly of
Himachal Pradesh except what is specifically provided to a Cabinet Minister
under this Act.".



6590 RToT93, fEATIe USel, 15 JaER, 2025 /23 3MfRaH, 1947

==, J2uT doT ofE A, fEHrae Uy, RHe—5 gRT gfad i Ui
golagidh BXIRIRT oIS, J€IST hitp:/rajpatrahimachal nic.in TR SUl ¥ Ya¥H 3ffHlTs Afia fhar S Haar 2 |



		2025-10-15T19:46:48+0530
	DAYA NAND SHARMA




