fearae uwr Ry 9w gfRkEc™

ST

i, 2 fowwR, 2025

=T faoHo—faura—faeae / 1—135 /2025 —RHmarel yewr faum= @ &1 ufhar ud
BT Farer e, 1973 & fW—140 & ad feArad wew RuTferdT (fgeia deneH)
fada®, 2025 (2025 @1 fAead Aw@Td 23) S oMW faid 2 fagwR, 2025 &1 fRae uew
e 91 3§ QR 81 gl ©, HIAHRY Bl arel eud H gfad w1 gg uiNd fear
ST B |

FIRT / —
(TreraTe),

gfera,

20 "o faems |

2025 &7 faee G=id 23
fewmere uewr TRutforeT (fgeha deem) fada®, 2025
HUSl BT HH

Hfereg = |

&RT 2 BT FINA |

&RT 14 BT FINE |
§TRT 24 DT FIME |
¢TRT 66 DT FINE |
¢TRT 82 T WML |
¢RT 83 BT HINEH |
&RT 111 BT FMEH |
§TRT 113 BT G |
¢RT 114 BT GAEH |
¢RT 115 BT G |
&RT 124 BT FMEH |
&RT 125 BT FMEH |

© NN~

—_— ) A
w N =~ o o0



14.
15.
16.
17.
18.
19.
20.
21.
22.
23.
24.
25.
26.
27.
28.
20.
30.
31.
32.
33.
34.
35.
36.
37.
38.
39.
40.
41.
42.
43.
44.
45.
46.
47.
48.
49.
50.
51.
52.
53.
54.
55.
56.
57.

&RT 126 BT FMEH |
&RT 127 BT FIMEH |
¢TRT 128 BT GEH |
¢TRT 129 BT e |
¢RT 133 BT FIMEH |
&RT 134 BT FIMEH |
&RT 135 BT FMEH |
¢TRT 140 BT AL |
§TRT 141 BT GAEH |
¢TRT 143 BT GAEH |
¢TRT 148 BT FMEH |
&TRT 149 BT FIMEH |
¢TRT 150 T e |
¢RT 150—a DT FINE |
¢RT 152 BT GEH |
&RT 159 BT FIMEH |
&RT 162 BT FMEH |
¢TRT 166 BT ML |
§TRT 172 BT GEH |
¢RT 173 BT GAEH |
&RT 175 BT FMEH |
¢TRT 180 T FIMEH |
¢TRT 183 BT FIMEH |
¢TRT 184 BT ML |
¢TRT 191 BT G |
&RT 192 BT FIMEH |
¢RT 193 BT FIMEH |
¢TRT 196 BT FIMEH |
¢TRT 197 BT G |
¢TRT 198 BT ML |
¢TRT 199 BT FIMEH |
¢RT 200 BT FIMEH |
&TRT 207 BT FMEH |
&RT 211 BT G |
¢TRT 216 BT G |
§TRT 221 BT G |
¢RT 227 BT FIMEH |
¢RT 240 BT FIMEH |
¢TRT 255 BT G |
§TRT 271 BT G |
¢RT 304— DT FINEH |
gRT 304—% BT FAE |
&RT 304—T BT HIME |
&RT 304—6 BT HAINE |



58 gRT 304—S BT FINA |
59.  SIRT 304—d T G |
60.  ©RT 304—F BT AL |
61.  ©RT 304—S1 BT G |
62.  ©IRT 304—3T BT FINEH |
63.  YRT 304—<T BT TN |
64.  YRT 304—3 BT FINIA |
65.  ©RT 304—S BT G |
66.  URT 304—3 T TN |
67.  ©RT 304—0T BT JIMA |
68.  €IRT 304—21 BT AT |
69.  YRT 304—T T TN |
70.  RT 304—%T T FIMEH |

2025 T fads H=I® 23
fewmera uewr TRuforeT (fgdha eneF) fad®, 2025
(e =1 % qRevenfia w9 H)

feATee Uew TRUTfedT A, 1994 (1994 HT JAfATH F=TH 13) BT AR HARA
& @ o g |

IR RIS & fogaRd a¥ § fReme uewr faumaar grr f=faRad w7 & I8
sfafafag 8 —

1. e IM——s9 sfaf s @1 e am Rerae uew aRuiferat (g denes)
arfarfm, 2025 2|

2. ORI 2 & HMe—RAM Uew TRuferer e, 1994 (R 99 g9iab
T ol AT P T 7) DGR 2 B G (2) ¥ gd FrHfoRad @S sidenfud fear
ST, Jferfd—

(1) "ET R MBI W, T AETOATHR IATaNIeT, @Al ueer 1fud T,
e qaiidl Areed IR Tder & I e, fFardae uqer g ol
TR T §RT TRUIIBRI & @Al & o el 9Riel Farferd & o, o
TRUTABISAT & @Il B ST W&l FAIld B D oIy TRUTASRIT B FEITd
ARl R rfferal d& ugd ura gRfl |

3. ORI 14 & HAEA—Fd JIMRAFTH & gRT 14 B SU-URT (3) & YA
frrforRad SuU—uRT sfa=enfid @1 S, Jreiq—



“(4) S I TRUTferdT URYE @ &5 BT P AN, SHAD! USMEAS & SR, TR
e orfSfd, 1994 @ ORT 3 @1 SU—URT (2) (1994 HT 12) B AT TR
a9Ifa far Sar g, @ O =won, Su-awr (1) | fiffde wRuferer aRvg o
BIATGS B FAIT T 30 AT BT gRT 271 B IJdid ITb fdged do,
TRUTfIHT URYE & AR &I YKmEie HI YATId a1 BT | |

4. ORT 24 FT HARE—TA AT & gRT 24 B [U-GRT () B ULAN
frefeiRad aRege Siaenfud fohar STQ, sferd—

IR, JATRMY, 3eder AT IUTEHET AT SURGTH, ANTIH UK by S &l aRRg
q UgE fadl & Aiar, afe S arfoy =€l foram T &1, AU BT WIdR BT |

NS BT WIhid & < I SUGth Sth Ridd @1 o Faeid der aRaR
BT T BT |

5. ©RT 66 & FIF.—Tc ARAfFm o aR1 66 # 1" g @& WM W ) fos
T SITQT 3R doeanq ffeRad Sid-wenfud fhar g, srerfa—

“IRY] Ife Yaqdl 99 & SRM IUART YARI DI agell el DI T8 8
YRl B, S W T dlel A Afed, HuRT #R & GHRIT b W
ST [ |

. dl 9
H Slrer

6. SRT 82 P HIMM.— ITTH & gRT 82 @1 IJU—¢RT (2) # “dfg A $IY
AR 31 W 3Mfdh ST BOIR YT’ Il & ¥ W Tl OIR vV 3R e I 3ifde dfw
B9IR ™IV Ieq Y S0 |

7. ORI 83 BT HIEH— AfRTTH & aRT 83 DI SUURT (5) #, Ui Al TUY 3R
P A 3feh & IR HIY BT, R IR 9T &I <907 H, VA AfdRad A A qusyg
BRM, S UM &9 & vearq ge W @A & oy, 9 SRM 9T 9N I8l &, 9amd $ay
BT el SR el @ WM R I R Y iR 31fdd ¥ ifd& dia g9R $UY 81T, 3R
JFART W BT T H, U IffaRad A ¥ IV 8RN, Sl Yo fid & vedrq udd U
e & forg, i SR W7 SIRY I84T &, Uid |1 $9¢ B8R 96 3R forg 9 <Ier | |

8. GRT 111 BT HUH——Ta JRTIH B aRT 111 B Iu—oRT (4) #, “uig A $IY
goIT 37fes W 3Mfdd T BN YT’ Sl & WM W "I BoIR BIU 3R 7 A 31fdd did
gOTR YT "' 9eq XX SITG |

9. ORI 113 BT HARH—d ARTH & a=T 113 & @Wos (@) # “uig A FIY
T A A 3Mfdh ST BOIR BUT’ TG B WMH W Sl IR BT 3R e I 1fdd g
g9TR BUT e N IO |

10. RT 114 & H@ORM——d ARFTH 3 arT 114 H <7 A ¥& & WH W
T BOIR” TR WY S |




1. €RT 115 & WA~ JfRAFT9 o g7 115 # Q7 A I&k & W@ W
TP TOR' ] WY A |

12. ORT 124 T HIEE.—T AT B GRT 124 B SU—RT ()ﬁ “gig |t By
3R 31ff® ¥ 21fdd T B9R ¥UY 8RN &R U VA fad & forg, e SR omRme gram
YEaT B, HfaRad SAM & gus i 89T, S gt B¢ gNT wreal 3R el @ e RSl
BUIR YT AR e I A Ui 89R B¢ BT AR GAH ﬁ?iﬁmﬁm’cﬁ?ﬁ'\fﬁ
SURTET BIT REAT B, SMIRE A A SUSHI BN, Sl Ul |l 3YY BN ¥R AR forg 9
ST |

13. ORI 125 P FURM—A AR B gRT 125 B SU-GRT (4) H, "Th TR
JYU IR 3Afd T 3Mfdd IR IR BYU N1 3R IAd U fod & forg, o9 SR oRTe
=T BT 7, T |l ¥U¢ " ¥El IR sl & WM W 3T R I AR 1f¥d I 1w di=
g9R BUU BN 3R Udd v fod & for, e R Ry SIRY R8dT ©, uig | %9y
ITeg 3R fovs < SITe |

14, 9RT 126 BT FINE.—H AT B gRT 126 B IWIRT (3) H, "< BN
@rwsﬁ?sﬁ’cﬁ@rsﬁﬁ’cﬁwww Y BN 3R Al W7 SR IEdT Fl*fl;l?éﬁ?ﬁ@
Eﬁﬁvrq UH W & U¥EN] fOrd GRM W ORI REdT ©, & 9l 39U & SffARaEd JHH A
qUST BT wreat @R RrE @ R TR QT B9 BUY SR e @ ofdie dfd BuR o9Y
BT, 3R AT 47 SR &l & O U VA faq & forg, wem 9 & qeanq s SR AT
SR YEAT 2, Ui Al $UY & JffaRed JAM | IuSA BRI ¥ 3R e @ S |

15. €RT 127 &1 HIM.— JIRATH @ gRT 127 @1 IU—RT (2) H “gi= A TIY
3R 3Mfrp I e T EOIR BYU BN IR IfS MR SIRY <8dT ® o ifaRaa wnRa, <
Tddh W T & forv e SRM IR SN R8dT 8, U |l B9V &I Adhdl 8 el 3R
el @ YIM W "3l BN BT 3R 3Mfde I 1fde Uia s9R U BRI 3R Ife ToRTeT SNy
IBdl & dr SrfaRad wlRa, O u¥e W o & forv s SR 3iuRer SINY YgaT €, U
BV B Fhdl 8 I IR s g e |

16. ORT 128 HT FAURM—AA AT @7 gRT 128 B SUT-GRT (2) H, "Th TR
TUT 3R S1f¥d W 31 Ufg BOIR $UY BT 3R Udd U fod & forg, e SR omRmw
SR IEAT ®, a6 49l $9U & AfaRed JAM | qvedr BN el iR RSl @ W\ W el
JTORTET ST Y&l €, Ui <Y $9¢ & SifaRad S A Sueig 8N’ 9eg 3R forg 3@ S |

17. ORT 129 HT I~ IATH & aRT 120 & SU—GIRT (3) #, “°ig A HIY
AR AJfTP I 3AfF 3T BOIR BUY, IR ISP W e & forg, oasd SRM IR IR &
g, TA BYY & AR JAM ¥ el 3R el & WM W ‘Sl BWR - ¥UY AR Afed |
IfAd Ui BOTR BV 3R P W faq & forg, Rrgd SRM IR SR X8 ®, Ui |l %9¢
@ faRad JAM ¥ weg iR forg @ S |

18. ©IRT 133 BT I —1 IATH &7 gRT 133 B IT—4RT (2) |, “uig A TIY
IR 31f® & e 31 BOIR BUY BRI 3R IfT Pig e 9INT fdhar Siram € @ 8<rY \mﬂEﬁ




fog o/ea sl & |AE & v, RTEe IRM AIRM SINT &1 8, IS o & forg
TR BIU & ARG A | U B ¥l iR el & W W]l gR B iR
s I AP U FWR BIU BN, IR I I Aifed IRY fHar Sar g a1 8ew 9H &
foU g ol & FHfd & v, e IRM IRY SR &1 &, e o & foy
giE Y B ARTRET JAM | TS BRI ek AR g G S |

19. ©RT 134 BT HAA.—A AT & aRT 134 # "3 IR i A T A B
Bl BT 3R T BOIR BUV ¥ 3N T8l BN ULl B WH W Tl FOIR BYU I HH T8l
BT 3R Uid 9IR BV W 3Afdh 8l 8N g R SIIGH |

20. GRT 135 &1 WARA.— AT & arT 135 H o=@ & 39U 3R fda &
JIfd | BOIR BYU TGl & WM W Sl FIR YU 3R 31 | &1fdd Uig g9k $9q”
ITeg YW SITG |

21. ©RT 140 BT WM AT &1 gRT 140 H IT—GRT (2) §, "ui=g A TIY
3R 31f® & 3AfdF &1 BOIR JYY” TGl & WIF W "Il §9R YU 3iR M I orfdd Ui
EOR BUY " IeE G ST |

22. YRT 141 BT FIRF.——T ARTH @7 gRT 141 @ Iv—aRT (2) H "< &R
¥UYY G Pl fbwg UrE Al YT | PHH T8 BN &l B WM W UE BAR BT T Bl
fh=g 3T BOIR YUY F HH Tl BRI Wea W ST |

23. RT 143 &7 A IRTTH & aRT 143 & @os (1) # “uiag A vy iR
J7fSrep I 31fdh QT BOIR BIU ' Fea] & WH W Tl 8oIR BT 3R 31 A s Ui goR
BUT" g N IO |

24, GRT 148 BT HINRF— IRATTH P aRT 148 & @os () # Ui A $UY iR
3fdrd I 31fdp T FOIR YU Il & W W 3T B9IR BT 3R 1fdd A e g g9R
BUT" g N IO |

25. SRT 149 BT FUNEE.—Tl IMAFTIH B aRT 149 H—

(@) SY-aRT (1) 4 """ |G FIU b AR IAS TEad] WY o oIt Udh EolR
TIY TG & WIF W "]l FOR ¥IY $ 3R UAd qAqad] WRE & oy i
gOTR YT " ¥req X SIGIT; 3R

(@) SU—9RT (3) H, S UH BOR BYY P BT B 61, &l & WF R, 3T B
JYU F HH T8l BN 3R Ui 89X BV 3 3ffd 8] s oeq G SITG |

26. ©RT 150 & HARM—T JIRAFTH & aRT 150 ¥, "UFh TR $IC " V&l &
RIE TR ST BOIR BYU” Ieg I SIG |




27. ORI 150—% BT QAR ARTIH BT aRT 150—F B IU-GRT (4) §, ""eH
IRy & oY e T B qAT I HURE B Y A Al BYq” eed] & WA W YH
IR & oIy T EOIR BUY TAT ILATAAd] MR & oIy Ui §9IR BUT 36 I SIG |

28. SRT 152 HT HIMM.—c IRATTH B GRT 152 @ IU—GRT (1) §, "SAMAT A, S
Ule BOIR YUY T BT B ADIT, SUSIY BRI Rl & WIF W AN ¥, Sl HH F A al
BOIR ¥V 3R Sl UM B9IR BUY A P 81 G, IUSHRI BN T I G |

29. ©RT 159 PT HURM.— AT & g1 150 H, “uig A $IU 3R s &
37 3T BOIR BUYU b BN Fal & WM TR "Il 9R BV AR 31 A 31fdd ua goR
BUT T BT B ABIT, TUSHIT BN g I SITUT |

30. GRT 162 BT WA~ JAAFTH @1 aRT 162 H, “Uig Al TUU IR If¥d |
J7fp 3T BOIR B TGl & H W "SI BN BT 3R 31fdd A 31fdd Uia g9k BIU" g
Y TG |

31. ©RT 166 BT HINEA.—A AAFTIH B GRT 166 BT SU—GRT (3) H, * g Al HIY
IR 3 I 3Afdd S BIR BYU ddb BRI ] & WH W ‘Tl 8ol BV AR 3 I
J7fh Iig BN BUT Tb BT B ADI, SUSHIT BN e X ST |

32. RT 172 $T FAORE—T JRFTTH B aRT 172 F IU—RT (4) §, "ufg | $IY
AR 3Mfrd W 3Mfdh ST IR BUT’ Il & I WX "3l BOIR BV 3R e I fde g
&9 BUY’ &g N ST |

33. ©RT 173 & FURM—A ARFTIH & gRT 173 T IT—GRT (4) ¥, “gi=g A BIY
IR 31 W 3Mfdh ST IR BUT’ Il & I W Tl BOR BV IR e I fde g
&R BUY &g N ST |

34. YR 175 BT WM~ ARFTIH & gRT 175 H IT—GRT (3) ¥, "Uig A TIY
IR Af¥d ¥ AP T IR TP BN AR Sd Iectad AT U ORI I8l & ol VA
JfaRad JaH A Sveg BE, Sl U UG fad & foy, {9 SRM goM Sootad AT
AU NI &l 8, U WUY BRI Weal & WIF WR "Gl §9R ¥UY 3R e A Afdaw
UTe §OIR YT T BN 3R 4 Secia AT FUTE SIRT I8dT & a U AR AN |
TUSHII BT, S U U Q7 & fofy, [/ SR YoM Seeiad AT FgUTe SIRT J&dT &,
uiE |l $UY BEI WeR W SN |

35. ORI 180 P WM.~ ARFTT H grT 180 ¥, “Td | TI¢ AR 1fda &
AP TR BOR BYY’ TGl & W TR ]l BoIR ©IT 3R (e ¥ o uig gk $uy”
Ir6q R IO |

36. ©RT 183 BT WM. AT &1 gRT 183 H IT—4RT (1) ¥, "uig A TIY
AR 31 W 3Mfdd ST IR BUT’ e & I W Tl BOR BV IR e I fde U=
&R BUY &g N ST |




37. RT 184 HT WA~ JRAFTIA P aRT 184 F IU—oRT (2) #, "ufg A $IY
AR 3Mfrd W 3Mfdh ST IR BUT’ Il & I W "3l BOIR BV 3R e I fde g
&R BUT’ e N ST |

38. ORI 191 BT WARA.— ARAFTH 3 grT 191 # “gg & 3UY 3R e &
IIfAF & IR BV IGl & AT TR ‘Tl BOIR YU 3R 31fdh I 1fSd Ui IR BUT” Ireg
Y ST |

39. ©RT 192 BT FIEM.——T JIMAFTH &7 aRT 192 & ITERT (1) H “"ig A v
AR 1 W 31fdd T 8ol BUY” I b WH R Tl BOIR BUT IR A A 3ifded i
&R BUY &g N ST |

40. ORT 193 HT FIMEF.——T ARAFTTH & gRT 193 B IWIRT (2) H, “°ig A HIY
AR 1 W 31fdd T 8ol B’ I & WH TR Tl 89X BUT IR e A 3ifde g
g9TR BUT e N IO |

41. GRT 196 BT HURHE——T JRFTIH & aRT 196 B IU—oRT (1) #, “uig A $IY
IR 1 W 31fdd T 8Ol BUY” IS & WE TR Tl 89X BUT IR e A 3ifded ui
g9R BUT e N ST |

42. HRT 197 BT HIMEH.—T AT BT gRT 197 B SU—oRT (1) IR (2) H, "=
AT BT 3R Hfdd I AP T BOIR BUY” I Og bl W 3N B b WIH W HHI: Tl
BUIR BUT IR 3 I IS Iid TR BIY” &g I ST |

43. 9RT 198 HT WARF——d AT & g1 198 H, “Uig A $IT & YA iR QT
EOR JUY” TE] & WIF W "Il TR UY ¥ YA 3R 3Af¥d I e Ui g9R JUY” R
Y SIE |

44. 9RT 199 BT WORH——I ARFTH & grT 199 #, “uim A T AR IF A
I 3T BOIR B TGl & H W Tl BN BT 3R 31fde A 31fdd Uig g9k BIU” g

G SO |

45. ©RRT 200 BT HOH——Ta AT @ arT 200 H, “uig A v AR gMRAF A
IS 3T BOIR B TGl & H W Sl BN BT 3R 31fdd A 1fdd Uia goIR BIT g
Y SITG |

46. ©RT 207 P HIE. Hﬁaﬁﬁwzﬁrwzo?ﬁ "“TH BOIR BUY AR 31fHd |
3P UiE BWR BUY BN, AR AR Q@aﬁv&r@%wa%@ﬁﬁww@uﬁmzﬁ
fore ITART R E, Fﬁ@ﬂ%ﬁ?iﬁ%& R SR SUART SR I8dT ©, Ui |l ¥
& faRad A &1 SR 8N Rl & WM WS BWR ¥UY AR s | 31fe Ui
g9R ¥UY BN, 3R afd Q?fl‘rﬁﬂrﬁ{f?g' eI 98 W i @1 O e @ fog ST
W%?ﬁ@u—eﬁ & fog, fSrae SRM SUANT SIRT RedT &, Ui |1 39U & iR
AN BT SR BT ¥R R SN |




47. ORI 211 BT GORHE——T JRFRH & aRT 211 F IU—oRT (5) #, Ui A $IY
dd BT B AHAT &, SR BN IR W@ SFgule™ OINI Y&l 7, a U4y fad & forg,
RTA® SR JAIUIST STRI &l 8, ARG SAM BT Sl Ui 89R ¥UY qP B B A,
SR BN el AR Rl @ WM WR ST BOIR ¥UY 9§ YA AR ST UiF 8Ok ¥UY dF 8l
HHT AR G T ORI I8l 7, d U4 U fod & forg, fda SRM emure™ okt
REdT &, AR S[AF &1 S U |l ¥UY b DI 8l G, qUsHId 8RN Tea 3R e 3@
ST |

48. YT 216 BT HIMF.—T AT B gRT 216 BT IWIRT (1) H, "Il TR HIY
BT 3R SId 9 <Te] 8 arell 8 d U JAfIRad JAT H U BN, S UM 9T &
g U o & forg, fga SR <1e] I8dT &, U |l ®UY” ¥l 3R sl & W\ R ar
BOIR YT ¥ YA AR Sl Uid §IR BYY qb 81 FbT AR G W <Te] X8+ arell &1 a VA
AR AN F TUSII B, ST Yo 9 & qwdrq U4 &9 & forg, foga SR =me] R
2, Ui Al ¥UY BRI W6k IR s 39 S |

49. HRT 221 &1 WUEH—T AT & arT 221 @ IU—gRT (3) & @ (i) #,
“Uid IR BIU ddb 81 IHIT <l & H R T B9IR BT F BT T8I 8N iR o 99
EOIR BUU TP Bl AHIT' g WG SIIG |

50. ©RT 227 BT WM.~ AAFTH @1 arT 227 H “uig Al TUU 3R If¥H |
Jfp T BOIR BYU” Gl & WH W Tl BN BIY 3R 31fdd I 1fdd Ui g9k BIT” I7eg
Y ST |

51. ©RT 240 BT WA~ JAAFTH @1 aRT 240 H, “uig Al TUU 3R If¥d |
J7fp 3T BOIR B TGl & WH W Tl BTN B¢ 3R 31fde A 31fdd Uig g9k BUT” g
Y ST |

52. ©IRT 255 BT HUNEH.—Hcl AT B aRT 255 H—

(@) SU—oRT (1) & %= R =faRaq  war sirge, srfq—

“(1) TRUfABRNT & @Al B JEUNe] BAad UQe & U A-TelaidhR
(eI TRlet) 3R T or@roRIetT famT & fAeerd g1 &1 oo, e ar
TRUTIRT B FEITD G AR AferRdl T uga s8Rl |

(@) ST—orT (1) & wxE FfRad sraenfya fsar wmem, srrfa—

"(1%) TRUMIHT & afd WId I okEl TRIeTT fIuRT @Al ueer & ol
RIeTdhl §RT JAING fhy STTUT:

IR TRUAMADBT & WA D @ GRIET Yo & G FASTeldIbR (@l WRIel) &
Y TH1Idh] ANTGEA IR TRIeTo] & el Farferd &I Sl |7; 3R

(1) SU-uRT (3) B A WR FETIRIT ¥ Se, seifd—



“(3) WM FETOETHRR (ofET UNien), fRHrae ucel @ aifyd dd-id Arefor
Rale & ATI—A1YT 5T oI@T 9T famT &) a1ffe Ruré &1 s Ruvsd
& AHeT }GT ST | |

53. GRT 271 &1 WIRM.—Ad JRAFH @1 o1 271 & IU-RT (65) & TLAN
frforRad SU—aRY @ SITefl, srerfa—

“(6) 39 AR ¥ B 919 & B U I, 99 39 PRV ¥ & TR uRvE & FRl
TR &7 B TR 79 & w9 # gifvg fear T @ a1 e R fm | enfae
foar T 8, a1 T AR IO (3—ToiC) H UG IMQY gRT MY H
fafafde aRg & TR uRyg &1 w7 B <M |

(7) SU-GRT (6) @ MM w7 & T TR URYS & A WHR & My # faffdse
ARG & 3197 U Rad &R < |

54. ORI 304—F BT HAE.—d MAFRH & IR 304—F o “HREN ¥, s
Jafe 9 ¥ T B B G, AT FAN H, AT A A7 AR & WIF R BREAN ¥, ]
Al b ¥ Tb Bl Bl AU, AT FA H, ST I SR YU qP B FHI, AT a1 A 7R
R SATE |

55. ORT 304—8 &1 GORHE—Id SIRfFd & o
BRI 9, Wmﬁra‘ra&waﬁﬁ@ﬁ G\mﬁﬁ,
"HRIEN ¥, @] 3@ U ay dd @l 8 Fadl, A1 A
FHI, AT T A AR R/ MG |

56. GRT 304—7 &1 GOM—T JRAFH & aRT 304—7T & SU—uRT (1) #,
“HRIEN ¥, @] 3@ B8 A dd b1 8 Fadl, AT A I, Sl &l IR B¢ db Bl
TSI, AT AT W TGl S8R gl @ W R HREN ¥, el 3@ teh 9y d@ @ 8@
ql, AT FA W, S 1 BAR BT T B FHIAT, T QAT W e AR AR I SN |

57. SRT 304—° @& HAMTH—Td IRTH & oaRT 304—9 @ SU—oRT (4) H,
BRI 1, mewwaﬁﬁﬂ‘cﬁﬁ qT AN ¥, ST &I R ¥Y¢ I @l
TSI, AT AT ¥ vEl S8R gl @ WM R HREN ¥, el 3@ teh 9y dd @ 8@
ql, AT FA W, S 41 BGAR BYY T B FHIAT, T QAT W e AR e I SN |

58. GRT 304—€ ®I WIM.—Td IMAFH & aRT 304—8 @ SU-eRT (2) #,
BRI 3, wm?ﬁ?ﬁmwiﬁﬁf@ﬁ m\—rﬁﬁ@ maﬁr@ NEARCINC R
® WM W HREANM ¥, NE®! 3@ vh ay b S 8l Adl, 1 AN WA, Sl 99 B9R
TYQ TIH B FHI, AT Al W' o] AR g WY MG |

59. ©RT 304—d & HAMTH—T JRTH @ aRT 304—a @ SU—oRT (3) H,
“HRIEN W, @] fafs & 7 B 81 G, I JAM A, A1 g A7 "Rl AR Rl B



WM W "HRE™E 4, NEd] 3@y U gy ddb &1 81 Fabdll, AT AN A, Sl 919 89IR BUY
qdH & FDHI, AT F W' ¥R AR g /I 9T |

60. ©RT 304—B & HARH—AA ARAFTTA B gRT 304-B @ IU-GRT (2) # "I
TS Wl $UT TH BT 8 THIT, VST BN &l & WM W ST & 89R BIU 3R TP
W e & forg, f59a SR R™ SR 8T 8, Uh 8ok 39U dd & AfIRad A+ 4
TUSHIT BT 96 XY SITGT |

61. SRT 304—S &1 WIRM—A ST @& aRT 304—1 & IU-oRT (2) #,
“HRIETE ¥, fFa] e 9 A1 B 81 G, AT JAM ¥4, AT IEN A7 Rl AR Bl B
WM W HRE™E 4, @] 3@y U gy ddb &1 81 Fabdll, AT AN A, S 919 89IR BIY
Tqb B GBI, AT QM F Wex AR 78 G ST |

62. ORI 304—31 PT WINF.—HA IMAFRH B g1 304—31 & SU-RT (3) H,
PRI ¥, TFa] e 9 A1 BT 81 Gl AT FAA 9, I aEN 97 TeEl AR el @
WM W "HRE™E 4, @] 3@y U a¥ ddb &1 81 Fabdll, AT AN A, Sl 919 89IR BUY
b B FDHIT, AT QT A e AR g W e |

63. GRT 304—T &1 HIRM.——d JRFRH @1 aRT 304—< H “HREE ¥4, )
Al A9 A BB AL, AT JAM W, Wl 3R Rl B WE R BRENM 4, Sl
Ay U ay Tob B B G, AT A A, S 49 BOIR BUY Tb B GBI, AT AAT A TR
3R g 9 S |

64. SIRT 304—3 BT WAEH.—T AMAFTTH B IR 304—3 & IU—RT (1) §, "SI G4
Al BUY qb BT B G, U BET &l & WF W S & TR ¥UY AR IS U
e & oy, R SRM URY SRI &A1 8, U BlR BUU P & ARG A A JUsY
BN 9eq N IO |

65. GRT 304—S T HIARM.—Td JRAFTH @7 a7 304—< # “HREE |, et
3@y A9 99 @1 B F, AT AN I, AT A W' T iR Rl & WH W HREE 9,
RTH®! /@fd g a9 T @1 B Faddl, AT JAM I, S 419 IR BT qPb & FDHIT, AT S
A" wes R e &I ST |

66. GRT 304—G &1 WURH——Ta AffrH a% gRT 304—¢ B SU—LRT (2) #,
“PHRIETT W, oS! 3@y a1 9y T B 81 Fabdll, AT JAM A, AT AT A el AR Rl B
WM R “BREM ¥, 9T F@® e ay T b1 81 Fadl, I A A, S I BIR BIY
Td B Wb, AT aFl ' AR 3R o8 - S |

67. ORT 304—71 P HUEM.—TA AMAFRH & gRT 304—77 & Iu-arT (1) #,
“HRIEN ¥, e o@d @ av a6 @ ‘aﬁ NERI| \gHM H, ST Ui Al BuY P Bl G,
qT AFI W W] SR Rl @ WM R SRE™ ¥, @) @y g av @ ol 8 dal,
T SAM W, ST 4 BGIR BUY P Bl G, AT Al AW IR T I S |

68. SIRT 304— HT HIRM.—T ARAFTH B IRT 304— P IU—oIRT (3) H " df7
I BUT dH BT B DT, @@‘vﬁag‘m G B I WS &9 B9R BUT 3R IS U



fem & forg, e SRM AURE SRY &A1 8, U BOIR BUU dP & AfIRE A A qusg
BN ¥es R AT |

69. RT 304—T BT WINEIT.— IMAFIH BT TRT 304—7 H—

(i) ¥mid (ured) e H, HaqM @ T Wl & UvEnrq iR ToEr feaw”
g JiT:Refud fhu Sie |

(i) SU—aRT (1) # “AIGH B ARG &l & GTEN IR TUET g W US

Jidenfud fdby STe |

(iii) SU-9RT (2) ¥, "“HREN ¥, @ JGT BT A B & G, AT JAA 9,
S &l B9R YU dd B FHAT, AT S A7 TRl iR Rl & wH W
PRI W, [SEa] @ T ay dd a1 81 AT, AT AN A, ST §19 8GR
TUY TP B BT, AT A1 A e 3R foreg /g TG |

70. SIRT 304—¢ BT HIEF.—A AT B ORT 304—8 & IU—RT (2) H—

(@) @vS (@) H “HREE W, NEd! @ g7 ¥ q& HI 81 A, AT JAA 4, AT
Tl ¥ weal IR el @ WM R EREN 9, et :[afd ue av ad ol
g W, AT A W, S §¥F TR BT dF B GBI, AT AT F7 TR 3R
e @ S |

(@) Evs (@) H “HREE F, NEa] @Y 88 a9 d& ®I 81 A, I A 4,

I7 T W Ul 3R Ol B WM R BRIAN ¥, el oafr e 9y
Tb DI B Fb, I A ¥, S 19 BOR BUY IP 8l FHIT, IT &A1 A
e MR forg T S0 |

Sl SR BRI BT HUA
fedrdel UQel TRUMTl SfAFTH, 1994 H RUMNTHI UM B Ggo &R, fa<i
SR 9 3R 39d U=l B ARG UG Ud AFNIh—MAS ATl
S IFIRY oM B oY GARIETT Bl JATeHAl & | TIRUNADT Wil & folg faemm oraradien
GO B W UG GHdE @ Eawdal &, sdfog e RReed uew & uue
HETGTHR  (RETIRIET) & Th=id] JAdem & IEH oIGiuNell & SUaH axal | I8

TRUIDT ORI yawe d 3R o1f¥ie URERIA, Tehwudr 3R fawad-ar gHead a3 gg
SINIDEES

I8 RS 39 TRUIfeRT & 9wl & drRide & f W< axal © e &85 918
# TR o # owfae & o € R fAeme sruead R 81 Wi €| ag RRpal @
Wl R e RUfET & folw v A9gag Uihar Y% aRd Fawl & gwib Bl Uiha




B A IR FRAT © | TRUIIDBT IO BT Aolgd R @ folg, [N H I8 UG Arn
ST & & 3T ISUATHRT Yo Pl FURT B & JHIAT & B9 H AT ST |

9 ARfFRE & | @ FuH iR IS o Wy ¥ uRafiad @ € ok °@ uwMrl
faR® & wT 4 B T8 B © | I8 IS 59 TSl BN THAT AR WA PRd I
JATAATGT SR YA §1dT B, 79 9o+, eadl, o9 gRE, ST iR gAra Hae
3MeRYT A Hefd RS BT & e § GUR BN | 39 FREl &7 AiiRed St
e &1 SmygfaTeRor, faTi TR &1 dgrar <A1 iR I # wE) W M @

G2 Ao DI Jg& a ¢ |

7% feRe SWRp See B Ol @ forg 2|

(e f7E)
JHRT H3 |

fewmere uewr TFRuforeT (fFha eeF) faeri®, 2025
(Femr &1 o qRvenfud w9 )

fRHTae Uae TWRUTferdT AT, 1994 (1994 &1 AfAFRH i 13) &7 3R AW
& @ o g |

(e f7E)
JHRT H3 |



AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT

Bill No. 23 of 2025.

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH MUNICIPAL (2nd AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025

Clauses:

©COoNOA~WNE

ARRANGMENT OF CLAUSES

Short title.

Amendment of section 2.
Amendment of section 14.
Amendment of section 24.
Amendment of section 66.
Amendment of section 82.
Amendment of section 83.

Amendment of section 111.
Amendment of section 113.
Amendment of section 114.
. Amendment of section 115.
. Amendment of section 124.
. Amendment of section 125.
Amendment of section 126.
. Amendment of section 127.
. Amendment of section 128.
. Amendment of section 129.
. Amendment of section 133.
. Amendment of section 134.

Amendment of section 135

. Amendment of section 140.
. Amendment of section 141.
. Amendment of section 143.
. Amendment of section 148.
. Amendment of section 149.
Amendment of section 150.



217.
28.
29.
30.
31.
32.
33.
34.
35.
36.
37.
38.
39.
40.
41.
42.
43.
44,
45.
46.
47.
48.
49.
50.
51.
52.
53.
54,
55.
56.
57.
58.
59.
60.
61.
62.
63.
64.
65.
66.
67.
68.
69.
70.

Amendment of section 150-A.
Amendment of section 152.
Amendment of section 159.
Amendment of section 162.
Amendment of section 166.
Amendment of section 172.
Amendment of section 173.
Amendment of section 175.
Amendment of section 180.
Amendment of section 183.
Amendment of section 184.
Amendment of section 191.
Amendment of section 192.
Amendment of section 193.
Amendment of section 196.
Amendment of section 197.
Amendment of section 198.
Amendment of section 199.
Amendment of section 200.
Amendment of section 207.
Amendment of section 211.
Amendment of section 216.
Amendment of section 221.
Amendment of section 227.
Amendment of section 240.
Amendment of section 255.
Amendment of section 271.
Amendment of section 304-A.
Amendment of section 304-B.
Amendment of section 304-C.
Amendment of section 304-D.
Amendment of section 304-E.
Amendment of section 304-F.
Amendment of section 304-G.
Amendment of section 304-H.
Amendment of section 304-I.
Amendment of section 304-K.
Amendment of section 304-L.
Amendment of section 304-M.
Amendment of section 304-N.
Amendment of section 304-0.
Amendment of section 304-Q.
Amendment of section 304-R.
Amendment of section 304-S.




Bill No. 23 of 2025.

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH MUNICIPAL
(2nd AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025

(AS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY)
A
BILL
further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Municipal Act, 1994 (Act No.13 of 1994).

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in Seventy-sixth Year of
the Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short title.—This Act may be called the Himachal Pradesh Municipal
(2nd Amendment) Act, 2025.

2. Amendment of section 2.—In section 2 of Himachal Pradesh Municipal Act, 1994
(hereinafter referred to as the “principal Act’’), before clause 2, the following clause shall be
inserted, namely:—

“(1) “Audit Agency” means Principal Accountant General Audit, Himachal
Pradesh, under whose technical guidance and supervision the audit of the
accounts of Municipalities shall be conducted, by Director, the Himachal
Pradesh State Audit Department who shall have the access to relevant
information and record of municipalities for conducting audit of accounts of
Municipalities;”.

3. Amendment of section 14.—In section 14 of the principal Act, after sub-section (3),
following shall be inserted, namely:-

“(4) When a part of the area of any Municipal Council, during its term, is declared to
be a Municipal Corporation under sub-section (2) of section 3 of the Himachal
Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1994 (12 of 1994), the said declaration shall not
affect the term of the members of Municipal Council, till the expiration of the
duration of the Municipal Council(s) specified in sub-section (1) or its dissolution
under section 271 of this Act.”.

4.  Amendment of section 24.—In section 24 of the principal Act, after sub-section (3),
following shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that the President or Vice-President or the Deputy Commissioner, as the
case may be, shall accept the resignation within 15 days from the date of tendering



the resignation, unless withdrawn. Immediately after acceptance of resignation, the
Deputy Commissioner shall cause to intimate the vacancy to the Director and to the
Government.”.

5 Amendment of section 66.—In section 66 of the principal Act, for the sign “.”, the
shall be substituted and thereafter the following shall be inserted, namely:—

sign

“Provided that if the user charges during the previous year is not realised, the same
alongwith fine thereof shall be added as arrear of Property Tax.”.

6. Amendment of section 82.—In section 82 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words, “two
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

7.  Amendment of section 83.—In section 83 of the principal Act, in sub-section (5),
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees and in the case of a
continuing breach with a further fine of fifty rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and more
than five thousand rupees and in the case of a continuing breach with a further fine of five
hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

8.  Amendment of section 111.—In section 111 of the principal Act, in sub-section (4),
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words, “two
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

9. Amendment of section 113.—In section 113 of the principal Act, after clause (b),
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

10. Amendment of section 114.—In section 114 of the principal Act, for the words
“two hundred”, the words “one thousand” shall be substituted.

11. Amendment of section 115.—In section 115 of the principal Act, for the words
“two hundred”, the words “one thousand” shall be substituted.

12. Amendment of section 124.—In section 124 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees and with a further fine of
fifty rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees and with a
further fine of five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

13. Amendment of section 125.—In section 125 of the principal Act, in sub-section (4),
for the words “one thousand rupees and more than four thousand rupees and with a further fine
of rupees one hundred”, the words “ two thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees
and with a further fine of five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

14. Amendment of section 126.—In section 126 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),
for the words “two thousand five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees and when



the breach is a continuing one, with a further fine of two hundred rupees,” the words “two
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees and when the breach is a continuing one,
with a further fine of five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

15. Amendment of section 127.—In section 127 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees and in case of a
continuing offence to a further penalty of one hundred rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees
and more than five thousand rupees and in case of continuing offence to a further penalty of five
hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

16. Amendment of section 128.—In section 128 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),
for the words “one thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees and with a further fine of
two hundred rupees”, the words *“two thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees and
with a further fine of five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

17. Amendment of section 129.—In section 129 of the principal Act, in sub-section
(3), for the words and sign “ five hundred rupees, and more than two thousand rupees and with a
further fine of fifty rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees
and with a further fine of five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

18. Amendment of section 133.—In section 133 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),
for the words and signs “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees and, when a
notice has been issued, with a further fine of fifty rupees”, the words and signs “two thousand
rupees and more than five thousand rupees and when a notice has been issued, with a further fine
of five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

19. Amendment of section 134.—In section 134 of the principal Act, for the words
“two thousand five hundred rupees and not more than ten thousand rupees”, the words “two
thousand rupees and not more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

20. Amendment of section 135.—In section 135 of the principal Act, for the words
“ five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

21. Amendment of section 140.—In section 140 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

22. Amendment of section 141.—In section 141 of the principal Act, in sub-section
(2), for the words “two thousand rupees but shall not be less than five hundred rupees”, the
words “five thousand rupees but shall not be less than two thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

23. Amendment of section 143.—In section 143 of the principal Act, in clause (c), for
the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand
rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.



24. Amendment of section 148.—In section 148 of the principal Act, in clause (c), for
the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand
rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

25. Amendment of section 149.—In section 149 of the principal act,—

(@) insub-section (1), for the words “five hundred and of one thousand rupees”, the
words “two thousand rupees and of five thousand rupees” shall be substituted;
and

(b) in sub-section (3), for the words “may extend to one thousand rupees”, the
words “shall not be less than two thousand rupees and more than five thousand
rupees” shall be substituted.

26. Amendment of section 150.—In section 150 of the principal Act, for the words
“one thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

27. Amendment of section 150-A.—In section 150-A of the principal Act, in sub-
section (4), for the words “five hundred rupees for the first offence and seven hundred rupees”,
the words “two thousand rupees for the first offence and five thousand rupees” shall be
substituted.

28. Amendment of section 152.—In section 152 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),
for the words “fine which may extend to five thousand rupees”, the words “fine not less than two
thousand rupees which may extend to five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

29. Amendment of section 159.—In section 159 of the principal Act, for the words
“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

30. Amendment of section 162.—In section 162 of the principal Act, for the words
“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

31. Amendment of section 166.—In section 166 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),
for the words *“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

32. Amendment of section 172.—In section 172 of the principal Act, in sub-section (4),
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

33. Amendment of section 173.—In section 173 of the principal Act, in sub-section (4),
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words two thousand
rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.



34. Amendment of section 175.—In section 175 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),
for the words and sign “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees and when the
contravention of non-compliance is a continuing one, with a further fine of fifty rupees”, the
words and sign “two thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees and when the
contravention of non-compliance is a continuing one, with a further fine of five hundred rupees”
shall be substituted.

35. Amendment of section 180.—In section 180 of the principal Act, for the words
“one hundred rupees and more than four thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

36. Amendment of section 183.—In section 183 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

37. Amendment of section 184.—In section 184 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

38. Amendment of section 191.—In section 191 of the principal Act, for the words
“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

39. Amendment of section 192.—In section 192 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

40. Amendment of section 193.—In section 193 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

41. Amendment of section 196.—In section 196 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

42. Amendment of section 197.—In section 197 of the principal Act, for the words
“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, wherever occurs, the words “two
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted respectively.

43. Amendment of section 198.—In section 198 of the principal Act, for the words
“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

44. Amendment of section 199.—In section 199 of the principal Act, for the words
“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.



45. Amendment of section 200.—In section 200 of the principal Act, for the words
“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

46. Amendment of section 207.—In section 207 of the principal Act, for the words and
sign “one thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees and if after such conviction, he
continues to use such building for such purpose shall be liable to a further fine of five hundred
rupees”, the words and sign “two thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees and if
after such conviction, he continues to use such building for such purpose shall be liable to a
further fine of five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

47. Amendment of section 211.—In section 211 of the principal Act, in sub-section (5),
for the words and signs “may extend to five thousand rupees and when the non-compliance is a
continuing one, with a further fine, which may extend to five hundred rupees” , the words and
signs “shall not be less than two thousand rupees which may extend to five thousand and when
the non-compliance is a continuing one, with a further fine, which may extend to five hundred
rupees” shall be substituted.

48. Amendment of section 216.—In section 216 of the principal Act, for the words and
sign “shall extend to five thousand rupees and when the breach is a continuing breach, with a
further fine of one hundred rupees”, the words and sign “shall not be less than two thousand
rupees which may extend to five thousand rupees and when the breach is a continuing breach,
with a further fine of five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

49. Amendment of section 221.—In section 221 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),
in clause (i), for the words “may extend to five thousand rupees”, the words “shall not be less
than ten thousand rupees and which may extend to twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

50. Amendment of section 227.—In section 227 of the principal Act, for the words
“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

51. Amendment of section 240.—In section 240 of the principal Act, for the words
“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
52. Amendment of section 255.—In section 255 of the principal Act,-
(@) for sub-section (1), the following shall be substituted, namely:—
“(1) The accounts of municipality shall be audited by the Principal
Accountant General (Audit), Himachal Pradesh and the Director of
State Audit Department who shall have access to relevant information
and records of the municipality.”;

(b) after sub-section (1) the following shall be inserted, namely:—



“(1A) The annual account of municipality will be certified by the auditors of
the State Audit Department, Himachal Pradesh:

Provided that the audit of the accounts of municipality shall be
conducted under the overall technical guidance and supervision of the
Principal Accountant General (Audit), Himachal Pradesh.”; and

(c) for sub-section (3), the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“(3)The annual technical inspection report of the Principal Accountant General
(Audit), Himachal Pradesh as well as the annual report of the State Audit
Department shall be placed before the State Legislature.”.

53. Amendment of section 271.—In section 271 of the principal Act, after sub-section
(5), the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“(6) Notwithstanding anything contained in this section, when on account of the
reason that the whole of the municipal area of the Municipal Council is
declared as a Municipal Corporation or its inclusion in the existing Municipal
Corporation, the State Government shall, by an order published in the Rajpatra
(e-Gazette), dissolve the Municipal Council from a date specified in the order.

(7) The Members of the Municipal Council(s) which has been dissolved under sub-
section (6) shall vacate their offices from the date specified in the order of the
Government.”.

54. Amendment of section 304-A.—In section 304-A of the principal Act, for the
words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to three years, or with fine, or with
both”, the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or with fine
upto twenty thousand rupees, or with both” shall be substituted.

55. Amendment of section 304-B.—In section 304-B of the principal Act, in sub-
section (2), for the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to two years, or
with fine, or with both”, the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to
one year, or with fine upto twenty thousand rupees, or with both” shall be substituted.

56. Amendment of section 304-C.—In section 304-C of the principal Act, in sub-
section (1), for the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to six months,
or with fine which may extend to two thousand rupees, or with both”, the words and signs
“imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or with fine upto twenty thousand
rupees, or with both” shall be substituted.

57. Amendment of section 304-D.—In section 304-D of the principal Act, in sub-
section (4), for the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to six months,
or with fine which may extend to two thousand rupees, or with both”, the words and sign



“imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or with fine upto twenty thousand
rupees or with both” shall be substituted.

58. Amendment of section 304-E.—In section 304-E of the principal Act, in sub-
section (2), for the words and sign “imprisonment for a term which may extend to three months,
or with fine or with both”, the words and sign “imprisonment for a term which may extend to
one year, or with fine upto twenty thousand rupees or with both” shall be substituted.

59. Amendment of section 304-F.—In section 304-F of the principal Act, in sub-
section (3), for the words and signs “imprisonment which may extend to six months, or with fine,
or with both”, the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or
with fine upto twenty thousand rupees, or with both” shall be substituted.

60. Amendment of section 304-G.—In section 304-G of the principal Act, in sub-
section (2), for the words “two hundred and fifty rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees and
with further fine which may extend to one thousand rupees for every day during which the
offence continues” shall be substituted.

61. Amendment of section 304-H.—In section 304-H of the principal Act, in sub-
section (2), for the words and signs “imprisonment which may extend to three months, or with
fine, or with both” the words and sign “imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year,
or with fine upto twenty thousand rupees or with both” shall be substituted.

62. Amendment of section 304-1.—In section 304-1 of the principal Act, in sub-section
(3), for the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to three months, or with
fine, or with both”, the words and sign “imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year,
or with fine upto twenty thousand rupees or with both” shall be substituted.

63. Amendment of section 304-K.—In section 304-K of the principal Act, for the
words and sign “imprisonment which may extend to three months, or with fine”, the words and
sign “imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or with fine upto twenty thousand
rupees or with both” shall be substituted.

64. Amendment of section 304-L.—In section 304-L of the principal Act, in sub-
section (1), for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees with further
fine which may extend to one thousand rupees for every day during which the offence continues”
shall be substituted.

65. Amendment of section 304-M.—In section 304-M of the principal Act, for the
words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to three months, or with fine, or
with both”, the words and sign “imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or with
fine upto twenty thousand rupees or with both” shall be substituted.

66. Amendment of section 304-N.—In section 304-N of the principal Act, in sub-
section (2), for the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to two years, or



with fine, or with both”, the words and sign “imprisonment for a term which may extend to one
year, or with fine upto twenty thousand rupees or with both” shall be substituted.

67. Amendment of section 304-O.—In section 304-O of the principal Act, in sub-
section (1), for the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or
with fine which may extend to five hundred rupees, or with both”, the words and sign
“imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or with fine upto twenty thousand
rupees or with both” shall be substituted.

68. Amendment of section 304-Q.—In section 304-Q of the principal Act, in sub-
section (3), for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees fine with
further fine which may extend to one thousand rupees for every day during which the offence
continues” shall be substituted.

69. Amendment of section 304-R.—In section 304-R of the principal Act, -

(i) in the marginal heading, after the words “on Polling day”, the words “and
counting day” shall be inserted;

(if) in sub-section (1), after the words “conclusion of the poll”, the words “and on
the day of counting” shall be inserted,;

(iii) in sub-section (2), for the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may
extend to six months, or with fine which may extend to two thousand rupees, or
with both”, the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to
one year, or with fine upto twenty thousand rupees, or with both” shall be
substituted.

70. Amendment of section 304-S.—In section 304-S of the principal Act, in sub-
section (2),—

(@ in clause (a), for the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may
extend to two years, or with fine, or with both” the words and signs
“imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or with fine upto
twenty thousand rupees, or with both”, shall be substituted.

(b) in clause (b), for the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may
extend to six months, or with fine, or with both”, the words and signs
“imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or with fine upto
twenty thousand rupees, or with both” shall be substituted.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS



The Himachal Pradesh Municipal Act, 1994 requires revision to strengthen municipal
governance, enhance financial accountability, and align its provisions with contemporary
administrative and socio-economic needs. The existing audit structure for municipal accounts
needs clearer statutory backing, therefore, the Bill provides for audit under the technical
supervision of the Principal Accountant General (Audit), Himachal Pradesh. This is intended to
ensure greater transparency, uniformity, and credibility in municipal financial management.

The Bill also clarifies the tenure of members of a municipality whose areas are
subsequently included within a Municipal Corporation, thereby removing existing ambiguities. It
also streamlines the process of resignation of members by introducing a time-bound procedure
for acceptance and mandatory reporting of vacancies. To strengthen municipal revenues, the
amendment provides that unpaid user charges shall be treated as arrears of Property Tax.

A large number of fines and penalties under the Act have remained unchanged for a long
period and no longer function as an effective deterrent. The Bill rationalises and revises these
penalties to make them realistic and enforceable, thereby improving compliance with municipal
laws relating to buildings, sanitation, public safety, licensing, and election-related conduct. These
amendments collectively aim to modernise the Act, promote fiscal discipline, and strengthen the
efficient functioning of Urban Local Bodies in the State.

This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid adjectives.

(VIKRAMADITYA SINGH)
Minister-in-charge.
DHARAMSHALA
THE..................2025

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

-Nil-

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

-Nil-

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH MUNICIPAL (2nd AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025

A



BILL

further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Municipal Act, 1994 (Act No. 13 of 1994).

(VIKRAMADITYA SINGH)
Minister-in-charge.

Secretary (Law).

DHARAMSHALA




