
fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk lfpoky; 
 

vf/klwpuk 
 

fnukad] 2 fnlEcj] 2025 
 

 la[;k fo0l0&fo/kk;u&fo/ks;d@1&135@2025-&&fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk dh izfØ;k ,oa 
dk;Z lapkyu fu;ekoyh] 1973 ds fu;e&140 ds vUrxZr fgekpy izns'k uxjikfydk ¼f}rh; la'kks/ku½ 
fo/ks;d] 2025 ¼2025 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 23½ tks vkt fnukad 2 fnlEcj] 2025 dks fgekpy izns'k 
fo/kku lHkk esa iqj%LFkkfir gks pqdk gS] loZlk/kkj.k dks lwpukFkZ jkti= esa eqfnzr djus gsrq izsf"kr fd;k 
tkrk gSA 
 

gLrk{kfjr@& 
¼;'kiky½] 

lfpo] 
fg0 iz0 fo/kku lHkkA 

 
&&&&&&&&&  

 

 
2025 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 23 

 
fgekpy izns'k uxjikfydk ¼f}rh; la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2025 

 
[k.Mksa dk Øe 

 
[k.M% 
 
 1- laf{kIr ukeA 
 2- /kkjk 2 dk la'kks/kuA 
 3- /kkjk 14 dk la'kks/kuA 
 4- /kkjk 24 dk la'kks/kuA 
 5- /kkjk 66 dk la'kks/kuA 
 6- /kkjk 82 dk la'kks/kuA 
 7- /kkjk 83 dk la'kks/kuA 
 8- /kkjk 111 dk la'kks/kuA 
 9- /kkjk 113 dk la'kks/kuA 
 10- /kkjk 114 dk la'kks/kuA 
 11- /kkjk 115 dk la'kks/kuA 
 12- /kkjk 124 dk la'kks/kuA 
 13- /kkjk 125 dk la'kks/kuA 



 14- /kkjk 126 dk la'kks/kuA 
 15- /kkjk 127 dk la'kks/kuA 
 16- /kkjk 128 dk la'kks/kuA 
 17- /kkjk 129 dk la'kks/kuA 
 18- /kkjk 133 dk la'kks/kuA 
 19- /kkjk 134 dk la'kks/kuA 
 20- /kkjk 135 dk la'kks/kuA 
 21- /kkjk 140 dk la'kks/kuA 
 22- /kkjk 141 dk la'kks/kuA 
 23- /kkjk 143 dk la'kks/kuA 
 24- /kkjk 148 dk la'kks/kuA 
 25- /kkjk 149 dk la'kks/kuA 
 26- /kkjk 150 dk la'kks/kuA 
 27- /kkjk 150&d dk la'kks/kuA 
 28- /kkjk 152 dk la'kks/kuA 
 29- /kkjk 159 dk la'kks/kuA 
 30- /kkjk 162 dk la'kks/kuA 
 31- /kkjk 166 dk la'kks/kuA 
 32- /kkjk 172 dk la'kks/kuA 
 33- /kkjk 173 dk la'kks/kuA 
 34- /kkjk 175 dk la'kks/kuA 
 35- /kkjk 180 dk la'kks/kuA 
 36- /kkjk 183 dk la'kks/kuA 
 37- /kkjk 184 dk la'kks/kuA 
 38- /kkjk 191 dk la'kks/kuA 
 39- /kkjk 192 dk la'kks/kuA 
 40- /kkjk 193 dk la'kks/kuA 
 41- /kkjk 196 dk la'kks/kuA 
 42- /kkjk 197 dk la'kks/kuA 
 43- /kkjk 198 dk la'kks/kuA 
 44- /kkjk 199 dk la'kks/kuA 
 45- /kkjk 200 dk la'kks/kuA 
 46- /kkjk 207 dk la'kks/kuA 
 47- /kkjk 211 dk la'kks/kuA 
 48- /kkjk 216 dk la'kks/kuA 
 49- /kkjk 221 dk la'kks/kuA 
 50- /kkjk 227 dk la'kks/kuA 
 51- /kkjk 240 dk la'kks/kuA 
 52- /kkjk 255 dk la'kks/kuA 
 53- /kkjk 271 dk la'kks/kuA 
 54- /kkjk 304&d dk la'kks/kuA 
 55- /kkjk 304&[k dk la'kks/kuA 
 56- /kkjk 304&x dk la'kks/kuA 
 57- /kkjk 304&?k dk la'kks/kuA 



 58 /kkjk 304&³ dk la'kks/kuA 
 59- /kkjk 304&p dk la'kks/kuA 
 60- /kkjk 304&N dk la'kks/kuA 
 61- /kkjk 304&t dk la'kks/kuA 
 62- /kkjk 304&> dk la'kks/kuA 
 63- /kkjk 304&V dk la'kks/kuA 
 64- /kkjk 304&B dk la'kks/kuA 
 65- /kkjk 304&M dk la'kks/kuA 
 66- /kkjk 304&< dk la'kks/kuA 
 67- /kkjk 304&.k dk la'kks/kuA 
 68- /kkjk 304&Fk dk la'kks/kuA 
 69- /kkjk 304&n dk la'kks/kuA 
 70- /kkjk 304&/k dk la'kks/kuA 
 
 

&&&&&&&&&&& 
 

2025 dk fo/ks;d la[;kad 23 
 

fgekpy izns'k uxjikfydk ¼f}rh; la'kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2025 
 

¼fo/kku lHkk esa iqj%LFkkfir :Ik esa½ 

 fgekpy izns'k uxjikfydk vf/kfu;e] 1994 ¼1994 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 13½ dk vkSj la'kks/ku 
djus ds fy, fo/ks;dA 

 Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds fNgRrjosa o’kZ esa fgekpy izns'k fo/kkulHkk }kjk fuEufyf[kr :Ik esa ;g 
vf/kfu;fer gks %& 
 
 1- laf{kIr uke-&&bl vf/kfu;e dk laf{kIr uke fgekpy izns'k uxjikfydk ¼f}rh; la'kks/ku½ 
vf/kfu;e] 2025 gSA 
 
 2- /kkjk 2 dk la'kks/ku-&&fgekpy izns'k uxjikfydk vf/kfu;e] 1994 ¼ftls blesa blds 
Ik'pkr~ ^^ewy vf/kfu;e** dgk x;k gS½ dh /kkjk 2 ds [kaM ¼2½ ls iwoZ fuEufyf[kr [kaM var%LFkkfir fd;k 
tk,xk] vFkkZr~%&   
 
  ^^¼1½ ^^ys[kk ijh{kk vfHkdj.k** ls] iz/kku egkys[kkdkj ys[kkijh{kk] fgekpy izns'k vfHkizsr gS] 

ftlds rduhdh ekxZn'kZu vkSj Ik;Zos{k.k ds vèkhu funs'kd] fgekpy izns'k jkT; ys[kk 
ijh{kk foHkkx }kjk uxjikfydkvksa ds [kkrksa dh ys[kk ijh{kk lapkfyr dh tk,xh] ftls 
uxjikfydkvksa ds [kkrksa dh ys[kk ijh{kk lapkfyr djus ds fy, uxjikfydkvksa dh lqlaxr 
lwpukvksa vkSj vfHkys[kksa rd igqap izkIRk gksxh(**A 

 
 3- /kkjk 14 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 14 dh mi&/kkjk ¼3½ ds Ik'pkr~ 
fuEufyf[kr mi&/kkjk var%LFkkfir dh tk,xh] vFkkZr~%& 
 



  ^^¼4½ tc fdlh uxjikfydk ifj’kn~ ds {ks= dk dksbZ Hkkx] mldh inkof/k ds nkSjku] uxj 
fuxe vf/kfu;e] 1994 dh /kkjk 3 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ ¼1994 dk 12½ ds v/khu uxj fuxe 
?kksf’kr fd;k tkrk gS] rks ,slh ?kks’k.kk] mi&/kkjk ¼1½ eas fofufnZ’V uxjikfydk ifj’kn~ dh 
dkykof/k dh lEkkfIr ;k bl vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 271 ds varxZr mlds fo?kVu rd] 
uxjikfydk ifj’kn~ ds lnL;ksa dh inkof/k dks izHkkfor ugha djsxhA**A 

 
  4- /kkjk 24 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 24 dh mi&/kkjk ¼3½ ds i'pkr~ 
fuEufyf[kr ijUrqd var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 
  ^^ijUrq] ;FkkfLFkfr] v/;{k ;k mik/;{k ;k mik;qä] R;kxi= izLrqr fd, tkus dh rkjh[k 

ls ianzg fnuksa ds Hkhrj] ;fn mls okfil ugha fy;k x;k gks] R;kxi= dks Lohdkj djsxkA 
R;kxi= dh Loh—fr ds rqjUr Ik'pkr~ mik;qä mä fjfDr dh lwpuk funs'kd rFkk ljdkj 
dks izsf’kr djsxkA^^A 

 
 5- /kkjk 66 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 66 esa ^^A** fpUg ds LFkku ij ^^(** fpUg 
j[kk tk,xk vkSj rRi'pkr~ fuEufyf[kr var%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZRk%& 
 
  ^^ijUrq ;fn iwoZorhZ o’kZ ds nkSjku mi;ksDrk izHkkjksa dh olwyh ugha dh xbZ gks] rks mä 

izHkkjksa dks] ml ij yxus okys tqekZUks lfgr] laifÙk dj ds cdk;k ds :Ik esa tksM+k 
tk,xkA**A 

 
 6- /kkjk 82 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 82 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ eas] ^^ik¡p lkS #Ik, 
vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ik¡p 
gtkj :Ik,** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 7- /kkjk 83 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 83 dh mi/kkjk ¼5½ esa] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, vkSj 
vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj :Ik, gksxk] vkSj vuojr Hkax dh n'kk esa] ,sls vfrfjDr tqekZus ls n.Muh; 
gksxk] tks izFke fnu ds Ik'pkr~ izR;sd ,sls fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku Hkax tkjh jgrk gS] ipkl #Ik, 
gksxk** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj  #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ik¡p gtkj #Ik, gksxk] vkSj 
vuojr Hkax dh n'kk esa] ,sls vfrfjDr tqekZus ls n.Muh; gksxk] tks izFke fnu ds Ik'pkr~ izR;sd ,sls 
fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku Hkax tkjh jgrk gS] ik¡p lkS #Ik, gksxk** “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA^^A 
 
  8- /kkjk 111 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 111 dh mi&/kkjk ¼4½ eas] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, 
rFkk vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ik¡p 
gtkj #Ik, ** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 9- /kkjk 113 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 113 ds [k.M ¼[k½ eas] ^^ikap lkS :Ik, 
rFkk vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vfèkd ls vf/kd ikap 
gtkj #Ik,** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 10- /kkjk 114 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 114 eas] ^^nks lkS** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij  
^^,d gtkj** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 



 11- /kkjk 115 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 115 eas] ^^nks lkS** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij  
^^,d gtkj** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 12- /kkjk 124 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 124 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, 
vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik, gksxk vkSj izR;sd ,sls fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku vijk/k gksrk 
jgrk gS] vfrfjDr tqekZus ls n.Muh; gksxk] tks ipkl #Ik, gksxk** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks 
gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vfèkd ik¡ap gtkj #Ik, gksxk vkSj izR;sd ,sls fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku 
vijk/k gksrk jgrk gS] vfrfjDr tqekZus ls n.Muh; gksxk] tks ik¡p lkS #Ik, gksxk** “kCn vkSj fPkUg j[ks 
tk,axsA 
 
 13- /kkjk 125 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 125 dh mi&/kkjk ¼4½ esa] ^^,d gtkj 
#Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd pkj gtkj #Ik, gksxk vkSj izR;sd ,sls fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku vijk/k 
pkyw jgrk gS] ,d lkS #Ik, ** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ik¡ap 
gtkj #Ik, gksxk vkSj izR;sd ,sls fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku vijk/k tkjh jgrk gS] ik¡p lkS #Ik, ** 
“kCn vkSj fPkUg j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 14- /kkjk 126 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 126 dh mi/kkjk ¼3½ esa] ^^nkS gtkj ikap 
lkS #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd nl gtkj #Ik, gksxk  vkSj ;fn Hkax tkjh jgrk gS] rks izR;sd ,sls fnu 
ds fy,] izFke Hkax ds Ik'pkr~ ftlds nkSjku Hkax tkjh jgrk gS] nks lkS #Ik, ds  vfrfjDr tqekZus ls 
n.Muh; gksxk** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ik¡p gtkj #Ik, 
gksxk] vkSj ;fn Hkax tkjh jgrk gS rks izR;sd ,sls fnu ds fy,] izFke Hkax ds Ik'pkr~ ftlds nkSjku Hkax 
tkjh jgrk gS] ikap lkS #Ik, ds vfrfjDr tqekZus ls n.Muh; gksxk** “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 
 

 15- /kkjk 127 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 127 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, 
vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik, gksxk vkSj ;fn vijk/k tkjh jgrk gS rks vfrfjDr 'kkfLr] tks 
izR;sd ,sls fnu ds fy, ftlds nkSjku vijk/k tkjh jgrk gS] ,d lkS #Ik, gks ldrh gS** “kCnksa vkSj 
fpUgksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ik¡p gtkj #Ik, gksxk vkSj ;fn vijk/k tkjh 
jgrk gS rks vfrfjDr 'kkfLr] tks izR;sd ,sls fnu ds fy, ftlds nkSjku vijk/k tkjh jgrk gS] ik¡p lkS 
#Ik, gks ldrh gS** “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 16- /kkjk 128 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 128 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] ^^,d gtkj 
#Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ikap gtkj #Ik, gksxk vkSj izR;sd ,sls fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku vijk/k 
tkjh jgrk gS] nkS lkS #Ik, ds vfrfjDr tqekZus ls n.Muh; gksxk** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks 
gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ikap gtkj #Ik, gksxk] vkSj izR;sd ,sls fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku 
vijk/k tkjh jgrk gS] ikap lkS #Ik, ds vfrfjDr tqekZus ls n.Muh; gksxk** “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 17- /kkjk 129 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 129 dh mi&/kkjk ¼3½ esa] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, 
vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,] vkSj  izR;sd ,sls fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku vijk/k tkjh jgrk 
gS] ipkl #Ik, ds vfrfjDr tqekZus ls** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj  #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls 
vf/kd ikap gtkj #Ik, vkSj izR;sd ,sls fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku vijk/k tkjh jgrk gS] ikap lkS #Ik, 
ds vfrfjDr tqekZus ls** “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 18- /kkjk 133 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 133 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] ^^ikap lkS  #Ik, 
vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik, gksxk vkSj ;fn dksbZ uksfVl tkjh fd;k tkrk gS rks gVk, tkus ds 



fy, vuqKkr vof/k dh lEkkfIr ds Ik'pkr~] ftlds nkSjku vijk/k tkjh jgrk gS] izR;sd fnu ds fy, 
ipkl #Ik, ds vfrfjDr tqekZus ls n.Muh; gksxk** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj 
vf/kd ls vf/kd ikap gtkj #Ik, gksxk] vkSj ;fn dksbZ uksfVl tkjh fd;k tkrk gS rks gVk, tkus ds 
fy, vuqKkr vof/k dh lEkkfIr ds Ik'pkr~] ftlds nkSjku vijk/k tkjh jgrk gS] izR;sd fnu ds fy, 
ikap lkS #Ik, ds vfrfjDr tqekZus ls n.Muh; gksxk** “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 19- /kkjk 134 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 134 eas] ^^nks gtkj ikap lkS #Ik, ls de 
ugha gksxk vkSj nl gtkj #Ik, ls vf/kd ugha gksxk** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, ls de ugh 
gksxk vkSj ikap gtkj #Ik, ls vf/kd ugha gksxk** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 20- /kkjk 135 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 135 eas] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls 
vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik, ** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vfèkd ikap gtkj #Ik,** 
“kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 21- /kkjk 140 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 140 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ eas] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, 
vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ikap 
gtkj #Ik, ** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 22- /kkjk 141 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 141 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½  eas] ^^nks gtkj 
#Ik, rd dk fdUrq ik¡p lkS #Ik, ls de ugha gksxk** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^ik¡p gtkj #Ik, rd dk 
fdUrq nks gtkj #Ik, ls de ugha gksxk** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 23- /kkjk 143 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 143 ds [k.M ¼x½ eas] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, vkSj 
vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik, ** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vfèkd ls vfèkd ikap gtkj 
#Ik,** “kCn j[ks tk,aaxsA 
 
 24- /kkjk 148 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 148 ds [k.M ¼x½ eas] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, vkSj 
vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vfèkd ls vfèkd ikap gtkj 
#Ik,** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 25- /kkjk 149 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 149 esa]& 
  
 ¼d½  mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa] **ikap lkS #Ik, ds vkSj izR;sd Ik'pkr~orhZ vijkèk ds fy, ,d gtkj  

#Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, ds vkSj izR;sd Ik'pkr~orhZ vijk/k ds fy, ikap 
gtkj #Ik, ** “kCn j[ks tk,axs( vkSj 

 
 ¼[k½  mi&/kkjk ¼3½ esa] ^^tks ,d gtkj #Ik, rd dk gks ldsxk]** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij] ^^nks gtkj 

#Ik, ls de ugha gksxk vkSj ikap gtkj #Ik, ls vf/kd ugha gksxk** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
   
 26- /kkjk 150 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 150 esa] ^^,d gtkj #Ik, ** “kCnksa ds 
LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 



 27- /kkjk 150&d dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 150&d dh mi&/kkjk ¼4½ esa] ^^izFke 
vijkèk ds fy, ikap lkS #Ik, rFkk Ik'pkr~orhZ vijk/k ds fy, lkr LkkS #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij **izFke 
vijk/k ds fy, nks gtkj #Ik, RkFkk Ik'pkr~orhZ vijkèk ds fy, ik¡p gtkj #Ik,** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 28- /kkjk 152 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 152 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa] ^^tqekZuk ls] tks 
ik¡p gtkj #Ik, rd dk gks ldsxk] n.Muh; gksxk** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij **tqekZuk ls] tks de ls de nks 
gtkj #Ik, vkSj tks ik¡p gtkj #Ik, rd dk gks ldsxk] n.Muh; gksxk** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 29- /kkjk 159 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 159 esa] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls 
vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik, rd gksxk** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij **nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vfèkd ls vf/kd ikap gtkj 
#Ik, rd dk gks ldsxk] n.Muh; gksxk** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 30- /kkjk 162 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 162 eas] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls 
vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vfèkd ikap gtkj #Ik,** “kCn 
j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 31- /kkjk 166 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 166 dh mi&/kkjk ¼3½ eas] ^^ ikap lkS #Ik, 
vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik, rd gksxk** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls 
vf/kd ikap gtkj #Ik, rd dk gks ldsxk] n.Muh; gksxk** “kCn j[ks tk,¡xsA 
 
 32- /kkjk 172 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 172 dh mi&/kkjk ¼4½ eas] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, 
vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ikap 
gtkj #Ik,** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 33- /kkjk 173 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 173 dh mi&/kkjk ¼4½ eas] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, 
vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ikap 
gtkj #Ik,** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 34- /kkjk 175 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 175 dh mi&/kkjk ¼3½ eas] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, 
vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj rd gksxk vkSj tc mYya?ku ;k vuuqikyu tkjh jgrk gS rks ,sls 
vfrfjDr tqekZus ls n.Muh; gksxk] tks ,sls izR;sd fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku izFke mYya?ku ;k 
vuuqikyu tkjh jgrk gS] ipkl :i, gksxk**  “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd 
ikap gtkj #Ik, rd gksxk vkSj tc mYya?ku ;k vuuqikyu tkjh jgrk gS rks ,sls vfrfjDr tqekZus ls 
n.Muh; gksxk] tks ,sls izR;sd fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku izFke mYya?ku ;k vuuqikyu tkjh jgrk gS] 
ikap lkS #Ik, gksxk** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
  35-  /kkjk 180 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 180 esa] ^^,d lkS #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls 
vf/kd pkj gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj :Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ikap gtkj #Ik,** 
“kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
  36- /kkjk 183 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 183 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, 
vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ikap 
gtkj #Ik,** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 



  37- /kkjk 184 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 184 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, 
vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ikap 
gtkj #Ik,** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
  38- /kkjk 191 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 191 esa] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls 
vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vfèkd ikap gtkj #Ik,** “kCn 
j[ks tk,axsA 
 
  39- /kkjk 192 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 192 dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, 
vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ikap 
gtkj #Ik,** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 40- /kkjk 193 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 193 dh mi/kkjk ¼2½ esa] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, 
vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ikap 
gtkj #Ik,** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
  41- /kkjk 196 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 196 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, 
vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ikap 
gtkj #Ik,** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
  42- /kkjk 197 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 197 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ vkSj ¼2½ esa] ^^ikap 
lkS #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,**  “kCn tgka dgha Hkh vkrs gSa( ds LFkku ij Øe'k% ^^nks 
gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ikap gtkj #Ik,** 'kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 43- /kkjk 198 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 198 esa] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, ls vU;wu vkSj nks 
gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, ls vU;wu vkSj vf/kd ls vfèkd ikap gtkj #Ik,** “kCn 
j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 44- /kkjk 199 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 199 esa] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls 
vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vfèkd ikap gtkj #Ik,** “kCn 
j[ks tk,axsA 
 
  45- /kkjk 200 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 200 esa] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls 
vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vfèkd ikap gtkj #Ik,** “kCn 
j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 46- /kkjk 207 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 207 esa] ^^,d gtkj #i, vkSj vf/kd ls 
vf/kd ikap gtkj #i, gksxk] vkSj ;fn ,slh nks’kflf) ds Ik'pkr~ og ,sls fuekZ.k dk ,sls iz;kstu ds 
fy, mi;ksx djrk gS] rks ,sls izR;sd fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku mi;ksx tkjh jgrk gS] ikap lkS #Ik, 
ds vfrfjDr  tqekZus dk nk;h gksxk** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #i, vkSj vf/kd ls vf/kd ikap 
gtkj #i, gksxk] vkSj ;fn ,slh nks’kflf) ds Ik'pkr~ og ,sls fuekZ.k dk ,sls iz;kstu ds fy, mi;ksx 
djrk gS] rks ,sls izR;sd fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku mi;ksx tkjh jgrk gS] ikap lkS #Ik, ds vfrfjDr  
tqekZus dk nk;h gksxk** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 



 47- /kkjk 211 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 211 dh mi&/kkjk ¼5½ esa] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, 
rd dk gks ldrk gS] nk;h gksxk vkSj tc vuuqikyu tkjh jgrk gS] rks ,sls izR;sd fnu ds fy,] 
ftlds nkSjku vuuqikyu tkjh jgrk gS] vfrfjDr tqekZus dk tks ik¡p gtkj #Ik, rd dk gks ldsxk] 
nk;h gksxk** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, ls vU;wu vkSj tks ikap gtkj #Ik, rd gks 
ldsxk vkSj tc vuuqikyu tkjh jgrk gS] rks ,sls izR;sd fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku vuuqikyu tkjh 
jgrk gS] vfrfjDr tqekZus dk tks ik¡p lkS #Ik, rd dk gks ldsxk] n.Muh; gksxk** “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks 
tk,axsA 
 
 48- /kkjk 216 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 216 dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa] ^^ikap gtkj #Ik, 
gksxk vkSj tc Hkax pkyw jgus okyk gks rks ,sls vfrfjDr tqekZUks ls n.Muh; gksxk] tks izFke Hkax ds 
Ik'pkr~ ,sls fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku pkyw jgrk gS] ,d lkS :i,** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks 
gtkj #Ik, ls vU;wu vkSj tks ikap gtkj #Ik, rd gks ldsxk vkSj tc Hkax pkyw jgus okyk gks rks ,sls 
vfrfjDr tqekZUks ls n.Muh; gksxk] tks izFke Hkax ds Ik'pkr~ ,sls fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku pkyw jgrk 
gS] ikap lkS #i, gksxk** “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 49- /kkjk 221 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 221 dh mi&/kkjk ¼3½ ds [k.M ¼i½ esa] 
^^ikap gtkj #Ik, rd gks ldsxk** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nl gtkj #Ik, ls de ugha gksxk vkSj tks chl 
gtkj #Ik, rd gks ldsxk** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
  50- /kkjk 227 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 227 esa] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls 
vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vfèkd ikap gtkj #Ik,** “kCn 
j[ks tk,axsA 
 
  51- /kkjk 240 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 240 esa] ^^ikap lkS #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls 
vf/kd nks gtkj #Ik,** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #Ik, vkSj vf/kd ls vfèkd ikap gtkj #Ik,** “kCn 
j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 52- /kkjk 255 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 255 esa]& 
 
  ¼d½ mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr  j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 
   ^^¼1½ uxjikfydkvksa ds [kkrksa dh ys[kkijh{kk fgekpy izns'k ds iz/kku egkys[kkdkj 

¼ys[kk ijh{kk½ vkSj jkT; ys[kkijh{kk foHkkx ds funs'kd }kjk dh tk,xh] ftuds ikl 
uxjikfydk dh lqlaxr lwpuk vkSj vfHkys[kksa rd igqap gksxhA 

 
  ¼[k½  mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ds i'pkr~ fuEufyf[kr vUr%LFkkfir fd;k tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 
 

   ^^¼1d½ uxjikfydk ds okf’kZd [kkrs jkT; ys[kk ijh{kk foHkkx fgekpy izns'k ds ys[kk 
ijh{kdksa }kjk izekf.kr fd, tk,axs% 

 
  ijUrq uxjikfydk ds [kkrs dh ys[kk ijh{kk izns'k ds iz/kku egkys[kkdkj ¼ys[kk ijh{kk½ ds 

lexz rduhdh ekxZn'kZu vkSj Ik;Zos{k.k ds v/khu lapkfyr dh tk,xhA**( vkSj 
 
  ¼x½  mi&/kkjk ¼3½ ds LFkku ij fuEufyf[kr j[kk tk,xk] vFkkZr~%& 



  
   ^^¼3½ iz/kku egkys[kkdkj ¼ys[kk ijh{kk½] fgekpy izns'k dh okf’kZd rduhdh fujh{k.k 

fjiksZV ds lkFk&LkkFk jkT; ys[kk ijh{kk foHkkx dh okf’kZd fjiksVZ dks jkT; fo/kkueaMy 
ds le{k j[kk tk,xkA**A 

 
  53- /kkjk 271 dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 271 dh mi&/kkjk ¼5½ dss Ik'pkr~  
fuEufyf[kr mi&/kkjk,a j[kh tk,axh] vFkkZRk~%& 
 
 ^^¼6½  bl vf/kfu;e esa fdlh ckr ds gksrs gq, Hkh] tc bl dkj.k ls fd uxj ifj’kn ds lEiw.kZ 

uxj {ks= dks uxj fuxe ds :Ik esa ?kksf’kr fd;k x;k gS ;k fo|eku uxj fuxe esa 'kkfey 
fd;k x;k gS] rks jkT; ljdkj jkti= ¼bZ&xtV½ esa izdkf'kr vkns'k }kjk vkns'k esa 
fofufnZ’V rkjh[k ls uxj ifj’kn dks Hkax dj nsxhA 

 
 ¼7½  mi&/kkjk ¼6½ ds v/khu Hkax dh xbZ uxj ifj’kn ds lnL; ljdkj ds vkns'k esa fofufnZ’V 

rkjh[k ls vius in fjDr dj nsaxsA** 
 
 54- /kkjk 304&d dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 304&d esa] ^^dkjkokl ls] ftldh 
vofèk rhu o’kZ rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij **dkjkokl ls] ftldh 
vof/k ,d o’kZ rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] tks chl gtkj #Ik, rd gks ldsxk] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCn 
j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 55- /kkjk 304&[k dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 304&[k dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] 
^^dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k nks o’kZ rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij  
**dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k ,d o’kZ rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] tks chl gtkj #Ik, rd gks 
ldsxk] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 56- /kkjk 304&x dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 304&x dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa] 
^^dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k Ng ekl rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] tks nks gtkj #Ik, rd gks 
ldsxk] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds LFkku ij **dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k ,d o’kZ rd dh gks 
ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] tks chl gtkj #Ik, rd gks ldsxk] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 57- /kkjk 304&?k dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 304&?k dh mi&/kkjk ¼4½ esa] 
^^dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k Ng ekl rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] tks nks gtkj #Ik, rd gks 
ldsxk] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds LFkku ij **dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k ,d o’kZ rd dh gks 
ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] tks chl gtkj #Ik, rd gks ldsxk] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 58- /kkjk 304&³ dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 304&³ dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] 
^^dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k rhu ekl rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa 
ds LFkku ij  **dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k ,d o’kZ rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] tks chl gtkj 
#Ik, rd gks ldsxk] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 59- /kkjk 304&p dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 304&p dh mi&/kkjk ¼3½ esa] 
^^dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k N% ekl dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds 



LFkku ij **dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k ,d o’kZ rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] tks chl gtkj #Ik, 
rd gks ldsxk] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 60- /kkjk 304&N dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 304&N dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] ^^tks 
<kbZ lkS #Ik, rd dk gks ldsxk] n.Muh; gksxk** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij  **tks nl gtkj #Ik, vkSj izR;sd 
,sls fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku vijk/k tkjh jgrk gS] ,d gtkj #Ik, rd ds vfrfjDr tqekZus ls 
n.Muh; gksxk** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 61- /kkjk 304&t dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 304&t dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] 
^^dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k rhu ekl dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds 
LFkku ij **dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k ,d o’kZ rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] tks chl gtkj #Ik, 
rd gks ldsxk] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 62- /kkjk 304&> dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 304&> dh mi&/kkjk ¼3½ esa] 
^^dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k rhu ekl dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds 
LFkku ij **dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k ,d o’kZ rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] tks chl gtkj #Ik, 
rd gks ldsxk] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 63- /kkjk 304&V dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 304&V esa] ^^dkjkokl ls] ftldh 
vofèk rhu ekl dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls]** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds LFkku ij  **dkjkokl ls] ftldh 
vof/k ,d o’kZ rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] tks chl gtkj #Ik, rd gks ldsxk] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCn 
vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 
 

 64- /kkjk 304&B dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 304&B dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa] ^^tks ik¡p 
lkS #Ik, rd dk gks ldsxk] n.Muh; gksxk** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^tks nl gtkj #Ik, vkSj izR;sd ,sls 
fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku vijk/k tkjh jgrk gS] ,d gtkj #Ik, rd ds vfrfjDr tqekZus ls n.Muh; 
gksxk** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 

 65- /kkjk 304&M dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 304&M esa] ^^dkjkokl ls] ftldh 
vofèk rhu o’kZ dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds LFkku ij  **dkjkokl ls] 
ftldh vof/k ,d o’kZ rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] tks chl gtkj #Ik, rd gks ldsxk] ;k nksuksa 
ls** “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 
 

 66- /kkjk 304&< dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 304&< dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] 
^^dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k nks o’kZ rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds 
LFkku ij **dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k ,d o’kZ rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] tks chl gtkj #Ik, 
rd gks ldsxk] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 67- /kkjk 304&.k dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 304&.k dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa] 
^^dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k ,d o’kZ rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] tks ikap lkS #i, rd gks ldsxk] 
;k nksuksa ls** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds LFkku ij  **dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k ,d o’kZ rd dh gks ldsxh] 
;k tqekZus ls] tks chl gtkj #Ik, rd gks ldsxk] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 68- /kkjk 304&Fk dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 304&Fk dh mi&/kkjk ¼3½ esa ^^tks ik¡p 
lkS #Ik, rd dk gks ldsxk] n.Muh; gksxk** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^tks nl gtkj #Ik, vkSj izR;sd ,sls 



fnu ds fy,] ftlds nkSjku vijk/k tkjh jgrk gS] ,d gtkj #Ik, rd ds vfrfjDr tqekZus ls n.Muh; 
gksxk** “kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 
 69- /kkjk 304&n dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 304&n esa]& 
 
  ¼i½  lhekar ¼ik'oZ½ “kh’kZd esa] ^^ernku ds fnu** “kCnksa ds i'pkr~  ^^vkSj x.kuk fnol** 

'kCn var%LFkkfir fd, tka,xsA 
 
  ¼ii½  mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa] ^^ernku dh lekfIr** “kCnksa ds Ik'pkr~ ^^vkSj x.kuk fnol ij** 'kCn 

var%LFkkfir fd, tka,xsA 
 
  ¼iii½ mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] ^^dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k Ng ekl dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] 

tks nks gtkj #Ik, rd gks ldsxk] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds LFkku ij 
^^dkjkokl ls] ftldh vofèk ,d o’kZ rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] tks chl gtkj 
#Ik, rd gks ldsxk] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 

 
 70- /kkjk 304&/k dk la'kks/ku-&&Ekwy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 304&/k  dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa]& 
 
  ¼d½ [k.M ¼d½ esa ^^dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k nks o’kZ rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] ;k 

nksuksa ls** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds LFkku ij **dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k ,d o’kZ rd dh 
gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] tks chl gtkj #Ik, rd gks ldsxk] ;k nksuksa ls** “kCn vkSj 
fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 

 
  ¼[k½  [k.M ¼[k½ esa ^^dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k Ng ekl rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] 

;k nksuksa ls** “kCnksa vkSj fpUgksa ds LFkku ij  **dkjkokl ls] ftldh vof/k ,d o’kZ 
rd dh gks ldsxh] ;k tqekZus ls] tks chl gtkj #Ik, rd gks ldsxk] ;k nksuksa ls** 
“kCn vkSj fpUg j[ks tk,axsA 

  
  

&&&&&&&&& 
 

mís';ksa vkSj dkj.kksa dk dFku 
 

 fgekpy izns'k uxjikfydk vf/kfu;e] 1994 eas uxjikfydk iz'kklu dks lqn<̀+ djus] foÙkh; 
mÙkjnkf;Ro c<+kus vkSj blds micU/kksa dks ledkyhu iz'kklfud ,oa lkekftd&vkfFkZd vko';drkvksa 
ds vuq:Ik ykus ds fy, iqujh{k.k dh vko';drk gSA uxjikfydk [kkrksa ds fy, fo|eku ys[kkijh{kk 
lajpuk dks Li’V oS/kkfud leFkZu dh vko';drk gS] blfy, fo/ks;d fgekpy izns'k ds iz/kku 
egkys[kkdkj ¼ys[kkijh{kk½ ds rduhdh Ik;Zos{k.k ds v/khu ys[kkijh{kk dk micU/k djrk gSA ;g 
uxjikfydk foÙkh; izcU/ku esa vkSj vfèkd ikjnf'kZrk] ,d:irk vkSj fo'oluh;rk lqfuf'pr djus gsrq 
vk'kf;r gSA 
 
 ;g fo/ks;d mu uxjikfydkvksa ds lnL;kas ds dk;Zdky dks Hkh Li’V djrk gS ftuds {ks= ckn 
esa uxj fuxe esa 'kkfey gks tkrs gSa] ftlls fo|eku vLi’Vrk,a nwj gks tkrh gSaA ;g fjfä;ksa dh 
Lohd`fr vkSj vfuok;Z fjiksfVZax ds fy, ,d le;c) izfØ;k 'kq: djds lnL;ksa ds bLrhQs dh izfØ;k 



dks Hkh lqO;ofLFkr djrk gSA uxjikfydk jktLo dks etcwr djus ds fy,] la'kks/ku esa ;g micU/k yk;k 
tkuk gS fd voSrfud mi;ksDrk “kqYd dks laifÙk dj ds cdk;k ds :Ik esa ekuk tk,xkA 
 
  bl vf/kfu;e ds v/khu dbZ tqekZus vkSj naM yacs le; ls vifjofrZr jgs gSa vkSj vc izHkkoh 
fuokjd ds :Ik esa dk;Z ugha djrs gSaA ;g fo/ks;d bu naMksa dks rdZlaxr vkSj la'kksf/kr djds mUgsa 
;FkkFkZoknh vkSj izorZuh; cukrk gS] ftlls Hkou] LoPNrk] tu lqj{kk] ykblasflax vkSj pquko laca/kh 
vkpj.k ls lacaf/kr uxjikfydk dkuwuksa ds vuqikyu esa lq/kkj gksxkA bu la'kks/kuksa dk lkeqfgd mís'; 
vf/kfu;e dk vkèkqfudhdj.k] foÙkh; vuq'kklu dks c<+kok nsuk vkSj jkT; esa 'kgjh LFkkuh; fudk;ksa ds 
dq'ky lapkyu dks lqn<̀+ cukuk gSA 
 
      ;g fo/k;sd mijksä mís';ksa dh  iwfrZ ds fy, gSA 

 
¼foØekfnR; flag½ 

izHkkjh ea=hA 
/keZ'kkyk% 
Rkkjh[k% 
 

&&&&&&&&& 
 

 
foŸkh; Kkiu 

 
&'kwU;& 

 
&&&&&&& 

 
 

izR;k;ksftr fo/kku lEcU/kh Kkiu 
 

&'kwU;& 
 

&&&&&& 
 

fgekpy izns'k uxjikfydk ¼f}rh; la'kks/ku½ fo/k;sd] 2025 
 

¼fo/kku lHkk esa iqj%LFkkfir :Ik esa½ 

 fgekpy izns'k uxjikfydk vf/kfu;e] 1994 ¼1994 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 13½ dk vkSj la'kksèku 
djus ds fy, fo/ks;dA 
 
 

¼foØekfnR; flag½ 
           izHkkjh ea=hA 

 



&&&&&&&&&& 
 Lkfpo ¼fof/k½A 
 
 
/keZ'kkyk% 
rkjh[k%-------------------------------2025 
 

____________ 
 
 

AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT 
 

Bill No. 23 of 2025. 
 

THE  HIMACHAL  PRADESH  MUNICIPAL  (2nd  AMENDMENT)  BILL,  2025 
 

ARRANGMENT OF CLAUSES 
 

Clauses: 
 
 1. Short title. 
 2. Amendment of section 2. 
 3. Amendment of section 14. 
 4. Amendment of section 24. 
 5. Amendment of section 66. 
 6. Amendment of section 82. 
 7. Amendment of section 83. 
 8. Amendment of section 111. 
 9. Amendment of section 113. 
 10. Amendment of section 114. 
 11. Amendment of section 115. 
 12. Amendment of section 124. 
 13. Amendment of section 125. 
 14. Amendment of section 126. 
 15. Amendment of section 127. 
 16. Amendment of section 128. 
 17. Amendment of section 129. 
 18. Amendment of section 133. 
 19. Amendment of section 134. 
 20. Amendment of section 135 
 21. Amendment of section 140. 
 22. Amendment of section 141. 
 23. Amendment of section 143. 
 24. Amendment of section 148. 
 25. Amendment of section 149. 
 26. Amendment of section 150. 



 27. Amendment of section 150-A. 
 28. Amendment of section 152. 
 29. Amendment of section 159. 
 30. Amendment of section 162. 
 31. Amendment of section 166. 
 32. Amendment of section 172. 
 33. Amendment of section 173. 
 34. Amendment of section 175. 
 35. Amendment of section 180. 
 36. Amendment of section 183. 
 37. Amendment of section 184. 
 38. Amendment of section 191. 
 39. Amendment of section 192. 
 40. Amendment of section 193. 
 41. Amendment of section 196. 
 42. Amendment of section 197. 
 43. Amendment of section 198. 
 44. Amendment of section 199. 
 45. Amendment of section 200. 
 46. Amendment of section 207. 
 47. Amendment of section 211. 
 48. Amendment of section 216. 
 49. Amendment of section 221. 
 50. Amendment of section 227. 
 51. Amendment of section 240. 
 52. Amendment of section 255. 
 53. Amendment of section 271. 
 54. Amendment of section 304-A. 
 55. Amendment of section 304-B. 
 56. Amendment of section 304-C. 
 57. Amendment of section 304-D. 
 58. Amendment of section 304-E. 
 59. Amendment of section 304-F. 
 60. Amendment of section 304-G. 
 61. Amendment of section 304-H. 
 62. Amendment of section 304-I. 
 63. Amendment of section 304-K. 
 64. Amendment of section 304-L. 
 65. Amendment of section 304-M. 
 66. Amendment of section 304-N. 
 67. Amendment of section 304-O. 
 68. Amendment of section 304-Q. 
 69. Amendment of section 304-R. 
 70. Amendment of section 304-S. 
 

____________ 



 
 

Bill No. 23 of 2025. 
 

  THE  HIMACHAL  PRADESH  MUNICIPAL    
(2nd AMENDMENT)  BILL,  2025 

 
(AS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY) 

 
A 
 

 BILL 
 

 further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Municipal  Act, 1994 (Act No.13 of 1994). 
 
           BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in  Seventy-sixth  Year of 
the Republic of India as follows:— 
 
 1. Short title.—This Act may be called the Himachal Pradesh Municipal  
(2nd Amendment) Act, 2025. 
 
 2. Amendment of section 2.—In section 2 of Himachal Pradesh Municipal Act, 1994 
(hereinafter referred to as the “principal Act’’), before clause 2, the following clause shall be 
inserted, namely:— 
 
  “(1)  “Audit Agency” means Principal Accountant General Audit, Himachal 

Pradesh, under whose technical guidance and supervision the audit of the 
accounts of Municipalities shall be conducted, by Director, the Himachal 
Pradesh State Audit Department who shall have the access to relevant 
information and record of municipalities for conducting audit of accounts of 
Municipalities;”. 

 
 3. Amendment of section 14.—In section 14 of the principal Act, after sub-section (3), 
following shall be inserted, namely:- 
 
  “(4) When a part of the area of any Municipal Council, during its term, is declared to 

be a Municipal Corporation under sub-section (2) of section 3 of the Himachal 
Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1994 (12 of 1994), the said declaration shall not 
affect the term of the members of Municipal Council, till the expiration of the 
duration of the Municipal Council(s) specified in sub-section (1) or its dissolution 
under section 271 of this Act.”. 

 
 4. Amendment of section 24.—In section 24 of the principal Act, after sub-section (3),  
following  shall be inserted, namely:— 
 
   “Provided that the President or Vice-President or the Deputy Commissioner, as the 

case may be, shall accept the resignation within 15 days from the date of tendering 



the resignation, unless withdrawn. Immediately after acceptance of resignation, the 
Deputy Commissioner shall cause to intimate the vacancy to the Director and to the 
Government.”. 

 
 5. Amendment of section 66.—In section 66 of the principal Act,  for the sign “.”, the 
sign “:” shall be substituted and thereafter the following  shall be inserted, namely:—  
 
   “Provided that if the user charges during the previous year is not realised, the same 

alongwith fine thereof shall be added as arrear of Property Tax.”. 
 
 6. Amendment of section 82.—In section 82 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),  
for the words “five hundred  rupees and more than two thousand rupees”,  the words, “two 
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 
 
 7. Amendment of section 83.—In section 83 of the principal Act, in sub-section (5), 
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees and in the case of a 
continuing breach with a further fine of fifty rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and more 
than five thousand rupees and in the case of a continuing breach with a further fine of five 
hundred rupees” shall be substituted. 
 
 8. Amendment of section 111.—In section 111 of the principal Act, in sub-section (4), 
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”,  the words, “two 
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 
 
 9. Amendment of section 113.—In section 113 of the principal Act, after clause (b), 
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”,  the words “two 
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  
 
 10. Amendment of section 114.—In section 114 of the principal Act, for the words  
“two hundred”, the words “one thousand” shall be substituted. 
 
 11. Amendment of section 115.—In section 115 of the principal Act, for the words  
“two hundred”, the words “one thousand” shall be substituted. 
 
 12. Amendment of section 124.—In section 124 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), 
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees and with a further fine of 
fifty rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees and with a 
further fine of five hundred rupees” shall be  substituted. 
 
 13. Amendment of section 125.—In section 125 of the principal Act, in sub-section (4), 
for the words “one thousand rupees and more than four thousand rupees and with a further fine 
of rupees one hundred”,  the words  “ two thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees  
and with a further fine of  five hundred rupees” shall be substituted. 
 
 14. Amendment of section 126.—In section 126 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3), 
for the words “two thousand five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees and when 



the breach is a continuing one, with a further fine of two hundred rupees,”   the words  “two 
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees and when the breach is a continuing one, 
with a further fine of five hundred rupees” shall be substituted. 
  
 15. Amendment of section 127.—In section 127 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), 
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees and in case of a 
continuing offence to a further penalty of one hundred rupees”,  the words “two thousand rupees 
and more than five thousand rupees and in case of continuing offence to a further penalty of five 
hundred rupees” shall be substituted. 
 
 16. Amendment of section 128.—In section 128 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), 
for the words “one thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees and with a further fine of 
two hundred rupees”,  the words  “two thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees and 
with a further fine of five hundred rupees” shall be substituted. 
 
 17. Amendment of section 129.—In section 129 of the principal Act,  in sub-section 
(3), for the words and sign “ five hundred rupees,  and more than two thousand rupees and with a 
further fine of fifty rupees”,  the words “two thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees 
and with a further fine of  five hundred rupees” shall be substituted. 
 
 18. Amendment of section 133.—In section 133 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), 
for the words  and signs “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees and, when a 
notice has been issued, with a further fine of fifty rupees”, the words and signs “two thousand 
rupees and more than five thousand rupees and when a notice has been issued, with a further fine 
of five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.  
 
 19. Amendment of section 134.—In section 134 of the principal Act, for the words 
“two thousand five hundred rupees and not more than ten thousand rupees”, the words “two 
thousand rupees and not more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  
 
 20. Amendment of section 135.—In section 135 of the principal Act, for the words       
“ five  hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and 
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  
 
 21. Amendment of section 140.—In section 140 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), 
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two 
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  
 
 22. Amendment of section 141.—In section 141 of the principal Act, in sub-section  
(2), for the words “two thousand rupees but shall not be less than five hundred rupees”, the 
words “five thousand rupees but shall not be less than two thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 
 
 23. Amendment of section 143.—In section 143 of the principal Act, in clause (c), for 
the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”,  the words “two thousand 
rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 
 



 24. Amendment of section 148.—In section 148 of the principal Act, in clause (c), for 
the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand 
rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  
 
 25. Amendment of section 149.—In section 149 of the principal act,— 
 
  (a) in sub-section (1), for the words “five hundred and of one thousand rupees”, the 

words “two thousand rupees and of five thousand rupees” shall be substituted; 
and 

 
  (b) in sub-section (3), for the words  “may extend to one thousand rupees”, the 

words “shall not be less than two thousand rupees and more than five thousand 
rupees” shall be substituted.  

 
 26. Amendment of section 150.—In section 150 of the principal Act, for the words 
“one thousand rupees”,  the words “two thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 
 
 27. Amendment of section 150-A.—In section 150-A of the principal Act, in sub-
section (4), for the words “five hundred rupees for the first offence and seven hundred rupees”, 
the words “two thousand rupees for the first offence and five thousand rupees” shall be 
substituted.  
  
 28. Amendment of section 152.—In section 152 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), 
for the words “fine which may extend to five thousand rupees”, the words “fine not less than two 
thousand rupees which may extend to five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  
 
 29. Amendment of section 159.—In section 159 of the principal Act, for the words 
“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and 
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  
 
 30. Amendment of section 162.—In section 162 of the principal Act, for the words 
“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”,  the words “two thousand rupees and 
more than five thousand rupees” shall  be substituted. 
 
 31. Amendment of section 166.—In section 166 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3), 
for the words  “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two 
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 
 
 32. Amendment of section 172.—In section 172 of the principal Act, in sub-section (4), 
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two 
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 
  
 33. Amendment of section 173.—In section 173 of the principal Act, in sub-section (4), 
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words two thousand 
rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  
 



 34. Amendment of section 175.—In section 175 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3), 
for the words and sign “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees and when the 
contravention of non-compliance is a continuing one, with a further fine of fifty rupees”, the 
words and sign “two thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees and when the 
contravention of non-compliance is a continuing one, with a further fine of five hundred rupees” 
shall be substituted. 
 
 35. Amendment of section 180.—In section 180 of the principal Act, for the words 
“one hundred rupees and more than four thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and 
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  
 
 36. Amendment of section 183.—In section 183 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), 
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two 
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 
 
 37. Amendment of section 184.—In section 184 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), 
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the  words “two 
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 
 
 38. Amendment of section 191.—In section 191 of the principal Act, for the words 
“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and 
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  
  
 39. Amendment of section 192.—In section 192 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), 
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words  “two 
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 
 
 40. Amendment of section 193.—In section 193 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), 
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two 
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 
 
 41. Amendment of section 196.—In section 196 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), 
for the words “five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”,  the words “two 
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 
 
 42. Amendment of section 197.—In section 197 of the principal Act, for the words 
“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, wherever occurs, the words “two 
thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted respectively. 
 
 43. Amendment of section 198.—In section 198 of the principal Act, for the words 
“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and 
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  
  
 44. Amendment of section 199.—In section 199 of the principal Act, for the words 
“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the  words “two thousand rupees and 
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  
 



 45. Amendment of section 200.—In section 200 of the principal Act, for the words 
“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and 
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  
 
 46. Amendment of section 207.—In section 207 of the principal Act, for the words and 
sign “one thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees and if after such conviction, he 
continues to use such building for such purpose shall be liable to a further fine of five hundred 
rupees”, the words and sign “two thousand rupees and more than five thousand rupees and if 
after such conviction, he continues to use such building for such purpose shall be liable to a 
further fine of five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.  
 
 47. Amendment of section 211.—In section 211 of the principal Act, in sub-section (5), 
for the words and signs “may extend to five thousand rupees and when the non-compliance is a 
continuing one, with a further fine, which may extend to five hundred rupees” , the words and 
signs “shall not be less than two  thousand rupees which may extend to five thousand and when 
the non-compliance is a continuing one, with a further fine, which may extend to five hundred 
rupees” shall be substituted. 
 
 48. Amendment of section 216.—In section 216 of the principal Act, for the words and 
sign “shall extend to five thousand rupees and when the breach is a continuing breach, with a 
further fine of one hundred rupees”,  the words and sign “shall not be less than two thousand 
rupees which may extend to five thousand rupees and when the breach is a continuing breach, 
with a further fine of five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.  
 
 49. Amendment of section 221.—In section 221 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3), 
in clause (i), for the words “may extend to five thousand rupees”, the  words “shall not be less 
than ten thousand rupees and  which may extend to twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  
 
 50. Amendment of section 227.—In section 227 of the principal Act, for the words 
“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and 
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 
 
 51. Amendment of section 240.—In section 240 of the principal Act, for the words 
“five hundred rupees and more than two thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees and 
more than five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.  
 
 52. Amendment of section 255.—In section 255 of  the principal Act,- 
 
  (a) for sub-section (1), the following shall be substituted, namely:— 
 
   “(1)  The accounts of municipality shall be audited by the Principal 

Accountant General (Audit), Himachal Pradesh and the Director of 
State Audit Department who shall have access to relevant information 
and records of the municipality.”; 

 
  (b) after sub-section (1) the following shall be inserted, namely:— 



 
   “(1A)  The annual account of  municipality will be certified by the auditors of 

the State Audit Department, Himachal Pradesh:  
 
    Provided that the audit of the accounts of municipality shall be 

conducted under the overall technical guidance and supervision of the 
Principal Accountant General (Audit),  Himachal Pradesh.”; and  

 
  (c) for sub-section (3), the following shall be substituted, namely:— 
 
   “(3)The annual technical inspection report of the Principal Accountant General 

(Audit), Himachal Pradesh as well as the annual report of the State Audit 
Department shall be placed before the State Legislature.”. 

 
 53. Amendment of section 271.—In section 271 of the principal Act, after sub-section 
(5), the following  shall be inserted, namely:- 
 
  “(6)  Notwithstanding anything contained in this section, when on account of the 

reason that the whole of the municipal area of the Municipal Council is 
declared as a Municipal Corporation or its inclusion in the existing Municipal 
Corporation, the State Government shall, by an order published in the Rajpatra 
(e-Gazette), dissolve the Municipal Council from a date specified in the order.  

 
  (7)  The Members of the Municipal Council(s) which has been dissolved under sub-

section (6) shall vacate their offices from the date specified in the order of the 
Government.”. 

 
 54. Amendment of section 304-A.—In section 304-A of the principal Act, for the 
words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to three years, or with fine, or with 
both”, the words and signs  “imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or with fine 
upto twenty thousand rupees, or with both” shall be substituted. 
 
 55. Amendment of section 304-B.—In section 304-B of the principal Act, in sub-
section (2),  for the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to two years, or 
with fine, or with both”,  the words  and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to 
one year, or with fine upto twenty thousand rupees, or with both” shall be substituted. 
 
 56. Amendment of section 304-C.—In section 304-C of the principal Act, in sub-
section (1), for the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to six months, 
or with fine which may extend to two thousand rupees, or with both”, the words and signs 
“imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or with fine upto twenty thousand 
rupees, or with both” shall be substituted. 
 
 57. Amendment of section 304-D.—In section 304-D of the principal Act, in sub-
section (4), for the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to six months, 
or with fine which may extend to two thousand rupees, or with both”,  the words and sign 



“imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or with fine upto twenty thousand 
rupees or with both” shall be substituted. 
 
 58. Amendment of section 304-E.—In section 304-E of the principal Act, in sub-
section (2), for the words and sign “imprisonment for a term which may extend to three months, 
or with fine or with both”, the words and sign “imprisonment for a term which may extend to 
one year, or with fine upto twenty thousand rupees or with both” shall be substituted.  
 
 59. Amendment of section 304-F.—In section 304-F of the principal Act, in sub-
section (3), for the words and signs “imprisonment which may extend to six months, or with fine, 
or with both”,  the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or 
with fine upto twenty thousand rupees, or with both” shall be substituted.  
 
 60. Amendment of section 304-G.—In section 304-G of the principal Act, in sub-
section (2),  for the words  “two hundred and fifty rupees”, the  words “ten thousand rupees and 
with further fine which may extend to one thousand rupees for every day during which the 
offence continues” shall be substituted.  
 
 61. Amendment of section 304-H.—In section 304-H of the principal Act, in sub-
section (2), for the words and signs “imprisonment which may extend to three months, or with 
fine, or with both”  the words and sign “imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, 
or with fine upto twenty thousand rupees or with both” shall be substituted.  
 
 62. Amendment of section 304-I.—In section 304-I of the principal Act, in sub-section 
(3), for the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to three months, or with 
fine, or with both”, the words and sign “imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, 
or with fine upto twenty thousand rupees or with both” shall be substituted.  
 
 63. Amendment of section 304-K.—In section 304-K of the principal Act, for the 
words and sign “imprisonment which may extend to three months, or with fine”, the words and 
sign “imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or with fine upto twenty thousand 
rupees or with both” shall be substituted. 
 
 64. Amendment of section 304-L.—In section 304-L of the principal Act, in sub-
section (1), for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees with further 
fine which may extend to one thousand rupees for every day during which the offence continues” 
shall be substituted.  
 
 65. Amendment of section 304-M.—In section 304-M of the principal Act, for the 
words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to three months, or with fine, or 
with both”, the words and sign “imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or with 
fine upto twenty thousand rupees or with both” shall be substituted.  
 
 66. Amendment of section 304-N.—In section 304-N of the principal Act, in sub-
section (2), for the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to two years, or 



with fine, or with both”,  the words and sign “imprisonment for a term which may extend to one 
year, or with fine upto twenty thousand rupees or with both” shall be substituted.  
 
 67. Amendment of section 304-O.—In section 304-O of the principal Act, in sub-
section (1),  for the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or 
with fine which may extend to five hundred rupees, or with both”, the words and sign 
“imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or with fine upto twenty thousand 
rupees or with both” shall be substituted. 
 
 68. Amendment of section 304-Q.—In section 304-Q of the principal Act, in sub-
section (3),  for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees fine with 
further fine which may extend to one thousand rupees for every day during which the offence 
continues” shall be substituted.  
 
 69. Amendment of section 304-R.—In section 304-R of the principal Act, - 
 
  (i) in the marginal heading, after the words “on Polling day”, the words “and 

counting day” shall be inserted; 
 
  (ii) in sub-section (1),  after the words “conclusion of the poll”, the words “and on 

the day of counting” shall be inserted; 
 
  (iii) in sub-section (2), for the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may 

extend to six months, or with fine which may extend to two thousand rupees, or 
with both”,  the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may extend to 
one year, or with fine upto twenty thousand rupees, or with both” shall be 
substituted. 

 
 70. Amendment of section 304-S.—In section 304-S of the principal Act, in sub-
section (2),— 
 
  (a) in clause (a), for the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may 

extend to two years, or with fine, or with both” the words and signs 
“imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or with fine upto 
twenty thousand rupees, or with both”, shall be substituted. 

 
  (b)  in clause (b), for the words and signs “imprisonment for a term which may 

extend to six months, or with fine, or with both”, the words and signs 
“imprisonment for a term which may extend to one year, or with fine upto 
twenty thousand rupees, or with both” shall be substituted. 

 
____________ 

 
 

STATEMENT  OF  OBJECTS  AND  REASONS 
 



 The Himachal Pradesh Municipal Act, 1994 requires revision to strengthen municipal 
governance, enhance financial accountability, and align its provisions with contemporary 
administrative and socio-economic needs. The existing audit structure for municipal accounts 
needs clearer statutory backing, therefore, the Bill provides for audit under the technical 
supervision of the Principal Accountant General (Audit), Himachal Pradesh. This is intended to 
ensure greater transparency, uniformity, and credibility in municipal financial management. 
 
 The Bill also clarifies the tenure of members of a municipality whose areas are 
subsequently included within a Municipal Corporation, thereby removing existing ambiguities. It 
also streamlines the process of resignation of members by introducing a time-bound procedure 
for acceptance and mandatory reporting of vacancies. To strengthen municipal revenues, the 
amendment provides that unpaid user charges shall be treated as arrears of Property Tax. 
 
 A large number of fines and penalties under the Act have remained unchanged for a long 
period and no longer function as an effective deterrent. The Bill rationalises and revises these 
penalties to make them realistic and enforceable, thereby improving compliance with municipal 
laws relating to buildings, sanitation, public safety, licensing, and election-related conduct. These 
amendments collectively aim to modernise the Act, promote fiscal discipline, and strengthen the 
efficient functioning of Urban Local Bodies in the State. 
 
 This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid adjectives. 
 
 

(VIKRAMADITYA  SINGH) 
Minister-in-charge. 

DHARAMSHALA 
THE………………2025 

__________ 
 

 
FINANCIAL  MEMORANDUM 

 
 

-Nil- 
 

____________  
 
 

MEMORANDUM  REGARDING  DELEGATED  LEGISLATION 
 
 

-Nil- 
 

_____________ 
 

THE  HIMACHAL  PRADESH  MUNICIPAL  (2nd AMENDMENT)  BILL,  2025 
 

A 



 
BILL 

 
 further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Municipal Act, 1994 (Act No. 13 of 1994). 
 
 
 

(VIKRAMADITYA SINGH) 
Minister-in-charge. 

 
 

____________ 
 
 
Secretary (Law). 
 
 
DHARAMSHALA 
THE……….....…., 2025 
 

____________ 
 


