fafer favmT

RMer—2, 7 JeITs, 2020

T TAOTAOIMRO—S10(6)—8 / 2020—aoT.— AT U & oAU, MR & HfAe &
IgEE 213 (1) & T Ua UAMKAD BT YA HRd gU (a7l 06—07—2020 I IFAICT
ienfire faare (BHrae Ucer HeeH) SIeATesl, 2020 (2020 P AR AETIdH 4) HI AR &
ST 348 (3) @ A IFD IS WG Urs Aled FAS UG S—IToI= H UBIRT &
g |

3T T,
gere afera (fafd) |

2020 BT AT TSI JLATY ATTH 4
Menfire faare (RAmel yQer He) sreureel, 2020
YR IR & SHheEcRd dy § fBHre USe & oduld g§RT IR |

fEATIS UesT I BT I AN e fdare orfefaH, 1947 (1947 &1 SIf¥RM Wi
14) T HLET IR S foQ Feara |

Hifh fearad U faum 99 9= § 81 2 3R fRarad USy & ISuuTd BT FHEE 8l

T 7 b U aRRefol e € M SR S9e foy Rea SRaTs. &Rl Tawad 8l 17
g;

3 3T U & SIUT, YRA & GO & IeeE 213 & WS (1) §RT Y&
TN BT TANT PR gY, [IATIRET sfearaer Uanfud &_d g—

1. W IM——s9 I’y & dfera AW shenfie faare (Remma ucwr Heies)
ST, 2020 T |

2. RT 22 H HeEA— ZAMES U< AT B JAT N e fdare srafraH, 1947
(1 s g9 ueanq "o STRfFIA” H8l 137 B) &I &RT 22 & SUERT (1) IR SUIRT (2) #
"Ae SYART WaT” TRl @ GTEr (IR IR—AId IUIRT [T’ Ieq T RAfUT fhy STeT |

3. ORI 25 9 &1 AL~ Hol AIHA & gRT 25 & @oe (W) H el ' =g A"
% WM W 96 T ot W@ S |

4. RT 25 T P FeEA — oI AT D gRT 25 T B IR (1) H weai "UHh Al
% WIF R ST Al Ul R ST

B0 / —
(dsT )
TSUTe, feATael Ue |
B0/ —
(Teraa g anTe)
ger Afaa (fafd) |
Rre:



1398 I3, fEATae Uae, 09 Jells, 2020 /18 3ATUIS, 1942
AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT

HIMACHAL PRADESH ORDINANCE NO. 4 OF 2020

THE INDUSTRIAL DISPUTES (HIMACHAL PRADESH
AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2020

Promulgated by the Governor of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-first Year of the
Republic of India.

AN ORDINANCE, to amend the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (Act No. 14 of 1947) in
its application to the State of Himachal Pradesh.

WHEREAS, the Legidative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh is not in session and the
Governor of the State of Himacha Pradesh is satisfied that the circumstances exists which render it
necessary for him to take immediate action;

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of article 213 of
the Constitution of India, the Governor of Himachal Pradesh is pleased to promulgate the following
Ordinance:—

1. Short title—This Ordinance may be called the Industrial Disputes (Himachal Pradesh
Amendment) Ordinance, 2020.

2.  Amendment of Section 22.—In Section 22 of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, in its
application to the State of Himachal Pradesh (hereinafter referred to as the “principal Act”), in sub-
sections (1) and (2), after the words "public utility service", the words "and non-public utility
service" shall beinserted.

3. Amendment of Section 25F.—In Section 25 F of the principa Act, in clause (b), for
the words "fifteen days", the words “sixty days’ shall be substituted.

4.  Amendment of section 25K.—In Section 25 K of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),
for the words "one hundred", the words "two hundred" shall be substituted.

Sd/-
(BANDARU DATTATREYA),
Governor,
Himachal Pradesh
Sd/-
(YASHWANT SINGH CHOGAL),
Principal Secretary (Law).

Shimla:
Dated ........... 2020

[N

H el fqare (fBHrae UQqer |RIeH) JEIQel, 2020 & SUYd UG e bl dRd
% AU & AJUT 348 (3) B M WA (3—Toic), ZHEA Ue H USRI U S &
forg uTferepd e g |

T T,

o
RISgUTe], TedTdel U |




RIS, fRHATae Ueel, 09 Sells, 2020 /18 3MTWIG, 1942 1399

AR TIUTE A Sefie fdare (Rarerer geer Geilee) Serael, 2020 & Sugad 3ol

AT Bl AR D WA B IrJewe 348 (3) b IUE  RWUF (3—Tole), fRHMEA UQw H
yHIRIT fhy I & forw i o) fRar & |

Jerg=d Rig =anTa,
g e (fafe),
e ey WK |



